Purchasing Department

Bid #06-118, Mobile Computer Terminals for the Sheriff's Office

Opening Date: Thursday, January 1, 2007

PORTABLE COMPUTER

R.T.C. Inc. COP LOGIX SYSTEMS
EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED
DESCRIPTION QTY| ITEM# UNIT COST COST ITEM # UNIT COST COST ITEM # UNIT COST COST

Intel Core Duo 1.6GHz Processor 512MB RAM . Model # CF- Model # CF-
80 GB HDD 11 No Bid $ $ 30EWKGZM $ 4,999.00 | $ 54,989.00 30EWKGZM $ 3,797.00 | $ 41,767.00
DVD/CDRW for CF-30 11 No Bid $ $ CF-VDR301U| Included $ CF-VDR301U| $ 232.00 | $ 2,552.00

. 771-1057- . .
25ft Serial Cablel 11 fKN-4367A $ 51.00 ($ 561.00 No Bid $ $ No Bid $ $
I_DreC|S|on mount center mount, screen support 11 No Bid $ $ No Bid $ $ $ 1,199.00 | $ 13,189.00
light power, base plate and console
Vehicular Radio Modem 850, 35 Watt, 800 MHz | 11 F4454 $ 2,103.75 | $ 23,141.25 No Bid $ $ No Bid $ $
Two year extended warranty, total of three years.| 11 V699AJ | $ 278.00 | $ 3,058.00 V699AJ Included $ No Bid $ $
EggfeMoum Antenna, 3 db gain, Teflon Low LOSS! 1) | ppasggsp|s  41.65|$  458.15| NoBid | $ $ NoBid |$ $
TXMESSENGER Applications Software, W/ 128 . .
Bit Encryption/Compression Capable 11 | SCA0020 | $ 610.00 | $ 6,710.00 No Bid $ $ No Bid $ $
Power Surge Protector Fuse 11 M2p-24 | $ 148.75 | $ 1,636.25 No Bid $ $ CG-MP $ 74.00 | $ 814.00
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