
1 Vehicle/ Truck first aid kits, plastic or metal 22.90$        1 ea. 20.40$        10 cs 28.00$         each
2 Industrial first aid cabinet,4-shelf,filled cabinet 120.63$      1 ea. 76.93$        2 cs. 77.00$         each
3 Hydrogen Peroxide,16oz. Plastic bottle 4.42$          6 btl. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 Alcohol Isopropyl,70% ,16oz. Plastic bottle 6.86$          6 btl. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 Antiseptic Toweletts/skin wipes,100/box 93.50$        40/bxs 1.69$          100/bxs 56.05$         5000/cs
6 topical antiseptic swabsticks,50/box 84.90$        17/bxs 1.88$          10/bxs 42.85$         500/cs
7 Blood Clotting spray-on, 3oz. Can 5.62$          1 can 65.44$        12 cs. 26.40$         6ea/bx
8 Medicated spray-on bandage w/antiseptic, 3oz.can 6.07$          2 btl. 2.57$          each No Bid No Bid
9 First-aid antiseptic spray,4oz. Plastic pump bottle 23.80$        8 btl. 2.28$          each 24.75$         25/bx
10 Adhesive Tape(white) 2"x5yds 34.20$        12 rolls 8.11$          24/bxs 160.59$       48ea/cs
11 Elastic adhesive tape,3"x5yds 9.24$          2 rolls No Bid No Bid 160.59$       48ea/cs
12 Cotton tipped applicators/single tipped,3",100/box 16.06$        9/bxs 0.32$          100/bxs 23.15$         2000/cs
13 Ear plugs, tapered fit,corded,reg.size,100/box 21.05$        1 bx 61.13$        250/bxs No Bid No Bid

Ear plugs, tapered fit,corded, plus size,100/box 22.74$        1 bx 61.13$        250/bxs No Bid No Bid
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14 Polyethylene eye cups,4/oz. non-sterile,12/box 16.44$        4/bxs 0.09$          each 20.02$         6ea/pk
15 Eye wash (sterile isotonic solution) 4 fl.oz. bottle 1.91$          1 bx 1.43$          each 115.00$       48/cs

16 Eye Drop lubricant,.02oz. Dropper,30-32 doses/box 36.84$        4/bxs 38.72$        
1/2 oz./24 

cs 2.58$           each
17 Eye & skin irrigation solution,32oz. Plastic bottle 21.60$        6 btl. 1.62$          each No Bid No Bid
18 Eyewash safety station(single station)32oz. Bottle 34.98$        1 btl. 17.78$        each 19.78$         each
19 Fingertip Bandages,1-1/2"x2",100/bx 68.92$        6/bxs 3.28$          100/bx 71.50$         1200/cs

Fingertip Bandages, 2-1/2"x1-1/2",100/bx 68.92$        6/bxs 3.28$          100/bx 71.50$         1200/cs
20 Knuckle Dressing,1-1/2"x3",100/box 113.43$      15/bxs 3.33$          100/bx 3.30$           100ea/bx
21 Sheer Strips,3/4"x3",3/4"x1", 100/box 26.12$        10/bxs 1.74$          100/bx 22.00$         1200/cs
22 Plastic Bandages,3/4"x3",flexible,100/box 26.12$        10/bxs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Plastic Bandages,1"x3",flexible,100/box 26.12$        10/bxs No Bid No Bid 27.50$         1200/cs
23 Adhesive Patch, flexible fabric,2"x3",50 /box 72.00$        10/bxs 2.82$          50/bx No Bid No Bid

Adhesive Patch, flexible fabric,2"x3",100/box 78.30$        10/bxs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
24 Sheer Mini Bandages,3/8"x1/1/2",100/box 48.80$        14/bxs 1.23$          100/bx No Bid No Bid
25 Gauze Bandages,sterile,3"x4.1yds 5.26$          7 rolls No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Gauze Bandages,non-sterile,3"x4.1yds 4.88$          7 rolls 0.29$          each 23.21$         96/cs
26 Gauze Pads,sterile,2",3",4"sq.,200/box 6.09$          1 bx 2.41$          100/bx 38.05$         1200/cs

Gauze Pads,non-sterile,2",3",4"sq.,200/box 6.09$          1 bx 2.41$          100/bx 38.05$         1200/cs
27 Telfa ouchless non-adherent pads,2"x3",100/box 13.99$        2/bxs 6.61$          100/bx 91.85$         1200/cs
28 Aspirin,325mg,plastic bottle,100 tablets/bottle 0.70$          1 btl. 0.72$          100/btl 0.93$           100//btl
29 Alka-Seltzer, antacid & pain reliever,72(36/2's)tablets 54.07$        14/bxs 5.99$          72/btl No Bid No Bid
30 Tri-Buffered Aspirin,325mg,200(100/2's) tablets 5.88$          1 bx No Bid No Bid 2.29$           100/bx
31 Pain-Aid,325mg,250(125/2"s)box 90.30$        21/bxs No Bid No Bid 9.44$           100/btl
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32 Ibuprofen,200mg,industrial pk,250(125/2's)box 45.24$        11/bxs 2.24$          100/bx 8.84$           100/btl
33 Precomp (menstrual discomfort),100(50/2's)box 23.34$        7/bxs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
34 Dilotab sinus & cold,non-drowsy,325mg,250(125/2's)tablets 204.87$      13/bxs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
35 Non-Aspirin,325mg,100(50/2"s)tablets 12.90$        5/bxs 1.22$          100/btl 1.21$           100/btl
36 Extra-Strength non-aspirin,500mg,100(2/50's)tablets 25.38$        8/bxs 2.13$          100/btl 1.68$           100/btl
37 Trial antacid, heartburn & indigestion,100(50/2's)tablets 22.08$        8/bxs No Bid No Bid 1.99$           1/btl
38 Pept-eez chewable tablets,sugarfree,42/box 76.34$        39/bxs No Bid No Bid 2.12$           1/btl
39 Cherry cough drops,50/box 82.62$        34/bxs 0.62$          30/pkg 2.55$           18/bx
40 Congest-aid decongestant,100(50/2's)box 160.65$      34/bxs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
41 Soothe-aid throat lozenges,50/box 12.51$        3/bxs 17.67$        250/2 pkg 3.68$           each
42 Histonel-forte multi-symptom cold tablets,100(50/2's)box 113.36$      16/bxs 15.17$        pkg 2.13$           100/bx
43 3-in-one antibiotic ointment,25/box 296.00$      55/bxs 3.31$          each 17.27$         144/jr
44 Burn Relief spray,3oz. Plastic bottle 17.93$        7 btl. 3.92$          each No Bid No Bid
45 Hydrocortisone Cream,,anti-itch,1.0%,25/box 111.80$      40/bxs 1.41$          each 2.07$           each
46 Large economy instant ice pack,1/box 35.96$        36 ea. 8.57$          24/cs 10.42$         24/cs
47 Instant cold spray,3.5oz.,aerosol,no cfc's,non-medicated 32.94$        12 btl. 6.71$          each No Bid No Bid
48 Triangular bandage,sterile,non-sterile 4.23$          3 ea. No Bid No Bid 51.70$         240/cs
49 Band,compress,multifunction,1/box 7.05$          2 ea. 3.97$          each No Bid No Bid
50 Gloves, vinyl/latex/nitrile,lg,powder-free,100/box 25.54$        6/bxs No Bid No Bid

Gloves, vinyl/latex/nitrile,x-lg,powder-free,100/box 25.54$        6/bxs No Bid No Bid

51 Pepcid AC, complete chewables, 30/box 135.36$      13/bxs 9.81$          30/pkg 4.23$           30/bx
52 Imodium AD, industrial pack,72(36/2's)box 47.79$        30/bxs 5.48$          12/pkg 3.19$           1/bx

* Bid on orignal specs * Bid on orignal specs


