
* Darker shade = Awarded Vendor

BORDER 
EAGLE DIST.

* Boritex Inc.  
(minimun order of 
400 cs combined 

per location)
MEXI SNAX 

CORP.
Tortilleria 

Juarez, Inc.

Description Commodity# V#016128   

1. Corn Tortilla 2802-1000089-82 * $ 1.05 pkg 16.79 1.60 pkg .96 pkg
6" in diameter (thick) (PACK SIZE) = 60 ct 6/12 dz 80 ct 40 ct

est. usage = 200 pkgs .0175 ea .2331 ea .02 ea .024 ea
2. Flour Tortilla 2802-1000090-28 * $.90 pkg 16.45 1.60 pkg 1.74 pkg

9" in diameter (PACK SIZE) = 1 dz 6/24 ct 25 ct 30 ct
est. usage = 300 pkg .075 ea .1142 ea .064 ea .058 ea

3. Tostada Chip (Tortilla) 2807-0000092-68 * $4.30/cs 7.89 ea 5.70/cs 4.80/cs
(PACK SIZE) = 3/2# 3/2# 6 lbs 6 lbs

.7166 lb 1.315 lb .95 lb .80 lb
4. Tamales - red chili (Frozen) 2840-6006992-52

BEEF * $ 5.98/dz NO BID NO BID 6.15/dz
PORK (PACK SIZE) = * $ 5.98/dz 29.10 6.25/dz 6.15 dz

(asper needed basis) 72 ea/cs 2/5 dz
5. Tamales - green chili (FROZEN) 2840-6006992-52

Beef * $ 5.98/dz NO BID 6.15 dz
Pork * $ 5.98/dz 6.25 dz 6.15 dz

Chicken 72 ea/cs 6.25/dz 6.15 dz
(asper needed basis)

6. Tostada shells pkg 2814-0000092-56 * $.95 pkg 11.97 1.40 pkg 1.20 pkg
(PACK SIZE) = 24 ct 200 ct 24 ct 24 ct

(asper needed basis) .0395 ea .05985 ea .0583 ea .05 ea
7. Chicharon pkg 2807-0000091-70 * $1.35 pkg 2.65 pkg 1.75 pkg

5 oz bag (PACK SIZE) = 5 oz bag 5 oz bag 5 oz bag
Awarded
32.0981 22.49233 33.432

***Bid will be  awarded to overall low bidder***

!!! (Estimated usage is not binding to the COUNTY OF EL PASO) !!!

Tortilla Bid #07-027 for the County of El Paso-Jail 
facilities, Adult Probation (C.R.T.C. & Restitution), 

Juvenile Justice Centers.                           
Effective dates: May 1, 2007 thru October 31, 2007

TOTAL=

NO BID

NO BID
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