



Purchasing

Bid 08-002, Inmate Clothing, Towels, Blanket & Mattresses for the Sheriff's Office

Opening Date: Thursday, February 6, 2008

	Uniforms MFG. INC.	ICS	Robinson Textiles	Tabb Textiles Co., Inc.	American Textiles Systems	Bob Barker Company	Charm-Tex	Vinyl Products MFG., Inc.	Shoe Corp. of Birmingham nc.	Gold Water Industries, Inc.	Goaltex Corp.	Acme Supply CO.
Description	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost
MATTRESS/PILLOW SEWN IN COMBO	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 124.08	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
BLANKETS	no bid	\$6.40 gray only	\$ 9.35	\$6.50 (A) \$11.10 (B)	\$ 10.75	\$ 10.96	\$ 5.72	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
TOWELS	no bid	\$12.00/ dz	no bid	no bid	\$19.00 dz	\$ 0.91	\$ 11.72	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$18
SHOES MALE SIZE 6	\$1.97	no bid	\$ 2.33	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.43	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.49	\$ 2.48	\$ 2.51	no bid
SHOES MALE SIZE 7	\$1.97	no bid	\$ 2.33	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.43	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.49	\$ 2.48	\$ 2.51	no bid
SHOES MALE SIZE 8	\$1.97	no bid	\$ 2.33	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.43	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.49	\$ 2.48	\$ 2.51	no bid
SHOES MALE SIZE 9	\$1.97	no bid	\$ 2.33	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.43	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.49	\$ 2.48	\$ 2.51	no bid
SHOES MALE SIZE 10	\$1.97	no bid	\$ 2.33	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.43	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.49	\$ 2.48	\$ 2.51	no bid
SHOES MALE SIZE 11	\$1.97	no bid	\$ 2.33	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.43	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.49	\$ 2.48	\$ 2.51	no bid
SHOES MALE SIZE 12	\$1.97	no bid	\$ 2.33	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.43	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.49	\$ 2.48	\$ 2.51	no bid
SHOES MALE SIZE 13	\$1.97	no bid	\$ 2.33	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.43	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.49	\$ 2.63	\$ 2.51	no bid
SHOES MALE SIZE 14	\$1.97	no bid	\$ 2.33	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.43	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.49	\$ 2.63	\$ 2.51	no bid
SHOES MALE SIZE 15	\$1.97	no bid	\$ 2.33	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.43	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.49	\$ 2.63	\$ 2.51	no bid
SHOES FEMALE SIZE 5	\$1.97	no bid	\$ 2.33	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.43	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.49	\$ 2.48	\$ 2.51	no bid

	Uniforms MFG. INC.	ICS	Robinson Textiles	Tabb Textiles Co., Inc.	American Textiles Systems	Bob Barker Company	Charm-TEX	Vinyl Products MFG., Inc.	Shoe Corp. of Birmingham nc.	Gold Water Industries, Inc.	Goaltex Corp.	Acme Supply CO.
Description	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost
SHOES FEMALE SIZE 6	\$1.97	no bid	\$ 2.33	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.43	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.49	\$ 2.48	\$ 2.51	no bid
SHOES FEMALE SIZE 7	\$1.97	no bid	\$ 2.33	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.43	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.49	\$ 2.48	\$ 2.51	no bid
SHOES FEMALE SIZE 8	\$1.97	no bid	\$ 2.33	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.43	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.49	\$ 2.48	\$ 2.51	no bid
SHOES FEMALE SIZE 9	\$1.97	no bid	\$ 2.33	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.43	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.49	\$ 2.48	\$ 2.51	no bid
SHOES FEMALE SIZE 10	\$1.97	no bid	\$ 2.33	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.43	no bid	no bid	\$ 2.49	\$ 2.48	\$ 2.51	no bid
COVERALLS RED/WHITE SMALL	\$11	\$ 13.60	\$ 9.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 10.99	\$ 11.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS RED/WHITE MEDIUM	\$11	\$ 13.60	\$ 9.25	no bid	no bid	\$ 10.99	\$ 11.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS RED/WHITE LARGE	\$11	\$ 13.60	\$ 10.86	no bid	no bid	\$ 11.69	\$ 11.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS RED/WHITE X- LARGE	\$11	\$ 13.60	\$ 10.86	no bid	no bid	\$ 11.69	\$ 11.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS RED/WHITE 2X-LARGE	\$11	\$ 13.60	\$ 10.86	no bid	no bid	\$ 11.69	\$ 11.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS RED/WHITE 3X-LARGE	\$11.74	\$ 13.60	\$ 10.86	no bid	no bid	\$ 12.02	\$ 12.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS RED/WHITE 4X-LARGE	\$11.74	\$ 14.90	\$ 11.26	no bid	no bid	\$ 13.22	\$ 12.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS RED/WHITE 5X-LARGE	\$12.32	\$ 14.90	\$ 11.66	no bid	no bid	\$ 13.26	\$ 13.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS RED/WHITE 6X-LARGE	\$12.32	\$ 14.90	\$ 11.95	no bid	no bid	\$ 14.40	\$ 14.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS GREEN/WHITE SMALL	\$11	\$ 13.60	\$ 9.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 10.99	\$ 11.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS GREEN/WHITE MEDIUM	\$11	\$ 13.60	\$ 9.25	no bid	no bid	\$ 10.99	\$ 11.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS GREEN/WHITE LARGE	\$11	\$ 13.60	\$ 10.86	no bid	no bid	\$ 11.69	\$ 11.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS GREEN/WHITE X-LARGE	\$11	\$ 13.60	\$ 10.86	no bid	no bid	\$ 11.69	\$ 11.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid

	Uniforms MFG. INC.	ICS	Robinson Textiles	Tabb Textiles Co., Inc.	American Textiles Systems	Bob Barker Company	Charm-Tex	Vinyl Products MFG., Inc.	Shoe Corp. of Birmingham nc.	Gold Water Industries, Inc.	Goaltex Corp.	Acme Supply CO.
Description	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost
COVERALLS GREEN/WHITE 2X-LARGE	\$11	\$ 13.60	\$ 10.86	no bid	no bid	\$ 12.02	\$ 11.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS GREEN/WHITE 3X-LARGE	\$11.72	\$ 13.60	\$ 10.86	no bid	no bid	\$ 13.22	\$ 12.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS GREEN/WHITE 4X-LARGE	\$11.72	\$ 14.90	\$ 11.26	no bid	no bid	\$ 13.26	\$ 12.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS GREEN/WHITE 5X-LARGE	\$12.32	\$ 14.90	\$ 11.66	no bid	no bid	\$ 13.26	\$ 13.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS GREEN/WHITE 6X-LARGE	\$12.32	\$ 14.90	\$ 11.95	no bid	no bid	\$ 11.69	\$ 14.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS ORANGE/WHITE SMALL	\$11	\$ 13.60	\$ 9.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 10.99	\$ 11.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS ORANGE/WHITE MEDIUM	\$11	\$ 13.60	\$ 9.25	no bid	no bid	\$ 10.99	\$ 11.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS ORANGE/WHITE LARGE	\$11.50	\$ 13.60	\$ 10.86	no bid	no bid	\$ 11.69	\$ 11.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS ORANGE/WHITE X-LARGE	\$11.50	\$ 13.60	\$ 10.86	no bid	no bid	\$ 11.69	\$ 11.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS ORANGE/WHITE 2X-LARGE	\$11.72	\$ 13.60	\$ 10.86	no bid	no bid	\$ 11.69	\$ 11.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS ORANGE/WHITE 3X-LARGE	\$12.42	\$ 13.60	\$ 10.86	no bid	no bid	\$ 12.02	\$ 12.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS ORANGE/WHITE 4X-LARGE	\$12.42	\$ 14.90	\$ 11.26	no bid	no bid	\$ 13.22	\$ 12.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS ORANGE/WHITE 5X-LARGE	\$12.42	\$ 14.90	\$ 11.66	no bid	no bid	\$ 13.26	\$ 13.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS BLACK/WHITE SMALL	\$11	\$ 13.60	\$ 9.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 10.99	\$ 14.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS BLACK/WHITE MEDIUM	\$11	\$ 13.60	\$ 9.25	no bid	no bid	\$ 10.99	\$ 11.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS BLACK/WHITE LARGE	\$11	\$ 13.60	\$ 10.86	no bid	no bid	\$ 11.69	\$ 11.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS BLACK/WHITE X-LARGE	\$11	\$ 13.60	\$ 10.86	no bid	no bid	\$ 11.69	\$ 11.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS BLACK/WHITE 2X-LARGE	\$11	\$ 13.60	\$ 10.86	no bid	no bid	\$ 11.69	\$ 11.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid

	Uniforms MFG. INC.	ICS	Robinson Textiles	Tabb Textiles Co., Inc.	American Textiles Systems	Bob Barker Company	Charm-Tex	Vinyl Products MFG., Inc.	Shoe Corp. of Birmingham nc.	Gold Water Industries, Inc.	Goaltex Corp.	Acme Supply CO.
Description	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost
COVERALLS BLACK/WHITE 3X-LARGE	\$11.75	\$ 13.60	\$ 10.86	no bid	no bid	\$ 12.02	\$ 11.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS BLACK/WHITE 4X-LARGE	\$11.75	\$ 14.90	\$ 11.26	no bid	no bid	\$ 13.22	\$ 12.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS BLACK/WHITE 5X-LARGE	\$12.42	\$ 14.90	\$ 11.66	no bid	no bid	\$ 13.26	\$ 13.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS BLACK/WHITE 6X-LARGE	\$12.42	\$ 14.90	\$ 11.95	no bid	no bid	\$ 14.40	\$ 11.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS SOLID NAVY LARGE	\$10	\$ 13.60	\$ 9.08	no bid	no bid	\$ 11.69	\$ 11.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS SOLID NAVY x LARGE	\$10	\$ 13.60	\$ 9.08	no bid	no bid	\$ 11.69	\$ 11.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS SOLID NAVY 2X-LARGE	\$10	\$ 13.60	\$ 9.08	no bid	no bid	\$ 11.69	\$ 11.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS SOLID NAVY 3X-LARGE	\$10	\$ 13.60	\$ 9.48	no bid	no bid	\$ 12.02	\$ 12.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS SOLID NAVY 4X-LARGE	\$11	\$ 14.90	\$ 9.88	no bid	no bid	\$ 13.22	\$ 12.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS SOLID NAVY 5X-LARGE	\$11	\$ 14.90	\$ 10.28	no bid	no bid	\$ 13.26	\$ 13.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
COVERALLS SOLID NAVY 6X-LARGE	\$12	\$ 14.90	\$ 10.68	no bid	no bid	\$ 14.40	\$ 14.18	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid

No CIQ Number Received from Uniforms MFG.Inc. and ICS

Approved By (signature)

Approved By (Print)

Sheriff's Office

Department

Date

lb3/07/08