
Description for Vehicles 

Equipment
Alamo Auto Supply R.T.C., Inc.

Dailey and 

Wells

Adamson 

Industries 

Corp.

GT Distributors 

Item A.   Prisoner Transport Seat $2,370.00 $2,280.00 No Bid $2,267.34 $2,416.32 

Item B.   Prisoner Barrier $4,188.00 $4,500.00 No Bid $4,662.00 $4,909.74 

Item C.   Go Rhino Grill Gard $954.00 $1,350.00 No Bid $1,105.44 $1,391.40 

Item D.   SirenSpeaker $504.00 
Part of Item 

K
No Bid $1,028.58 $923.40 

Item E.   Panasonic CF30 tough book $24,600.00 $25,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item F.   Federal Eleclronic 

Siren/Switch
$1,686.00 

Part of Item 

K
No Bid $2,255.28 $1,969.92 

Item G.   Fire Extinguisher $390.00 $378.00 No Bid $230.28 $395.40 

Item H. HeadlightFlasher $312.00 
Part of Item 

K
No Bid $318.06 $226.80 

Item I.  KustomSignals Digital 

Eyewitness ION Eclipse
$28,350.00 $29,994.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item J.  Mouting Bracket $6,600.00 $6,450.00 No Bid $7,367.34 No Bid

 BID # 10-011, Bid - Interior and Exterior for (6) Marked Patrol Vehicles & (3)   F-150 

Trucks
OPENING DATE: Wednesday, March 17, 2010

Purchasing Department



Item K.  Federal Signal  Legend-45 

LED Lightbar

$7,794.00 w/LED TD & Alley         

$6,474.00 W/Hologen TD & Alley         

$5,850.00 Alt-Jet LED Lightbar

$9,600.00 No Bid $11,635.23 $5,879.40 

Item L.   Modem $20,940.00 $43,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item M. Battery Protection Unit
**$384.00                                                 

Please see note below
$378.00 No Bid $524.94 No Bid

Item N.  Programmable Shut down Part of Item M $378.00 No Bid $473.76 No Bid

Item O.  Secure-Idle $767.82 $756.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item P. Mobile Radios- MA-COM Model 

M7100
$15,900.00 $12,762.00 $14,965.50 No Bid No Bid

Item Q.  Radar System
***$14,370.00                                               

Please see note below
$16,080.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

RTC - No Bid Bond- Disqualified

Approved By (signature)

**75 amp relay reqired - extra cost $108.00

***Interface Cable Video Torndar- Additional cost $660.00

Date

Sheriff's Office

Department

 Approved By (Print) 


