
Description            

for equipment (3) F-

150 Truck

Alamo Auto Supply **R.T.C., Inc. Dailey and Wells
Adamson 

Industries Corp.
GT Distributors

#1.  53" legend Light Bar $4,500.00 No Bid $6,975.63 $2,969.70 

#2.  Winch w/solenoid $1,764.00 $2,871.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

#3.  Fire extinguisher $195.00 $189.00 No Bid $115.14 $197.70 

#4.  Rifle Rack, inserts 

w/brackests
$705.00 $607.50 No Bid $629.67 No Bid

#5.  Spot Lights (2) $648.00 $414.00 No Bid 296.67 $322.50 

#6.  Charge Guard-battery 

Saver 
$192.00 $189.00 No Bid $262.47 $198.57 

#7. Accessories fuse block 

w/75 amp relay
$99.00 $129.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

#8.  ION ECLIPSE Video 

System
$14,175.00 $14,997.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

#9.  Precision Laptop mount to 

fit Tough Book
$1,935.00 $3,225.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

#10.  Panasonic Tough Book 

Laptop
$12,300.00 $12,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

#11.  Golden Egle ll, 

Directional, Dual Antenna
$7,185.00 $8,040.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

#12.  MACOM Radio $7,950.00 $6,381.00 $7,482.75 No Bid No Bid

#13.  640 Siren Switch Panel 

w/Lights Control
$843.00 Part of item 1 No Bid $1,127.64 $965.70 

#14.  Push Bumper $1,137.00 $1,818.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

#15.  Partitions $1,350.00 $1,440.00 No Bid $1,397.40 $1,314.72 

#16.  Siren speakers $252.00 Part of item 1 No Bid $417.00 $461.70 

#17.  Tailgate Lights & Grill 

Lights
$1,242.00 $1,316.70 No Bid $1,297.35 No Bid

#18.  Running Boards $458.07 $2,688.00 No Bid $989.70 No Bid

#19.  Bed Liner $321.00 $645.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

#20.  Bed Cover, Sliding & 

Folding Type
$1,845.60 $2,904.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

#21. Center Console $1,140.00 Part of item 9 No Bid $989.40 No Bid
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#22.  Cup Holder (2) $116.25 Part of item 9 No Bid $66.00 No Bid

#23.  Microphone Holder $67.50 Part of item 9 No Bid $53.61 No Bid

#24,  External Power Supply 

(2)
$450.00 Part of item 9 No Bid No Bid No Bid

#27.  Modem $10,350.00 $21,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

#28.  Headlicght Flashers (2) $291.00 $139.50 No Bid $135.78 $100.44 

TOTAL COST $201,918.24 $225,977.70 $7,482.75 $14,617.68 $24,643.41 

lb4/9/10

Approved By (signature)

**No Bid Bond- Disqualified

Date
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 Approved By (Print) 


