
Acme 

Supply 

CO.

Bob 

Barker 

Company  

Inc.

*Charm-

Tex

Gold 

Water 

Industries

, Inc. ICS

*Loveline 

Ind. Inc.

*Pacific Link 

International

*Robinson 

Textiles

Tabb 

Textile 

Co., Inc. 

*Uniforms 

Manufacturing, 

Inc.

*Walter F. 

Stephens, 

Jr. Inc.

1

MATTRESS/PILLOW SEWN 

IN COMBO No Bid $49.88 $48.90 No Bid $44.90 No Bid No Bid $42.00 No Bid No Bid $58.00 

2 BLANKETS No Bid $6.59 $6.18 No Bid $6.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.65 No Bid $5.94 

3 TOWELS $17.75 $10.92 $14.26 No Bid $14.94 No Bid $13.75 No Bid $12.25 No Bid No Bid

4 SHOES MALE SIZE 6 No Bid $4.52 $4.26 $2.89 $3.62 No Bid No Bid $4.57 No Bid

2.25 Orange 2.95 

Navy $3.15 

5 SHOES MALE SIZE 7 No Bid $4.52 $4.26 $2.89 $3.62 No Bid No Bid $4.57 No Bid

2.25 Orange 2.95 

Navy $3.15 

6 SHOES MALE SIZE 8 No Bid $4.52 $4.26 $2.89 $3.62 No Bid No Bid $4.57 No Bid

2.25 Orange 2.95 

Navy $3.15 

7 SHOES MALE SIZE 9 No Bid $4.52 $4.26 $2.89 $3.62 No Bid No Bid $4.57 No Bid

2.25 Orange 2.95 

Navy $3.15 

8 SHOES MALE SIZE 10 No Bid $4.52 $4.26 $2.89 $3.62 No Bid No Bid $4.57 No Bid

2.25 Orange 2.95 

Navy $3.15 

9 SHOES MALE SIZE 11 No Bid $4.52 $4.26 $2.89 $3.62 No Bid No Bid $4.57 No Bid

2.25 Orange 2.95 

Navy $3.15 

10 SHOES MALE SIZE 12 No Bid $4.52 $4.26 $2.89 $3.62 No Bid No Bid $4.57 No Bid

2.25 Orange 2.95 

Navy $3.15 

11 SHOES MALE SIZE 13 No Bid $4.52 $4.26 $3.12 $3.62 No Bid No Bid $4.57 No Bid

2.25 Orange 2.95 

Navy $3.15 

12 SHOES MALE SIZE 14 No Bid $4.52 $4.26 $3.12 $3.62 No Bid No Bid $4.57 No Bid

2.25 Orange 2.95 

Navy $3.15 

13 SHOES MALE SIZE 15 No Bid $4.52 $4.26 $3.12 $3.62 No Bid No Bid $4.57 No Bid

2.25 Orange 2.95 

Navy $3.15 

14  SHOES FEMALE SIZE 5 No Bid $4.52 $4.26 $2.89 $3.62 No Bid No Bid $4.57 No Bid

2.25 Orange 2.95 

Navy $3.15 

15  SHOES FEMALE SIZE 6 No Bid $4.52 $4.26 $2.89 $3.62 No Bid No Bid $4.57 No Bid

2.25 Orange 2.95 

Navy $3.15 

16  SHOES FEMALE SIZE 7 No Bid $4.52 $4.26 $2.89 $3.62 No Bid No Bid $4.57 No Bid

2.25 Orange 2.95 

Navy $3.15 

17  SHOES FEMALE SIZE 8 No Bid $4.52 $4.26 $2.89 $3.62 No Bid No Bid $4.57 No Bid

2.25 Orange 2.95 

Navy $3.15 

18  SHOES FEMALE SIZE 9 No Bid $4.52 $4.26 $2.89 $3.62 No Bid No Bid $4.57 No Bid

2.25 Orange 2.95 

Navy $3.15 

19  SHOES FEMALE SIZE 10 No Bid $4.52 $4.26 $2.89 $3.62 No Bid No Bid $4.57 No Bid

2.25 Orange 2.95 

Navy $3.15 

Purchasing

Description Cost Cost  Cost  Cost  Cost 

Bid 10-030, Inmate Clothing, Bedding & Linen 
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20

COVERALLS RED/WHITE 

SMALL No Bid $8.75 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $13.90 No Bid $9.50 No Bid $12.00 No Bid

21

COVERALLS RED/WHITE 

MEDIUM No Bid $8.75 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $14.45 No Bid $10.50 No Bid $12.00 No Bid

22

COVERALLS RED/WHITE 

LARGE No Bid $8.75 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $14.45 No Bid $10.50 No Bid $12.00 No Bid

23

COVERALLS RED/WHITE X-

LARGE No Bid $9.75 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $14.45 No Bid $11.33 No Bid $12.00 No Bid

24

COVERALLS RED/WHITE 2X-

LARGE No Bid $9.75 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $14.75 No Bid $11.33 No Bid $12.00 No Bid

25

COVERALLS RED/WHITE 3X-

LARGE No Bid $9.75 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $15.20 No Bid $11.33 No Bid $13.00 No Bid

26

COVERALLS RED/WHITE 4X-

LARGE No Bid $10.50 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $15.60 No Bid $11.33 No Bid $13.00 No Bid

27

COVERALLS RED/WHITE 5X-

LARGE No Bid $10.50 No Bid No Bid $16.00 $16.00 No Bid $11.33 No Bid $14.00 No Bid

28

COVERALLS RED/WHITE 6X-

LARGE No Bid $11.50 No Bid No Bid $16.00 $16.40 No Bid $13.33 No Bid $14.00 No Bid

29

COVERALLS GREEN/WHITE 

SMALL No Bid $9.00 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $13.90 No Bid $9.50 No Bid $12.00 No Bid

30

COVERALLS GREEN/WHITE 

MEDIUM No Bid $9.00 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $14.45 No Bid $10.50 No Bid $12.00 No Bid

31

COVERALLS GREEN/WHITE 

LARGE No Bid $9.50 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $14.45 No Bid $10.50 No Bid $12.00 No Bid

32

COVERALLS GREEN/WHITE 

X-LARGE No Bid $9.75 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $14.45 No Bid $11.33 No Bid $12.00 No Bid

33

COVERALLS GREEN/WHITE 

2X-LARGE No Bid $10.00 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $14.75 No Bid $11.33 No Bid $12.00 No Bid

34

COVERALLS GREEN/WHITE 

3X-LARGE No Bid $10.00 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $15.20 No Bid $11.33 No Bid $13.00 No Bid

35

COVERALLS GREEN/WHITE 

4X-LARGE No Bid $11.00 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $15.60 No Bid $11.33 No Bid $13.00 No Bid

36

COVERALLS GREEN/WHITE 

5X-LARGE No Bid $11.50 No Bid No Bid $16.00 $16.00 No Bid $11.33 No Bid $14.00 No Bid

37

COVERALLS GREEN/WHITE 

6X-LARGE No Bid $11.50 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $16.00 No Bid $13.33 No Bid $15.00 No Bid

38

COVERALLS 

ORANGE/WHITE SMALL No Bid $8.75 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $13.90 No Bid $9.50 No Bid $12.00 No Bid

39

COVERALLS 

ORANGE/WHITE MEDIUM No Bid $8.75 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $14.45 No Bid $10.50 No Bid $12.00 No Bid

40

COVERALLS 

ORANGE/WHITE LARGE No Bid $9.00 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $14.45 No Bid $10.50 No Bid $12.00 No Bid

41

COVERALLS 

ORANGE/WHITE X-LARGE No Bid $9.80 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $14.45 No Bid $11.33 No Bid $12.00 No Bid
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42

COVERALLS 

ORANGE/WHITE 2X-LARGE No Bid $9.80 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $14.75 No Bid $11.33 No Bid $12.00 No Bid

43

COVERALLS 

ORANGE/WHITE 3X-LARGE No Bid $9.80 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $15.20 No Bid $11.33 No Bid $13.00 No Bid

44

COVERALLS 

ORANGE/WHITE 4X-LARGE No Bid $10.25 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $15.60 No Bid $11.33 No Bid $13.00 No Bid

45

COVERALLS 

ORANGE/WHITE 5X-LARGE No Bid $11.00 No Bid No Bid $16.00 $16.00 No Bid $11.33 No Bid $14.00 No Bid

46

COVERALLS BLACK/WHITE 

SMALL No Bid $8.75 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $13.90 No Bid $9.50 No Bid $12.00 No Bid

47

COVERALLS BLACK/WHITE 

MEDIUM No Bid $8.75 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $14.45 No Bid $10.50 No Bid $12.00 No Bid

48

COVERALLS BLACK/WHITE 

LARGE No Bid $8.75 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $14.45 No Bid $10.50 No Bid $12.00 No Bid

49

COVERALLS BLACK/WHITE 

X-LARGE No Bid $9.50 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $14.45 No Bid $11.33 No Bid $12.00 No Bid

50

COVERALLS BLACK/WHITE 

2X-LARGE No Bid $9.75 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $14.75 No Bid $11.33 No Bid $12.00 No Bid

51

COVERALLS BLACK/WHITE 

3X-LARGE No Bid $9.75 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $15.20 No Bid $11.33 No Bid $13.00 No Bid

52

COVERALLS BLACK/WHITE 

5X-LARGE No Bid $11.00 No Bid No Bid $16.00 $16.00 No Bid $11.33 No Bid $15.00 No Bid

53

COVERALLS BLACK/WHITE 

6X-LARGE No Bid $11.25 No Bid No Bid $16.00 $16.40 No Bid $13.33 No Bid $15.00 No Bid

54

COVERALLS SOLID NAVY 

LARGE No Bid $9.75 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $14.45 No Bid $10.00 No Bid $11.00 No Bid

55

COVERALLS SOLID NAVY x-

LARGE No Bid $9.75 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $14.75 No Bid $10.00 No Bid $11.00 No Bid

56

COVERALLS SOLID NAVY 

2X-LARGE No Bid $10.20 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $14.75 No Bid $10.00 No Bid $11.00 No Bid

57

COVERALLS SOLID NAVY 

3X-LARGE No Bid $10.70 No Bid No Bid $14.60 $15.20 No Bid $10.50 No Bid $11.00 No Bid

58

COVERALLS SOLID NAVY 

4X-LARGE No Bid $11.20 No Bid No Bid $16.00 $15.60 No Bid $10.75 No Bid $11.00 No Bid

59

COVERALLS SOLID NAVY 

5X-LARGE No Bid $11.80 No Bid No Bid $16.00 $16.00 No Bid $11.00 No Bid $12.00 No Bid

60

COVERALLS SOLID NAVY 

6X-LARGE No Bid $13.00 No Bid No Bid $16.00 $16.40 No Bid $11.50 No Bid $14.00 No Bid

61

TRISTITCH SHIRTS GREEN 

S-6X No Bid 

S/M 3.04  L/XL 

3.52   2XL/3XL 

3.96     4XL 

4.44 (5XL/6XL 

4.84) No Bid No Bid $6.00 $6.40 No Bid $4.13 No Bid

S-XXL 4.04       3X-

4X 4.52       5X-6X  

5.14 No Bid
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62

TRISTITCH SHIRTS GREEN 

7X-10X No Bid 

7XL 4.97   8XL 

-10XL 5.64 No Bid No Bid $9.00 $6.80 No Bid $5.50 No Bid

7X-8X  5.48      9X-

10X  5.78 No Bid

63

TRISTITCH SHIRTS RED S-

6X No Bid 

S/M 3.04  L/XL 

3.52   2XL/3XL 

3.96     4XL 

4.44 (5XL/6XL 

4.84) No Bid No Bid $6.00 $6.40 No Bid $4.13 No Bid

S-XXL 4.04       3X-

4X 4.52       5X-6X  

5.14 No Bid

64

TRISTITCH SHIRTS RED 7X-

10X No Bid 

7XL 4.97   8XL 

-10XL 5.64 No Bid No Bid $9.00 $6.80 No Bid $5.50 No Bid

7X-8X  5.48      9X-

10X  5.78 No Bid

65

TRISTITCH SHIRTS 

ORANGE S-6X No Bid 

S/M 3.04  L/XL 

3.52   2XL/3XL 

3.96     4XL 

4.44 (5XL/6XL 

4.84) No Bid No Bid $6.00 $6.40 No Bid $4.13 No Bid

S-XXL 4.04       3X-

4X 4.52        5X-

6X  5.14 No Bid

66

TRISTITCH SHIRTS 

ORANGE  7X-10X No Bid 

7XL 4.97   8XL 

-10XL 5.64 No Bid No Bid $9.00 $6.80 No Bid $5.50 No Bid

7X-8X  5.48      9X-

10X  5.78 No Bid

67

TRISTITCH SHIRTS BLUE S-

6X No Bid 

S/M 3.04  L/XL 

3.52   2XL/3XL 

3.96     4XL 

4.44 (5XL/6XL 

4.84) No Bid No Bid $6.00 $6.40 No Bid $4.13 No Bid

S-XXL 4.04       3X-

4X 4.52     5X-6X  

5.14 No Bid

68

TRISTITCH SHIRTS BLUE  

7X-10X No Bid 

7XL 4.97   8XL 

-10XL 5.64 No Bid No Bid $9.00 $6.80 No Bid $5.50 No Bid

7X-8X  5.48      9X-

10X  5.78 No Bid

69

TRISTITCH PANTS GREEN 

S-6X No Bid 

S/M 4.00  L/XL 

4.52   2XL-4XL  

4.73     

(5XL/6XL 

5.74) No Bid No Bid $6.50 $7.10 No Bid $5.13 No Bid

S-XXL 4.92       3X-

4X 5.25      5X-6X  

5.92 No Bid

70

TRISTITCH PANTS GREEN 

7X-10X No Bid 

7XL 5.97   8XL 

-10XL 6.42 No Bid No Bid $9.50 $7.58 No Bid $6.75 No Bid

7X-8X  6.43      9X-

10X  7.16 No Bid

71

TRISTITCH PANTS RED   S-

6X No Bid 

S/M 4.00  L/XL 

4.52   2XL-4XL  

4.73     

(5XL/6XL 

5.74) No Bid No Bid $6.50 $7.10 No Bid $5.13 No Bid

S-XXL 4.92       3X-

4X 5.25      5X-6X  

5.92 No Bid
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72

TRISTITCH PANTS RED 7X-

10X No Bid 

7XL 5.97   8XL 

-10XL 6.42 No Bid No Bid $9.50 $7.58 No Bid $6.75 No Bid

7X-8X  6.43      9X-

10X  7.16 No Bid

73

TRISTITCH PANTS ORANGE 

S-6X No Bid 

S/M 4.00  L/XL 

4.52   2XL-4XL  

4.73     

(5XL/6XL 

5.74) No Bid No Bid $6.50 $7.10 No Bid $5.13 No Bid

S-XXL 4.92       3X-

4X 5.25      5X-6X  

5.92 No Bid

74

TRISTITCH PANTS ORANGE  

7X-10X No Bid 

7XL 5.97   8XL 

-10XL 6.42 No Bid No Bid $9.50 $7.58 No Bid $6.75 No Bid

7X-8X  6.43      9X-

10X  7.16 No Bid

75

TRISTITCH PANTS BLUE S-

6X No Bid 

S/M 4.00  L/XL 

4.52   2XL-4XL  

4.73     

(5XL/6XL 

5.74) No Bid No Bid $6.50 $7.10 No Bid $5.13 No Bid

S-XXL 4.92       3X-

4X 5.25      5X-6X  

5.92 No Bid

76

TRISTITCH PANTS BLUE  

7X-10X No Bid 

7XL 5.97   8XL 

-10XL 6.42 No Bid No Bid $9.50 $7.58 No Bid $6.75 No Bid

7X-8X  6.43      9X-

10X  7.16 No Bid

5/17/10 LM
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