Bid #12-018
Uniforms and Body Armor for the El Paso County Sheriff's Department
Opening Date: March 16, 2012

GT Distributors Inc. Bazaar Un;ftc:)rr:s & Men's Uniforms of Texas Sun C'tys::::'yc Safety

Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Deputy Champ Jacket No Bid $163.00 No Bid $178.20
Deputy Light Weight Jacket No Bid $104.00 2x & above $114.00 No Bid $111.10
Deputy Class A Pant No Bid $48.99 alt $57.99 No Bid $55.09
Deputy Men's Shirt-Long Sleeve No Bid $41.99 No Bid $49.50
Deputy Women's Shirt-Long Sleeve No Bid $41.99 No Bid $48.00
Deputy Men's Shirt-Short Sleeve No Bid $38.00 No Bid $47.50
Deputy Women's Shirt-Short Sleeve No Bid $38.00 No Bid $47.50
Deputy Motorcycle Breeches No Bid $153.00 No Bid $169.50
Deputy Rain Coat No Bid $22.99 No Bid $26.50
D.0. Woman's Class A Trouser Western Pockets 1722 No Bid $35.99 alt $35.99 No Bid $43.90
D.O. Men's Class A Trouser Western Pockets 1872 No Bid $35.99 alt $35.99 No Bid $43.90
D.0. Women's Short Sleeve Class A Shirt No Bid $28.99 alt $38.99 No Bid $39.90
D.O. Men's Short Sleeve Class A Shirt No Bid $28.99 alt $38.99 No Bid $39.90
D.0. BDU Tactical Shirt No Bid $25.99 No Bid $52.80
D.O. BDU Tactical Pants No Bid $25.99 No Bid $52.80
SRT BDU Tactical Shirt No Bid $25.99 No Bid $25.90
SRT BDU Pants No Bid $25.99 No Bid $25.90
Courthouse Black Pants No Bid $25.50 alt $29.00 No Bid $29.98
Courthouse Men's Shirt-Long Sleeve No Bid $34.00 No Bid $38.90
Courthouse Men's Shirt-Short Sleeve No Bid $29.00 No Bid $34.65
Deputy Body Armor $628.90 $549.00 $485.0(;:(>)<t(;g carrier $485.00
Approved By (Signature) Aprroved By (Print)

Sheriff's Department
Department Date

Recommendation 3/21/2012-EC



