BREAD BID#12-025 FOR THE COUNTY OF EL PASO: SHERIFF JAIL FACILITIES (DOWNTOWN & ANNEX), ADULT PROBATION
(CRTC & CIC) AND JUVENILE JUSTICE CENTERS. EFFECTICE DATES MAY 1, 2012 thru OCTOBER 31, 2012
(SIX MONTH PERIOD), "ESTIMATED USAGE ONLY AND CAN CHANGE DEPENDING ON POPULATION"

FLOWERS Extended

PRODUCT DESCRIPTION COMMODITY BAKING FLOWERS
BREAD-WHITE, LOAF SANDWICH SLICES. $0.75 $3,750.00
24 0Z. 2801-30000Y154 20 oz. 5000 X .75
(est. usage 5000 ea.)
BREAD-WHITE, LOAF (TEXAS) THICK SLICES. $1.10 $770.00
24 0Z. 2801-4000009-Y1 20 oz. 700X 1.10
(est. usage 700 ea)
BREAD-WHEAT (100%) LOAF, SLICED. $1.10 $2,450.00
24 0Z. 2801-500009-Y1 20 oz. 2200X1.10
(est. usage 2200 ea.)
HAMBURGER BUN (4"), SLICED. $1.20 $1,200.00
12 CT. 2801-6000090-66 12 ct. 1000 X 1.20
(est. usage 1000 pkgs)
HAMBURGER BUN (5"), SLICED. $0.99 $0.99
12 CT. 2801-6000090-66 6 ct
(as needed)
HAMBURGER BUN (WHEAT) 5", SLICED. NO BID
12 CT. 2801-6000090-66
(as needed)
HOT DOG BUN. $1.20 $3,600.00
12 CT. 2801-6000090-68 12 ct. 3000 X 1.20
(est. usage 3000 pkgs)
HOT DOG BUN (WHEAT). $1.40 $1.40
12 CT. 2801-6000090-68 12 ct.
(as needed)
HOT DOG BUN (FOOT LONG). $1.40 $140.00
18 CT. 2801-6000090-68 6 ct. 100 X 1.40
(est. usage 100 pkg)

Darker Shade = Awarded vendor
(lump sum to over-all low bidder)




FLOWERS EXTENDED
PRODUCT DESCRIPTION COMMODITY BAKING FLOWERS
10. |SUBMARINE BUN (HOAGIE), SLICED. $0.99 $693.00
6 CT. 2801-1000009-Y1 6 ct. 700 X .99
(est. usage 700 ea)
11. |BROWN & SERVE ROLLS. (HOLIDAY ITEM) $1.20
12 CT. 2802-0000089-32 12 ct.
(as needed)
12. |DOUGHNUT PKG. (NOT MINIATURE SIZE) NO BID
6 CT. 2840-90000Y4-79
(est. usage 50 pkg.)
13. |CINNAMON ROLL PKG. (NOT MINIATURE SIZE) NO BID
6 CT. 2802-10000Y8-04
(est. usage 50 pkg.)
14. |DANISH ROLL (ASSORTED) NOT MINIATURE SIZE NO BID
ea. or pkg. size 2802-10000Y8-04
(est. usage 50 pkg.) AWARDED
TOTAL = $12,605.39

I AWARD AS LUMP SUM TO OVERALL LOW-BIDDER (COMPLETE PRICE OUT)

Approved By (signature)

Sheriff's Office

Department

Departments Recommendation:

Darker Shade = Awarded vendor
(lump sum to over-all low bidder)

Approved By (print)

Date




