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4.1  Basic User Desktop 20 $707.21 $14,144.20 $784.00 $15,680.00 $740.42 $14,808.40 $735.92 $14,718.40 no bid no bid $692.00 $13,840.00 $914.00 $18,282.00

4.2  Standard Desktop 10 $825.21 $8,252.10 $875.00 $87,550.00 $866.18 $8,661.80 $937.68 $9,376.80 no bid no bid $775.00 $7,750.00 $1,170.90 $11,709.00

4.3  Power User Desktop 5 $936.54 $4,682.70 $1,000.30 $5,001.50 $993.81 $4,969.05 $1,415.19 $7,075.95 no bid no bid $865.00 $4,325.00 $1,373.16 $6,865.80

Basic Laptop Duplicated 20 $942.19 $18,843.80 no bid no bid no bid no bid $1,138.58 $22,771.60 no bid no bid $880.98 $17,619.60 $1,469.76 $29,395.20

4.4  Standard Laptop 15 $942.19 $14,132.85 $1,197.75 $17,966.25 $870.32 $13,054.80 $1,182.27 $17,734.05 no bid no bid $880.98 $13,214.70 $1,469.75 $22,046.40

4.5  Laptop with Dock and Accessories 10 $1,243.00 $12,430.00 $1,359.00 $13,590.00 $922.58 $9,225.80 $1,305.28 $13,052.80 no bid no bid $1,038.00 $10,380.00 $1,828.62 $18,286.20

4.6  20” Monitor 10 $150.00 $1,500.00 $135.15 $1,351.50 $150.00 $1,500.00 $130.31 $1,303.10 no bid no bid $110.00 $1,100.00 $224.10 $2,241.00

4.6  22”Monitor 10 $175.00 $1,750.00 $152.15 $1,521.50 $173.29 $1,732.90 $144.87 $1,448.70 no bid no bid $170.00 $1,700.00 $289.00 $2,890.00

4.6  24” Monitor 10 $252.00 $2,520.00 $254.15 $2,541.50 $265.72 $2,657.20 $217.67 $2,176.70 no bid no bid $210.00 $2,100.00 $425.00 $4,250.00

4.7  Workgroup Printer 5 $448.00 $2,240.00 $402.58 $2,012.90 $427.11 $2,135.55 $506.37 $2,531.85 $389.57 $1,947.85 $481.40 $2,407.00 $481.40 $2,407.00

4.8 High Volume Printer 1 $827.00 $827.00 $634.15 $634.15 $784.85 $784.85 $929.41 $929.41 $1,078.41 $1,078.41 $826.00 $826.00 $826.00 $826.00

4.9 Light Duty Scanner 5 $411.00 $2,055.00 $254.44 $1,272.20 $437.08 $2,185.40 $404.00 $2,020.00 $384.99 $1,924.95 $443.32 $2,216.60 $443.32 $2,216.60

4.10 Standard Duty Scanner 5 $954.00 $4,770.00 $430.51 $2,152.55 no bid no bid $404.00 $2,020.00 $730.87 $3,654.35 $865.70 $4,328.50 $754.70 $4,328.50

4.11 High Volume Scanner 5 $2,839.00 $14,190.00 $2,216.45 $11,082.25 $2,097.96 $10,489.80 $936.00 $4,680.00 $1,331.79 $6,658.95 $2,128.15 $10,640.75 $2,128.15 $10,640.75

4.12  IPAD 2 1 $599.00 $599.00 no bid no bid $438.32 $438.32 $599.00 $599.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

4.13  Xoom or Galaxy 10.1 1 $547.11 $547.11
$519.55 Xoom   

$556.67 Galaxy

$519.55 Xoom      

$556.67 Galaxy
$522.95 $522.95 $530.00 $530.00 no bid no bid $529.48 $529.48 $529.48 $529.48

Maintenance, Warranty, Support and Delivery included $1,000.00 $1,000.00 included included included included

Decision Tree 

Technologies Inc.

Checkpoint Services, 

Inc.   #2

$136,913.93

BID #12-033

Hardware Equipment for the El Paso County

Opening Date: Wednesday, April 25, 2012

$15,264.51

Checkpoint Services, 

Inc.  #1

Austin Ribbon & 

Computer Supplies, 

Inc.

$84,632.52

Southern Computer 

Warehouse

$73,166.82 $92,977.63$103,968.36

Spectrum Imaging 

Systems, Inc.
Plan B Networks, Inc.

Departments Recommendation:

IT Department

Department

Approved By (signature)

Vendors to award in "Yellow" for each item above 

Date

Approved By (print)

*For every 30 Dell computers 

purchased the County will 

receive1 free Workgroup Printer  

**Direct replacement for 

discontinued model listed in bid.

Response includes the 

same configuration and 

pricing for "Basic" and 

"Standard" laptops.

TOTAL COST $103,483.76

Office Max has been disqualified for the following 

reasons: not providing pricing on required price list 

form.


