Bid #12-068

Bread Products for the County of El Paso
Opening Date: Thursday, October 25, 2012

Sheriff's Jail Facilities (Downtown & Annex), Adult Probation (CRTC & CIC), & Juvenile Justice Center
Effective Dates: December 1, 2012 thru May 31, 2013

No.| COMMODITY PRODUCT DESCRIPTION FLOWERS BAKING| BIMBO BAKERIES
1. |2801-30000Y154 |BREAD-WHITE, LOAF SANDWICH SLICES .78 ea .088 ea
24 0z 20 oz 24 oz
.936=240z2
Estimated Usage 5000 each .936 x 5000 .88 x 5000
Extended Cost $4,680.00 $4,400.00
2. |2801-4000009-Y1 |[BREAD-WHITE, LOAF (TEXAS) THICK SLICES 1.13 ea 1.05ea
24 0z 20 0z 24 oz
1.356 =24 0z
Estimated Usage 700 each 1.356 x 700 1.05 x 700
Extended Cost $949.20 $735.00
3. |2801-500009-Y1 |BREAD-WHEAT (100%) LOAF, SLICED 1.12ea 1.05ea
2407 20 oz 20 oz
Estimated Usage 2200 each 1.12 X 2200 1.05 x 2200
Extended Cost $2,464.00 $2,310.00
4. [2801-6000090-66 |HAMBURGER BUN (4"), SLICED 1.20 ea 1.20 ea
12 CT 12 ct 12 ct
Estimated Usage 2000 pkgs 1.20 x 2000 1.20 x 2000
Extended Cost $2,400.00 $2,400.00
5. |2801-6000090-66 |[HAMBURGER BUN (5"), SLICED 1.04 ea 2.28 ea
12CT 6 ct 15 ct
2.60=15ct
Estimated Usage (as needed)
Extended Cost $2.60 $2.28
6. [2801-6000090-66 |HAMBURGER BUN (WHEAT) 5", SLICED
12CT
Estimated Usage (as needed)
Extended Cost NO BID NO BID
7. |2801-6000090-68 |HOT DOG BUN 1.20ea 1.20ea
12CT 12 ct 12 ct
Estimated Usage 4000 pakgs 1.20 x 4000 1.20 x 4000
Extended Cost $4,800.00 $4,800.00




NO. COMMODITY PRODUCT DESCRIPTION FLOWERS BAKING | BIMBO BAKERIES
8. [2801-6000090-68 [HOT DOG BUN (WHEAT) 1.40 ea 1.21ea
12CT 12 ct 8ct
1.82=10ct
Estimated Usage (as needed)
Extended Cost $1.40 $1.82
9. [2801-6000090-68 |HOT DOG BUN (FOOT LONG) 1.40 ea 1.84 ea
18 CT 6 ct 10 ct
2.333=10ct
Estimated Usage 100 pkgs 2.333x 100 1.84 x 100
Extended Cost $233.30 $184.00
10. |2801-1000009-Y1 |SUBMARINE BUN (HOAGIE), SLICED .99 ea .96 ea
6 CT 6 ct 6 ct
Estimated Usage 500 each .99 x 500 .96 x 500
Extended Cost $495.00 $480.00
11. |2802-0000089-32 |BROWN & SERVE ROLLS. (HOLIDAY ITEM) 1.20 ea $6.40
12CT 6 ct 32ct
6.40=32ct
Estimated Usage (as needed)
Extended Cost $6.40 $2.28
12. |2840-90000Y4-79 |DOUGHNUT PKG. (NOT MINIATURE SIZE)
6 CT
Estimated Usage 50 pkgs
Extended Cost NO BID NO BID
13. |2802-10000Y8-04 |CINNAMON ROLL PKG. (NOT MINIATURE SIZE) 2.24 ea
6CT 8ct
Estimated Usage 50 pkgs
Extended Cost NO BID $2.24
14. |2802-10000Y8-04 |DANISH ROLL (ASSORTED) NOT MINIATURE SIZE
Each or pkg size
Estimated Usage 50 pkg
Extended Cost NO BID NO BID
Bid will be awarded to overall low bidder (Lump Sum) $16,031.93 $15,317.62
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