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Paper Bond

Item Description
Estimated 

Yearly Usage

Price per 

Case

Extended 

Cost

Price per 

Case

Weighted 

Price Local 

Preference

Extended 

Cost

Price per 

Case

Weighted 

Price Local 

Preference

Extended 

Cost

Price per 

Case

Extended 

Cost

Price per 

Case

Extended 

Cost

1
8 ½ x 11 Paper Bond White Letter 

Size 20#, 5,000 sheets per case
28,800 CS. $30.35 $874,080.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.75 $28.58 $799,200.00 $27.80 $800,640.00 $27.69 $797,472.00

2
8 ½ x 14 Paper Bond White Legal 

Size 20#, 5,000 sheet per case
6,000 CS. $46.75 $280,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $41.65 $42.90 $249,900.00 $39.85 $239,100.00 $43.77 $262,620.00

3
11 x 17 Paper Bond White 20#, 2,500 

sheets per case
600 CS. $39.85 $23,910.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.75 $33.73 $19,650.00 No Bid No Bid $34.41 $20,646.00

4
8 ½ x 11 Letter Size 25% Cotton 

Paper, 5,000 sheets per case
2,400 CS. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $102.00 $105.06 $244,800.00 No Bid No Bid $111.43 $267,432.00

NCR Paper

Item Description
Estimated 

Yearly Usage

Price per 

Case

Extended 

Cost

Price per 

Case

Weighted 

Price Local 

Preference

Extended 

Cost

Price per 

Case

Weighted 

Price Local 

Preference

Extended 

Cost

Price per 

Case

Extended 

Cost

Price per 

Case

Extended 

Cost

1

2-Part Carbonless 20#, 8 ½ x 11, 

Reverse Sequence (Canary/White), 

NCR, Imation or equal

960 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $68.00 $70.04 $65,280.00 No Bid No Bid $66.27 $63,619.20

2

3-Part Carbonless 20#, 8 ½ x 11, 

Reverse Sequence 

(Pink/Canary/White), NCR, Imation or 

equal

960 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $76.50 $78.80 $73,440.00 No Bid No Bid $74.63 $71,644.80

3

4-Part Carbonless 20#, 8 ½ x 11, 

Reverse Sequence 

(Goldenrod/Pink/Canary/White), NCR, 

Imation or equal

960 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $81.70 $84.15 $78,432.00 No Bid No Bid $79.76 $76,569.60

4

5-Part Carbonless, 20#, 8.5x11, 

Reverse Sequence 

(Green/Goldenrod/Pink/Canary/White)

, NCR, Imation or equal

960 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $84.05 $86.57 $80,688.00 No Bid No Bid $82.56 $79,257.60
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Item Description
Estimated 

Yearly Usage

Price per 

Case

Extended 

Cost
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Case
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Extended 

Cost
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Case
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Extended 

Cost
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Case
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Cost

Price per 

Case
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5

2-Part Carbonless, 20#, 8.5x11, 

Straight Sequence (Canary/White), 

NCR, Imation or equal

600 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $68.00 $70.04 $40,800.00 No Bid No Bid $66.27 $39,762.00

6

3-Part Carbonless, 20#, 8.5x11, 

Straight Sequence 

(Pink/Canary/White), NCR, Imation or 

equal

600 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $76.50 $78.80 $45,900.00 No Bid No Bid $74.63 $44,778.00

7

4-PartCarbonless, 20#, 8.5 x 11, 

Straight Sequence 

(Goldenrod/Pink/Canary/White), NCR, 

Imation or equal

600 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $81.70 $84.15 $49,020.00 No Bid No Bid $79.76 $47,856.00

Envelopes

Item Description
Estimated 

Yearly Usage

Price per 

Case

Extended 

Cost

Price per 

Case

Weighted 

Price Local 

Preference

Extended 

Cost

Price per 

Case

Weighted 

Price Local 

Preference

Extended 

Cost

Price per 

Case

Extended 

Cost

Price per 

Case

Extended 

Cost

1
#10 Envelope 24# Window, White, 

500/box, 2500 envelopes per case
7,500 BX $44.13 $66,195.00 $46.25 $47.64 $69,375.00 $38.88 $40.05 $58,200.00 No Bid No Bid $44.16 $66,225.00

2

#10 Envelope 24# Regular Plain, 

White, 500/box, 2500 envelopes per 

case

7,500 BX $39.56 $59,340.00 $39.25 $40.43 $58,875.00 $32.40 $33.37 $48,600.00 No Bid No Bid $38.18 $57,270.00

3
#9 Envelope 24# Window, White, 

500/box, 2500 envelopes per case
3,750 BX $41.56 $31,170.00 $46.25 $47.64 $34,687.50 $36.20 $37.29 $27,150.00 No Bid No Bid $44.16 $33,120.00

4

#9 Envelope 24# Regular Plain, 

White, 500/box, 2500 envelopes per 

case

3,750 BX $36.96 $27,720.00 $39.25 $40.43 $29,437.50 $30.40 $31.31 $22,800.00 No Bid No Bid $38.18 $28,635.00
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4/22/14 A.H
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