Bid #14-021
Tires for the County of El Paso
Opening Date: June 9, 2014

Bill Williams Tire Center

GCR Tires & Service

GVMI Inc. dba Napa Center El Paso,
SVN Auto Repair,

Socorro TX El Paso TX El Paso TX
Automobile Tires
Est.
No. | Annual Tire Size Brand |[Unit Price| Ext Price Brand | Unit Price | Ext Price Brand Unit Price | Ext Price
Use
1 8 215/60R16 Firestone | $75.00 $600.00 Firestone $77.50 $620.00 || Mastercraft $72.19 $577.52
2 8 P275/65R18 Firestone | $142.25 | $1,138.00 || Firestone | $128.68 $1,029.44 ||Mastercraft| $162.47 $1,299.76
3 12 LT245/75R16 || Firestone | $113.25 | $1,359.00 || Firestone | $110.11 $1,321.32 || Mastercraft | $105.73 $1,268.76
4 8 P205/65R15 Firestone | $69.00 $552.00 Firestone $71.01 $568.08 || Mastercraft $59.87 $478.96
5 12 P265/70R17 Firestone | $132.00 | $1,584.00 || Firestone | $112.82 $1,353.84 |[Mastercraft| $117.48 $1,409.76
6 16 P225/60R16 Firestone | $90.00 $1,440.00 || Firestone $85.32 $1,365.12 || Mastercraft $72.75 $1,164.00
7 36 LT245/75R17/E || Firestone | $122.50 | $4,410.00 || Firestone | $123.66 $4,451.76 ||Mastercraft| $135.56 $4,880.16
8 LT235/85/16/10 || Firestone | $112.50 $900.00 || Firestone | $114.80 $918.40 Firestone $138.40 $1,107.20
9 185/65R14 N/A N/A N/A Firestone $68.59 $548.72 Mitchelin $104.97 $839.76
10 12 P235/70R16 Firestone | $112.25 | $1,347.00 || Firestone $103.34 $1,240.08 || Firestone $106.24 $1,274.88
11 8 225/70R19.5 N/A N/A N/A Firestone | $243.64 $1,949.12 ||Roadmaster| $173.04 $1,384.32
Off Road Heavy Duty Tires
1 10 7.50-15/14 Akuret $129.17 | $1,291.70 || Carlisle $210.00 $2,100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 110 11R22.5/16 Cooper | $295.42 | $32,496.20 || Firestone | $379.33 | $41,726.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 42 11R24.5/16 Cooper | $328.57 | $13,799.94 || Firestone | $403.65 | $16,953.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 10 |o02412FRsG2RBSGG|  Solideal | $497.62 | $4,976.20 | Firestone | $595.35 | $5,953.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
5| 12 14-%‘1%‘;/}%5"" N/A N/A N/A Firestone | $804.51 | $9,654.12 || No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 2 13.6-24/8 N/A N/A N/A Firestone | $708.09 | $1,416.18 |[ No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 16.9-34/6 Akuret $532.36 | $1,064.72 || Firestone | $826.08 $1,652.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 17.5-25/12 Akuret $670.82 | $5,366.56 || Firestone | $706.23 $5,649.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 10 17.5-25/16 Akuret $692.32 | $6,923.20 || Firestone | $830.97 $8,309.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 4 18X8.50-8/4 Carlisle $74.79 $299.16 Carlisle $48.00 $192.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11 20.5-25/20 Akuret | $1,115.56| $8,924.48 || Firestone | $1,270.08 | $10,160.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 10 305/70D16.5/10 N/A N/A N/A Firestone | $238.63 $2,386.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid
13 10 7.50-14/14TT N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid
Trucks/Vans/ and Buses Tires
1 20 LT265/75R16 || Firestone | $127.00 | $2,540.00 || Firestone | $126.24 $2,524.80 || Mitchelin $232.97 $4,659.40
2 32 ST225/75R15/10 || Akuret $88.00 $2,816.00 || Carlisle $135.00 $4,320.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 16 LT225/75R16/10 || Firestone | $110.00 | $1,760.00 || Firestone $111.53 $1,784.48 Firestone $138.60 $2,217.60
4 20 LT245/75R17/10 || Firestone | $122.50 | $2,450.00 || Firestone $121.12 $2,422.40 ||BF Goodrich| $189.11 $3,782.20
5 12 LT265/70R17/10 || Firestone | $135.25 | $1,623.00 || Firestone | $134.18 $1,610.16 ||Bridgestone| $179.72 $2,156.64
6 8 195/60R15 Firestone | $62.98 $503.84 Firestone $78.43 $627.44 || Mastercraft $69.60 $556.80
Pursuit Tires
1 120 | 245-55R18 103W N/A N/A N/A Firestone | $123.43 | $14,811.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 120 |P265/60R17 108V|| Firestone | $115.25 | $13,830.00 || Firestone | $117.36 | $14,083.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 195 235/55R17 Firestone | $103.25 | $20,133.75 || Firestone $105.38 $20,549.10 || Mastercraft | $114.34 $22,296.30
4 180 | P225/60R16 97V || Firestone | $90.00 | $16,200.00 || Firestone $92.31 $16,615.80 || Mastercraft| $93.23 $16,781.40
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