
Bid 15-020 
Wrecker and Towing Services for the County of El Paso 

Opening Date:  Thursday, May 21, 2015

Sohle Express 
Towing Inc. 

El Paso, Texas 

Extreme Towing 
El Paso, Texas

Kamel Towing 
El Paso, Texas

Rod Robertson 
Enterprises, Inc. 

San Antonio, Texas

$ $ $ $ $
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1 Flat tow $38.95 $27.26 $81.00 $56.70 $80.00 $56.00 $81.00 $56.70 $81.00 $56.70 $79.00 $55.30 $80.00 $56.00 $25.00 $17.50 $80.00 $56.00

2 Tow with a dolly $17.50 $17.50 $45.00 $31.50 $80.00 $56.00 $45.00 $31.50 $20.00 $14.00 no bid no bid $30.00 $21.00 $5.00 $3.50 $25.00 $17.80

3 Wait time $.90/min $.90/min $70.00 $49.00 $20.00 $14.00 $80.00 $56.00 $40.00 $28.00 $80.00 $56.00 $91.00 $63.70 $20.00 $14.00 $80.00/hr $56.00

4 Work time $.90/min $.90/min $90.00 $63.00 $20.00 $14.00 $80.00 $56.00 $80.00 $56.00 $80.00 $56.00 $91.00 $63.70 $20.00 $14.00 $80.00/hr $56.00

5 Winch/Recovery $.90/min $.90/min $90.00 $63.00 $150.00 $105.00 $90.00 $63.00 $80.00 $56.00 $80.00 $56.00 $91.00 $63.70 $20.00 $14.00 $100.00/hr $70.00

6 Per loaded mile $1.65 $1.65$ $3.00 $2.10 $3.00$ $2.10 $2.50$ $1.75$ $1.25 $0.88$ $3.00 $2.10 $2.50 $1.75 $3.50 $2.45 $2.25 $1.58$ $ $ $ $ $ $ $

MEDIUM DUTY VEHICLES

1 Flat tow $65.00 $45.50 $350.00 $245.00 no bid no bid $350.00 $245.00 $250.00 $175.00 $95.00 $66.50 $180.00 $126.00 $75.00 $52.50 $350.00 $245.00

2 Wait time $.90/min $.90/min $90.00 $63.00 no bid no bid $80.00 $56.00 $150.00 $105.00 $65.00/hr $45.50/hr $91.00 $63.70 $30.00 $21.00 $150.00 $105.00

3 Work time $.90/min $.90/min $90.00 $63.00 no bid no bid $95.00 $66.50 $150.00 $105.00 $65.00/hr $45.50/hr $91.00 $63.70 $30.00 $21.00 $150.00 $105.00

4 Winch/recovery $.90/min $.90/min $90.00 $63.00 no bid no bid $95.00 $66.50 $150.00 $105.00 $65.00/hr $45.50/hr $91.00 $63.70 $30.00 $21.00 $200.00/hr $140.00

5 Per loaded mile $1.65 $1.65 $3.00 $2.10 no bid no bid $3.00 $2.10 $2.50 $1.75 $3.00 $2.10 $3.50 $2.45 $3.50 $2.45 $3.50 $2.45

HEAVY DUTY VEHICLES

1 Flat tow $175.00 $122.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $400.00 $280.00 $165.00/hr $115.50/hr no bid no bid $150.00 $105.00 no bid no bid

2 Wait time $1.75/min $1.75/min no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $200.00 $140.00 $105.00/hr $73.50/hr no bid no bid $50.00 $35.00 no bid no bid

3 Work time $1.75/min $1.75/min no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $400.00 $280.00 $105.00/hr $73.50/hr no bid no bid $50.00 $35.00 no bid no bid

4 Winch/recovery $1.75/min $1.75/min no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $400.00 $280.00 $105.00/hr $73.50/hr no bid no bid $50.00 $35.00 no bid no bid

5 Per loaded mile $1.75 $1.75 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $3.50 $2.45 $3.00 $2.10 no bid no bid $3.50 $2.45 no bid no bid

NOTE:  Sameis Holdings LLC dba Tow Texas did not provide a bid response but rather a "Instead" response.
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