Batteries Plus 442

El Paso, Texas

Bid #15-028

Automotive Batteries for the County of El Paso
Opening Date: Tuesday, July 30, 2015

Continental Battery
El Paso, Texas

GVMI Inc. dba Napa Center El Paso Sun Auto Repair

El Paso, Texas

[ P Additional P P Additional P P
Battery Cold Cranking | Warranty Brand Installation | Additional Fees I AEE WG (A1EE Warranty Installation LTt WG (A1EE I IAEE Warranty . diuces WG (A1EE WG (A1EE
No Group Size AMDpS i ) Name Part No. Fee ) 7 7 Brand Name| Part No. Fee Fees i ) Brand Name | Part No. [Installation Fee Fees
P p y P y (GELDIET (AGM/Dual y (specify) (Regular (AGM/Dual y (specify) (Regular (AGM/Dual
Battery) Purpose) Battery) Purpose) Battery) Purpose)
$118.08
$3.00 ) 2 yr free
1 34 B00Plus CCA | Duracell | 5L134M None $87.81 $240.24 3 Continental | 5478k | $10.00 $63.14 $132.00 | replacement |  NaPA 8434 | $14.95-$27.50 | Core $15.00 | $81.50 #0834
Minimum $12.00 no core 5L134AGMDD Battery 7 vi pro-rate $142.16
) yrp #N9934RED
. 6 yrs 3 mths .
Pl A . . | . NAPA
2 47 650 Plus CC no bid o bid 3 continental | 47.00cs | $10.00 $56.27 nobid | 1yr 6 mh free B | 7547 | s1495527.50 | corests.00 | ses.os nia
Minimum Battery 600CCA
replacement
. 6 yrs 3 mths
3 59 590 Plus CCA 15 Duracell | 5L159 None $3.00 $90.50 no bid 3 Continental | - ggg $10.00 $56.54 nobid |1yremthfree| NAPA 7559 | $14.95-$27.50 | Core $15.00 | $78.77 nia
Minimum $12.00 no core Battery
replacement
. 6 yrs 3 mths
750 Plus CCA $3.00 $174.16 Continental $144.29
4 65 Minimum 15 Duracell 5L165XM None $12.00 no core $92.50 5L165AGM 3 Battery 65CS $10.00 $64.05 $127.00 1yr 6 mth free NAPA 7565 $14.95-$27.50 | Core $15.00 $85.65 #9865
replacement
. 7yrs
690 Plus CCA $3.00 $150.79 Continental $139.34
5 75 Minimum 1.5 Duracell 5L175M None $12.00 no core $76.07 5L175DTAGA 3 Battery 75CP $10.00 $56.54 $119.00 2 yrs free NAPA 8475 $14.95-$27.50 | Core $15.00 $73.35 #N997525RED
replacement
. 7yrs
800 Plus CCA $3.00 . Continental NAPA $145.43
6 78DT Minimum 15 Duracell 5L134PTM None $12.00 no core $91.35 no bid 3 Battery 34/78CP $10.00 $63.14 $132.00 2yrs free 770CCA 843478 $14.95-$27.50 | Core $15.00 $87.11 #N993478RED
replacement
. 7yrs
$3.00 . Continental .
7 96R N/A 15 Duracell 5L196R None $92.81 no bid 3 96RCS $10.00 $59.00 no bid 2yrs free NAPA 8496R $14.95-$27.50 | Core $15.00 $87.05 n/a
$12.00 no core Battery
replacement
Continental 7yrs
8 96 N/A no bid no bid 3 Batter 96CS $10.00 $59.00 no bid 2yrs free NAPA 8496R $14.95-$27.50 | Core $15.00 $87.05 n/a
y replacement
2 yrs & 6 mths $192.02
750 Plus CCA $3.00 $216.53 Continental 1yr &6 mths #9837
9 H31A Minimum 15 Duracell 5L31PA None $12.00 no core $85.84 5L131PAGR 2 Battery HD31-A $10.00 $66.15 $187.00 free NAPA 7239 $14.95-$27.50 | Core $22.50 $79.94 $210.66
replacement #N9931AYEL
. 1yr
235 Plus CCA $3.00 : Continental NAPA Core
10 uUlL Minimum 15 Duracell 5L101A None $6.00 no core $35.58 no bid 1 Battery LIL-235 $10.00 $24.15 $52.00 3 mths free 230 CCA 8223 $14.95-$27.50 $7.50 $31.03 n/a
replacement
Unit Price Unit Price Additi i Unit Price Unit Price Additi | Unit Price Unit Price
. . - . itional itiona
No GBatte;y CoIdACrankmg Warranty irand part No. Instlezllatlon Addmona}i Fees Warranty Brand Name| Part No. Instillatlon Fees Warranty Brand Name | Part No. |installation Fee Fees
roup Size mps @inyrs) ame ee (specify) (Regular (AGM/Dual (in yrs) ee (specify) (Regular  (AGM/Dual @inyrs) [YPEPIN  (Regular  (AGM/Dual
Battery) Purpose) Battery) Purpose) Battery) Purpose)
. 2yrs 6 mths
1 Pl A . . | 413.11
1 40 000 Plus CC. no bid no bid 2 Continenta| 4D $10.00 $113.53 $325.00 6 mths free NAPA 7266 | $14.95-527.50 | Core $45.00 | $134.41 $413
Minimum Battery #8273
replacement
2yrs 6 mths $198.94
750 Plus CCA $3.00 $216.53 Continental 1yr 6mths #9833
12 HD31C Minimum 15 Duracell 5L315A None $18.00 no core $85.84 5L131AGM 2 Battery HD31-C $10.00 $66.15 $189.00 free NAPA 7238 $14.95-$27.50 | Core $22.50 $78.67 $210.66
replacement #N9931AYEL
$3.00 Continental 2yrs
13 GC110DT N/A 1 Duracell 5L66115 None . $106.92 no bid 1 2GL-110 $10.00 $79.00 $220.00 3 mths free NAPA 8144 $14.95-$27.50 | Core $22.50 $96.62 n/a
$18.00 no core Battery
replacement
. lyr
14 u1 285 Plus CCA 05 Duracell | 5L101HP None $3.00 $39.99 no bid 1 Continental | - 359 $10.00 $28.00 $52.00 3 mths free NAPA 8229 | $14.95-$27.50 core $36.82 nia
Minimum $6.00 no core Battery $7.50
replacement
. 7yrs
1000 Plus CCA . . Continental NAPA $145.43
15 34DT Minimum no bid no bid 3 Battery 34/78P $10.00 $63.14 $132.00 2yrs free 770 CCA 843478 $14.95-$27.50 | Core $15.00 $87.11 #N993478RED

replacement

1




O'Reilly Auto Enterprises LLC dba O'Reilly Auto Parts

Springfield, MO 65802

Approved By (Signature)

Approved By (Print)

Battery Gro Cold Crankin: Warrant Brand (RTHTIONEL Ui (e 30/? Lo Uil (it 30/(; oo
No S)i,ze up TS 'ng i yrs)y Name Part No. |Installation Fee| Fees AGIEEEE IPEEEmEE
(specify) (Regular (Regular (AGM/Dual Purpose) (AGM/Dual
Battery) Battery) Purpose)
1 34 800 Plus CCA 3 SUPEr | 3 jext nia $18.00 core |  $87.11 $89.72 nla nia
Minimum Start
5 47 650 F’l.us CCA no bid no bid no bid no bid
Minimum
3 59 590 Plus CCA 2 Super | g9 75 nia $18.00 core |  $83.27 $85.77 nia nla
Minimum Start
750 Pl A
4 65 50 Plus CC 3 Super | goext n/a $18.00 core | $97.80 $100.73 n/a n/a
Minimum Start
5 75 690 Plus CCA 3 Super | e oxt nia $18.00 core | $78.50 $80.86 nia nfa
Minimum Start
PI A
6 78DT 800 Plus CC 2 SUPEr 1 4/78PRM nia $18.00 core |  $101.81 $104.86 n/a nia
Minimum Start
Super
7 96R N/A 2 Start 96R72 n/a $18.00 core $88.97 $91.64 n/a n/a
8 96 N/A no bid no bid no bid no bid
750 PI A
9 H31A 50 Plus CC 1172 Super 51 4m n/a $22.00 core |  $83.68 $86.19 $192.37  AGM3IT $198.14
Minimum Start
235 Pl A AGMUL
10 UL S Plus CCA [ 5 onths | SUPET | LiLun nia $10.00 core | $44.60 $46.03 $93.50 GMU $96.31
Minimum Start $22.00 core]
0, 0,
Unit Price SOLOEEL Unit Price blLaez)
. Additional Preference Preference
Battery Group | Cold Cranking | Warranty Brand .
No Size AmDps 7 7 Name Part No. |Installation Fee| Fees
P b (specify) (Regular (Regular (AGM/Dual Purpose)  (AGM/DUa
Battery) Battery) Purpose)
11 40 1000 Plus CCA 1 Super 403 nia $22.00 core | $141.57 $145.82 $341.99  AGM4D $352.25
Minimum Start
750 PI A
12 HD31C 50 Plus CC 1172 Super 51 4 nia $22.00 core | $83.68 $86.19 $19237  AGM3IT |  $198.14
Minimum Start
13 GC110DT N/A 3 months S;Zir GC110DT nia $22.00 core |  $103.23 $106.33 | $171.19 Acmec2|  $176.33
AGMUL
14 U1 5P CCA | o onns | SUPeT [ g um nia $10.00 core | $44.60 $46.03 $93.50 core $96.31
Minimum Start
$22.00
15 34DT 1000 Plus CCA no bid no bid no bid no bid

Minimum

Date
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