
RFP # 15-034

As-Needed Hazardous Waste Disposal

 Services for the County of El Paso

Opening Date: August 20, 2015

Item Description

1
55 gallon metal pail containg various used  personal protection equipment (PPE) such as 

gloves, rags and coveralls contaminated with oil, asphalt emulsion

2 55 gallon DOT approved drum containing spent asphalt  emulsion

3 Waste oil and oil mixtures in 55 gallon drums

4
Waste oil and oil mixtures held in a holding tank.  Vendor shall empty the tank when it is 

75-100% full.

5
Waste Antifreeze / coolant held in a 255 gal. plastic holding tank.  Vendor shall empty 

the tank when it is 50-100% full

Item Description

1 Open top DOT approved 55 gallon drums with tops and sealing ringsfor shipping

2 5 gallon metal pails with crimp able lids

3 Containers for holding waste oil and oil mixture

4 Delivery fee per lot (if applicable)

5
Labels to be applied to drums and pails of hazardous material that properly identify 

contents of the applicable container

Item Description Unit Price Per-Unit Price

1 Non-Hazardour Waste Profile Analysis No Bid $950.00

2 Hazardous RCRA Waste Profile Analysis No Bid $1,250.00

3 Laborer with Level D PPE  (Personal protection equipment) No Bid $75.00

4 Laborer with Level C PPE (Personal protection equipment) No Bid $50.00

5 Truck and Operator for removal and transportation of hazardous waste No Bid $145.00

6 Truck and Operator for removal and transportation of universal waste No Bid $145.00

7 Truck and Operator for removal and transportation of non-hazardous waste No Bid $145.00

8 Trasportation fee (if applicable) No Bid $650.00

9 Fuel Surcharge (if applicable) No Bid $35.00

10 Load Verification Charge (if applicable) No Bid $125.00

LB 8/20/2015

$675.00 

No Bid

$165.00 

$45.00 

Per-Unit Price 

Per-Unit Price 

$425.00 

$375.00 

$350.00 

Adastra Ecological Services, Inc.                                                                                                                                                                             

El Paso, Tx.

______________________________

Recommendations:

______________________________

$995.00 

$150.00 

$2.25 
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