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# Description Qty Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Local  Pref Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Local  Pref Unit Price Total Price Local  Pref Unit Price Total Price Local  Pref

$1,076.55 

$189.00 (lLCD)

2b $53.26 3 yrs $1,065.20 $1,097.16 $78.00
3 yrs $1,560.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.72                                

3 yrs $1,514.40 $1,559.83

3 Hardened Ruggedized 
Notebook 16 $1,553.50 $24,856.00 $3,341.43 $53,462.88 $55,066.77 $1,685.00 $26,960.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,852.71 $45,643.36 $47,012.66 $2,340.00 $37,440.00 $38,563.20

3b $ 214.07 3 yrs $3,425.12 $3,527.87 No Bid No Bid No Bid

4b $ 217.27 3 yrs $10,428.96 $10,741.83 $86.00                                                       
3 yrs $4,128.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 23" Widescreen flat 
Paned IPS LED 44 $125.00 $5,500.00 $227.84 $10,024.96 $10,325.71 $155.00 $6,820.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $171.24 $7,534.56 $7,534.56 $116.00 $5,104.00 $5,257.12

5b $29.48 3 yrs $1,297.12 $1,336.03 No Bid No Bid No Bid

6b $ 169.47 3 yrs $11,862.90 $12,218.79 $129.00                                           
3 yrs $9,030.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 128.75 3 yrs $9,012.50 $9,282.88

7b $128.00                                    
3 yrs $3,840.00 $176.00 3 yrs $5,280.00 $5,438.40 $135.33                   

3 yrs $4,059.90 $4,181.70

$510,807.62 $722,875.16 $744,561.41 $506,710.00 $24,930.00 $25,677.90 $554,843.82 $571,489.13 $533,796.00 $549,809.88 

$45,879.39 $877.00 

$18,546.18 

3 yrs Full Warranty 

Full Warranty 

Full Warranty 

4
Microsoft Surface 
Pro                                    
3-12"

48

Full Warranty 

$17,260.00 No Bid2 Dell or HP Laptop - 
Standard 20 $1,021.00 $20,420.00 $1,235.62 $24,712.40 $25,453.77 $863.00 

GRAND TOTAL

Full Warranty 

7 Scanner 30 $699.00 $20,970.00 $770.00 $23,100.00 

1yr included

$136.23 5 yrs $54,492.00 $56,126.76

No Bid No Bid $867.77 $17,355.40 $17,876.06 $900.30 

1

1b

Dell or HP PC w/dual 
Moni. Sm. Form 
Facrtor Computer

400

En Pointe Technologies Sales LLC                                                                                                     
El Segundo, CA.

Checkpoint Services, Inc. 
El Paso, TX

CDW Government LLC.
Vernon Hills, IL

Decision Tree Inc. 
El Paso, TX 

$31.48                                             
5 yrs $12,592.00 $12,969.76$32.00                                                                  

5 yrs $12,800.00 

No Bid

Full Warranty 

$320.000.00

5 yrs included

$314,356.00

Document Imaging Specialists, LLC DBA Information 
Management Services                                                                                                                  

Columbus, OH.                   

Howard Technology Solutions                                                                                                 
Laurel, MS.                     

3 yrs included

$801.90$800.00 

No Bid

$54,192.00 No Bid No Bid

3 yrs included

No BidNo Bid$745.00 $298,000.00

No Bid

5 yrs included

3 yrs 

1 yr 

No Bid

$1,076.79 $51,685.92 $53,236.50 $1,129.00 

$430,620.00 $443,538.60 $763.00 $305,200.00 

$1,254.90 $60,235.20 $62,042.26 $1,357.00 $65,136.00 

$320,760.00 $330,382.80

3 yrs Included

$18,006.00 

No Bid

3 yrs included

1 yr 

$67,090.08

$24,870.00 
$655.00            
Includes                                                        

1 yr 
$19,650.00 

3 yrs 

3 yrs included

3 yrs included

$1,457.59 $69,964.32 

3 yrs Included3 yrs included 3 yrs included

No Bid No Bid

$20,239.50 $1,484.77 $44,543.10 

3 yrs $0.00 1 yr 

$47,250.00 $673.62 $47,153.40 $48,568.00No Bid

3 yrs 

$872.00 $61,040.00 $62,871.20

$23,793.00 $829.00 $26,310.00 $27,099.30

6
Laser Printer Black & 
White (Printer Laserjet 
M604dn)

70 $701.39 $49,097.30 $667.11 $46,697.70 $48,098.63 $675.00 

Full Warranty 
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$1,013.87 Lenovo 
L560 $20,277.48 $20,885.80

$979.50 Lenovo T460 $19,590.03 $20,177.73

2b $89.00 5 yrs $1,780.00 $1,833.40 $76.00                                         
3 yrs included $1,520.00 $1,565.60 $40,120.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

3
Hardened 
Ruggedized 
Notebook

16 $1,674.78 $26,796.48 $27,600.37 $1,934.01 $30,944.19 $31,872.52 $1,585.20 $25,363.26 $2,883.30 $46,132.80 $47,516.78 $1,355.00 $21,680.00 $22,330.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid

3b $80.00 3 + 2  yrs $1,280.00 $1,318.40 $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

$999.00 
tablet $47,952.00 $49,390.56

$129.00 
keybd $6,192.00 $6,377.76

4b No Bid No Bid No Bid $85.40                         
3 yrs $4,099.20 $4,222.18 $255.00 

3 yrs  $12,240.00 $12,607.20 $84.78 
3 yrs $4,069.44 $4,191.52

5 23" wide screen flat 
Paned IPS LED 44 $139.00 $6,116.00 $6,299.48 $134.39 $6,450.48 $6,643.99 $127.55 $5,612.20 $158.20 $6,960.80 $7,169.62 $167.00 $7,348.00 $7,568.44 $214.81 $9,451.64 $9,735.19

5b $70.00. 5yrs $3,080.00 $3,172.40 $0.00 $16.68 
3 yrs  $733.92 $755.94

$649.90 Oki                                             
B721DN $45,492.95 $46,857.74

$748.94 3  Oki 
B731DN $52,425.84 $53,998.62

6b $106.00 5 yrs $7,420.00 $7,642.60 $155.10 
3 yrs $10,857.00 $11,182.71 $158.00  

3 yrs $11,060.60 $11,392.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid

$636.54   Epson DS-
760 $19,096.20 $19,669.09

$795.70  Canon DR-
M10II $23,870.92 $24,587.05

7b $429.00 3 yrs $12,870.00 $13,256.10 $161.50 3 yrs $4,845.00 $4,990.35

$492,807.78 $507,592.01 $498,672.53 $612,396.11 $516,478.42 $493,452.20 $508,255.77 $533,935.42 $549,953.48 $83,572.70 $86,079.88 

20 $1,330.00 2 Dell or HP Laptop - 
Standard 

Full Warranty 

No Bid

3 yrs

3 yrs

3 yrs

3 yrs

3 yrs

Epson - 2 yrs /  Canon - 1 yr

$57,488.04

$26,068.17$21,428.40 $34,506.00 $843.63 $25,308.90 

$46,085.00

 3 yrs 

 3 yrs 

$44,742.72 $66,072.96 $55,813.63 $1,162.78 

1 yr Included

3 yrs included

$23,030.80 No Bid

No Bid$284,650.80

SHI Government Solutions                                                                                       
Austin, TX.

$21,374.60 $532.10 $10,642.00

$1,125.80 

Full Warranty 

4
Microsoft Surface 
Pro                                    
3-12"

48 $1,376.52 

$26,600.00 $27,398.00 $1,068.73 No Bid

Zones, Inc.                                           
Auburn, WA 

No Bid

No Bid

$690.90 

No Bid No Bid

Synergy Electronics, Inc.                                                                                                                 
Kingsland TX.

Spectrum Technologies                                                     
El Paso, TX.

$82.00 5 yrs 5 yrs  Included

$330,215.53

5 yrs

Netsync Network Solutions
El Paso, TX

$320,597.60 

$32,800.00 

$345,600.001
Dell or HP PC w/dual 
Monitor Sm. Form 
Factor Computer

400

Lin-Cum, Inc. (LCI)                                                                                                             
Phoenix, AZ

$33,784.00

$801.49 

$39,211.596
Laser Printer Black & 
White (Printer 
Laserjet M604dn)

No Bid

No Bid No Bid $932.14 $55,659.55$54,038.40 

$0.00  5yrs    

$22,360.00$10,961.26 $1,118.00

No Bid

$38,069.50

Full Warranty 

Full Warranty $0.00 3 yrs 

5 yrs  Included

3 yrs Included

3 yrs Included

3 yrs Included

$733.60 $280,000.00 $288,400.00

3 yrs included

5 yrs  Included

 3 yrs

$816.32 $864.00 $355,968.00$276,360.00 $326,528.00 

3 yrs  Included

1b Full Warranty 

$43,491.00

GRAND TOTAL

7 Scanner 30 $1,388.80 $41,664.00 $42,913.92 $714.28 

Full Warranty 

LB 2/1/16 
Revised 4/7/2016

No Bid No Bid No Bid70 $854.59 $59,821.30 $61,615.94 $715.70 $50,099.00 $621.30 $44,795.73 $543.85

3 yrs  IncludedFull Warranty 

$1,150.20 $35,541.18 $690.00 $20,700.00 $21,321.00
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