Bid# 16-071
Alcohol, Drug Testing Supplies and
Laboratory Services for the County of El Paso

Opening Date: February 28, 2017

Avertest LLC
Richmond, VA.

Lighthouse For The
Blind of Fort Worth
Fort Worth, TX.

Micro Distributing
Belton, TX.

Phamatech, Inc.
San Diego, CA.

Redwood Toxicology
Santa Rosa, CA.

Drug Testing Supplies

Description

Cost per 100

Cost per 100

Cost per 100

Cost per 100

Cost per 100

Multi-Panel Integrated Cups

$239.00 - 6 drug panel w/3 test

$225.00 - 6 drug Rapid Test Cup

L No Bid $325.00 $277.00 Six panel . . (See pricing schedule for additional drugs
(minimum 6 drug panel) adulteration strip & combinations) $2.25 each
$321.00 10 panel
w/adulterant .
Multi-Panel Integrated Cups 10-15 . $370.00 12 panel  |$289.00 - 10 drug panel w/3 test | 2220-00 - 6 drug Rapid Test Cup
No Bid $593.75 . . (See pricing schedule for additional drugs
panel w/adulterant adulteration strip & combinations) $2.50 each
$436.00 14 panel '
w/adulterant
Oral Cube Oral fluid $450. 00 -5 |$450.00 - 5 or 6 drug screen oral
. . drug panel (Not FDA approved) fluid device (See pricing schedule for
Oral Swabs Kits No Bid $625.00 $352.00 Oratect Oral Fluid $875.00 - 6 drug |additional drugs & combinations) $4.50
panel (FDA approved) each
Laboratory Services

Description

Cost per person/visit

Cost per person/visit

Cost per person/visit

Cost per person/visit

Cost per person/visit

Screening per Specimen not per

$7.80 / panel - all but Collections
$13.50 / panel 9-hrs / day Collections at

Standard lab - One drug - $4.95
Standard lab panel - up to 6 drugs -

$5.25 - Standard 8 drug lab panel
screen only. This fee covers the cost of

. El Paso Facility No Bid No Bid $6.25 a singel test for all the drugs listed.
Drug & for Alcohol (etg testing) $18.00 / panel panel 9-hrs / day Standard labpPanel - up to 10 Confrirmation will be run on a "Per Drug"
Collections at Avertest PCS drugs - $7.25 basis by request
Hair Follicle testing $145.00 / panel No Bid No Bid $45.00 5 drug panel $65.00
On-site collection fee ;Egl\fged in 2nd and 3rd pricing options No Bid No Bid $20.00 No Bid
) . . . Confirmation allowance up to 15 % of . .
Confirmation of specimen service samples, thereafter $19.95 / test No Bid No Bid $8.75 $9.50 per drug
Expert Witness Testimony $750.00 / 2-day session No Bid No Bid No charge $350.00 / per day + travel
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