
Bid 19-013

As-Needed Base Course Material for the County of El Paso

Opening Date:  Thursday, February 07, 2019

Item Description Units Regular Recycled Regular Recycled Regular Recycled Regular Recycled

1 Base Course Material (Complete) tons $10.03 No Bid $4.90 $4.95 $8.10 $8.10 $7.95 $11.00

1A Base Course Material (Material Only) tons $6.50 No Bid $3.90 $3.95 $6.25 $6.25 $3.95 $7.00

1B Montana Yard (Delivery Only) tons $3.53 No Bid $1.00 $1.00 $1.85 $1.85 $4.00 $4.00

2 Base Course Material (Complete) tons $10.03 No Bid $4.90 $4.95 $8.10 $8.10 $7.95 $11.00

2A Base Course (Material Only) tons $6.50 No Bid $3.90 $3.95 $6.25 $6.25 $3.95 $7.00

2B Bradly Yard (Delivery Only) tons $3.53 No Bid $1.00 $1.00 $1.85 $1.85 $4.00 $4.00

3 Base Course Material (Complete) tons $10.03 No Bid $6.65 $6.70 $7.25 $11.25 $10.70 $13.75

3A Base Course (Material Only) tons $6.50 No Bid $3.90 $3.95 $6.25 $6.25 $3.95 $7.00

3B Canutillo Yard (Delivery Oly) tons $3.53 No Bid $2.75 $2.75 $1.00 $5.00 $6.75 $6.75

4 Base Course Material (Complete) tons $13.60 No Bid $9.65 $9.70 $11.05 $11.05 $9.20 $12.25

4A Base Course Material (Material Only) tons $6.50 No Bid $3.90 $3.95 $6.25 $6.25 $3.95 $7.00

4B Fabens Yard (Delivery Only) tons $7.10 No Bid $5.75 $5.75 $4.80 $4.80 $5.25 $5.25

5 Base Course Material (Complete) tons $11.17 No Bid $6.90 $6.95 $9.95 $9.95 $8.45 $11.50

5A Base Course (Material Only) tons $6.50 No Bid $3.90 $3.95 $6.25 $6.25 $3.95 $7.00

5 El Rosario (Delivery Only) tons $4.67 No Bid $3.00 $3.00 $3.30 $3.30 $4.50 $4.50

Approved By (Signature) Approved By (Print)

Recommendation Date BG2/08/2019

Mini-Concrete Materials

El Paso, TX

Montana Warehouse-Bradley Yard

Canutillo Warehouse

Fabens Warehouse

Horizon Warehouse

GCC Sun City Materials, 

LLC

El Paso, TX

Montana Warehouse-Montna Yard

Hueco Quarry, Inc, dba

MTI Matrials

El Paso, TX

Jobe Materials, LP

El Paso, TX


