Bid 19-026
Lubricants (Qils, Grease and Antifreeze)
and Cleaners for the County of El Paso
Opening Date: Thursday, June 27, 2019

MJ Mader Enterprises Inc.

C & R Distributing LLC dba Bio Dyne Chemical Co. Wofford Truck Parts
El Paso, TX El Paso, TX
El Paso, TX
Description Unit Cost Extended Unit Cost Delivery Unit Cost Unit Cost Delivery Unit Cost Unit Cost Delivery
Item (Meets or exceeds) Est. Annual Qty (per gallon) Cost (per 55 gallon drum) (in days) (per gallon) Extended Cost (per 55 gallon drum) (in days) (per gallon) Extended Cost (per 55 gallon drum) (in days)
oILS
1 |5W-20 Engine Oil, Synthetic 500 Gallons Bulk $8.75 $4,375.00 1 $7.60 $3,800.00 1 $7.55 $3,775.00 $415.25 1
2 |5W-30 Engine Oil, Full Synthetic 330 Gallons/55 Gallon Drums $9.10 $3,003.00 1 $451.00 1 $10.41 $3,435.30 $572.55 1
3 |10W-30 Engine Oil, Full Synthetic | 330 Gallons/55 Gallon Drums $9.05 $2,986.50 $497.75 1 $451.00 1 $15.18 $5,009.40 $834.90 1
4 ;5A/4E°W Engine Oil, Delo, 400 LE {110 Gallons/55 Gallon Drums | $6.55 §72050 | $360.25 1 $660.00 1 $12.41 $1,365.10 $682.00 1
5 gﬁ\E 15W-40 Diesel Full Synthetic 750 Gallons Bulk $11.95 $8,962.50 1 $7.00 $5,250.00 1 $12.29 $9,217.50 $675.95 1
6 g:n:ts;tﬁ,ﬁleoat and JohnDeere | 5> Gallons/s5 Gallon Drums |~ $845 | $1,85000 |  s464.75 1 $410.00 1 $9.74 $2,142.80 $535.70 1
DEF Diesel Exhaust Fluid API
7 |Certified and meets 1S022241 330 Gallon Tote $0.95 $313.50 1 $1.46 $481.65 1 $2.61 $861.30 $143.55 1
Specifications
8  |Multi-Purpose ATF 165 Gallons /55 Gallon Drums $8.90 $1,468.50 $489.50 1 $373.00 1 $12.70 $2,095.50 $698.50 1
9 “F’:Elrgm V. Automatic Transmission 55 Gallon/Drums $18.20 $1,001.00 1 $475.00 1 $13.25 $728.75 $728.75 1
Automatic Transmission Fluid,
10 Dextron VI, Full Synthetic 55 Gallons/Drums $16.60 $913.00 1 $475.00 1 $13.13 $722.15 $722.15 1
Automatic Transmission Fluid,
11 |Dextron IIl, Mercon, Allison C4, 110 Gallons/55 Gallon Drums $5.45 $599.50 1 $475.00 1 $13.25 $1,457.50 $728.75 1
Multi-Vehicle
12 |Rozek 46 Hydraulic Oil AW65 450 Gallons Bulk $4.75 $2,137.50 1 $4.65 $2,092.00 1 $9.22 $4,149.00 $507.10 1
Hydraulic Qil, John Deere, J20C/D,
13 HYD/Transmission Fluid 10 Gallons $8.65 $86.50 1 $9.00 $90.00 1 $10.41 $104.10 $572.55 1
14 |80W-90 Multi Gear Qil 165 Gallons/55 Gallon Drums $10.35 $1,707.75 $569.25 1 $395.00 1 $3.96 $653.40 $217.80 1
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El Paso, TX
Description Unit Cost Extended Unit Cost Delivery Unit Cost Unit Cost Delivery Unit Cost Unit Cost Delivery
Item Est. Annual Qty. xce:ste Extended Cost Extended Cost
(Meets or exceeds) (per gallon) (per 55 gallon drum) (in days) (per gallon) (per 55 gallon drum) (in days) (per gallon) (per 55 gallon drum) (in days)
15 |75W-90 Synthetic Gear Oil 165 Gallons/55 Gallon Drums $16.70 $2,755.50 $918.50 1 $825.00 1 $7.31 $1,206.15 $402.05 1
16  |Gear Qil 75-140 Synthetic 55 Gallons/55 Gallon Drums $20.30 $1,116.50 1 $925.00 1 $10.46 $575.30 $575.30 1
17 IR & O Turbine Qil 110 Gallons/55 Gallon Drums $8.55 $940.50 $470.25 1 $405.00 1 $10.61 $1,167.10 $583.55 1
18  |15W-40 SAE Premium Blue 55 Gallons/55 Gallon Drums $6.95 $382.25 1 $600.00 1 $12.42 $683.10 $683.10 1
19 [15W40 SAE Shell Rotella 165 Gallons/55 Gallon Drums $6.95 $1,146.75 $382.25 1 $690.00 1 $10.84 $1,788.60 $596.20 1
ANTIFREEZE
Description Unit Cost Extended Unit Cost Delivery Unit Cost Unit Cost Delivery Unit Cost Unit Cost Delivery
Item Est. Annual Qty. xce:ste Extended Cost Extended Cost
(Meets or exceeds) (per gallon) (per 55 gallon drum) (in days) (per gallon) (per 55 gallon drum) (in days) (per gallon) (per 55 gallon drum) (in days)
1 [Pre-Diluted S0/50 Ethanol, Green | o v 106 Delivered in Bulk | $4.30 $1,096.50 1 $4.20 $1,071.00 1 $5.56 $1,417.80 $305.80 1
Antifreeze Gallon Container
2 gg)f’_()cz:"j”“ted' Extended Life, | 555 Gallons/55 Gallon Drums |~ $5.75 $146625 | $316.25 1 $385.00 1 $6.25 $1,593.75 $343.75 1
All Makes & Models, 50/50 Pre-
3 |Diluted 5 Year,1500,000 Miles 110 Gallons/55 Gallon Drums $4.70 $517.00 $258.50 1 $577.50 1 $5.77 $634.70 $317.35 1
Protection
4 |Estimated Life Heavy Duty 330 Gallons/55 Gallon Drums $9.25 $3,052.00 $508.75 1 $387.75 1 $8.25 $2,722.50 $467.50 1
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Description Unit Cost Extended Unit Cost Delivery Unit Cost Unit Cost Delivery Unit Cost Unit Cost Delivery
Item Est. Annual Qty. xce n te Extended Cost Extended Cost
(Meets or exceeds) (per gallon) 0s (per 55 gallon drum) (in days) (per gallon) (per 55 gallon drum) (in days) (per gallon) (per 55 gallon drum) (in days)
1 m';' Blue Lithium Grease High 3,150 LBS/210 Ib. Keg $2.50 $7,875.00 1 $275.00 1 $2.41 $7,591.50 $132.55 1
Degreaser, Heavy Duty Industrial
2 . 55 Gallons/55 Gallon Drums $6.40 $352.00 1 $295.00 1 $11.37 $625.35 $625.35 1
Automotive
Wash & Wax Automotive Car Wash
3 Concentrated Cleaner Soap 55 Gallons/55 Gallon Drums $10.16 $558.80 1 $500.00 1 $12.57 $691.35 $691.35 1
4 |Brake Parts Cleaner, Non- Chlorine [110 Gallons/55 Gallon Drums $11.95 $1,314.50 $657.25 1 $550.00 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Approved By (Signature) Aproved By (Print)
Recommedation Date
BG7/9/2019
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