Bid 20-006

Tires for the County of El Paso
Opening Date: Thursday December 12, 2019

American Tire Distributors

Border Parts Group, Inc.

Border Recapping LLC.

Broadway Motors

The Goodyear Tire & Rubber

Southern Tire Mart, LLC

Tire Connection

Fort Worth, TX dba NAPA dba Border Tire dba Bill Williams Tires Company Columbia, MS El Paso, TX
' El Paso, TX El Paso, TX El Paso, TX Akron, OH ' '
Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture
Group 1: Automobile

1 185/65R14 $53.67 GENERAL $61.04 COOPER $48.01 HANDKOOK $60.73 FIRESTONE $49.56 GOODYEAR $62.00 FIRESTONE $47.00 HERCULES
2 195/60R15 $60.10 GENERAL $68.89 COOPER $59.25 BF GOODRICH $66.04 FIRESTONE $49.00 GOODYEAR $57.00 FIRESTONE $49.75 HERCULES
3 205/65R15 $63.82 GENERAL $74.93 COOPER $63.20 BF GOODRICH $68.72 FIRESTONE $56.64 GOODYEAR $62.00 FIRESTONE $59.00 HERCULES
4 215/75R15 $63.21 IRONMAN $70.25 COOPER $61.85 HANDKOOK $77.64 COOPER $67.27 GOODYEAR $85.00 FIRESTONE $63.40 HERCULES
5 LT235/75R15 $99.43 GENERAL $125.18 COOPER $113.07 HANDKOOK $137.36 COOPER $128.49 GOODYEAR $117.00 FIRESTONE $105.60 HERCULES
6 P205/65R15 $63.82 GENERAL NOBID NOBID $62.02 HANDKOOK $68.72 FIRESTONE $72.45 GOODYEAR $62.00 FIRESTONE $58.48 HERCULES
7 ST225/75R15/10 $73.41 STC NO BID NO BID $69.08 NATIONAL $73.74 SUPER CARGO $104.00 GOODYEAR $61.00 DYNATRAIL $75.25 HERCULES
8 205/60R16 §72.72 GENERAL $85.30 COOPER $68.32 HANDKOOK $65.21 FIRESTONE $65.85 GOODYEAR $73.00 FIRESTONE $61.25 HERCULES
9 215/60R16 $76.92 GENERAL $85.28 COOPER $7347 BF GOODRICH $79.80 FIRESTONE $65.85 GOODYEAR $81.00 FIRESTONE $63.40 HERCULES
10 LT225/75R16/10 $98.91 GENERAL $132.88 COOPER $123.63 HANDKOOK $118.89 FIRESTONE $115.98 GOODYEAR $115.00 FIRESTONE $101.80 HERCULES
1" LT235/85/16/10 $112.30 GENERAL $143.16 COOPER $127.19 BF GOODRICH $124.75 FIRESTONE $131.67 GOODYEAR $118.00 FIRESTONE $115.64 HERCULES
12 LT245/75R16 $106.86 GENERAL NO BID NO BID $127.19 BF GOODRICH $114.50 FIRESTONE $120.00 GOODYEAR $111.00 FIRESTONE $97.50 HERCULES
13 LT245/75R16/10 $106.86 GENERAL $146.44 COOPER $127.19 BF GOODRICH $114.50 FIRESTONE $127.67 GOODYEAR $111.00 FIRESTONE $109.80 HERCULES
14 LT265/75R16 $121.94 GENERAL $154.30 COOPER $137.46 BF GOODRICH $143.97 FIRESTONE $139.00 GOODYEAR $130.00 FIRESTONE $107.85 HERCULES
15 P225/60R16 $77.42 GENERAL $91.83 COOPER $72.25 HANDKOOK $80.34 FIRESTONE $63.00 GOODYEAR $77.00 FIRESTONE $62.45 HERCULES
16 P235/70R16 $86.81 GENERAL $106.37 COOPER $94.01 BF GOODRICH $99.93 FIRESTONE $74.35 GOODYEAR $97.00 FIRESTONE $79.80 HERCULES
17 P235/70R16 $86.81 GENERAL $106.37 COOPER $94.01 BF GOODRICH $99.93 FIRESTONE $93.81 GOODYEAR $97.00 FIRESTONE $79.80 HERCULES
18 ST235/80R16 $88.52 STC $147.63 GOODYEAR $71.14 NATIONAL $88.60 SPECIALTY TIRE $135.21 GOODYEAR $59.00 TASKMASTER $104.45 HERCULES
19 215/7517.5 $123.69 DYNATRAC $435.97 MICHELIN $175.24 HANDKOOK $199.58 COOPER $215.00 GOODYEAR $231.00 BRIDGESTONE $148.10 HERCULES
20 215/60R17 $88.06 GENERAL $105.07 COOPER $82.98 HANDKOOK $119.41 FIRESTONE $74.35 GOODYEAR $90.00 FIRESTONE $84.05 BF GOODRICH
21 235/70R17 $106.11 GENERAL NO BID NO BID $118.53 HANDKOOK $108.89 FIRESTONE $119.50 GOODYEAR $106.00 FIRESTONE $119.45 HERCULES
22 235/T5R17 $118.23 GENERAL NO BID NO BID $130.95 MICHELIN NO BID NO BID $128.06 GOODYEAR $117.00 FIRESTONE $132.80 COOPER
23 LT235/80R17 $116.11 GENERAL $165.63 COOPER $148.52 BF GOODRICH $128.27 FIRESTONE $145.65 GOODYEAR $123.00 FIRESTONE $136.00 HERCULES
24 LT245/70R17 $118.21 GENERAL $161.64 COOPER $135.09 BF GOODRICH $125.97 FIRESTONE $137.41 GOODYEAR $122.00 FIRESTONE $103.10 HERCULES
25 LT245/75R17/10 $121.25 GENERAL $166.06 COOPER $153.26 BF GOODRICH $129.64 FIRESTONE $130.00 GOODYEAR $125.00 FIRESTONE $124.85 HERCULES
26 LT245/75R17/E $121.25 GENERAL $166.06 COOPER $153.26 BF GOODRICH $129.64 FIRESTONE $141.85 GOODYEAR $125.00 FIRESTONE $124.85 HERCULES
27 255/70R17 $112.79 GENERAL $165.23 BFG $177.75 BF GOODRICH $118.59 FIRESTONE $136.58 GOODYEAR $116.00 FIRESTONE $127.80 HERCULES
28 LT265/70R17/10 $131.31 GENERAL $173.80 COOPER $160.77 HANDKOOK $142.88 FIRESTONE $135.00 GOODYEAR $139.00 FIRESTONE $134.40 HERCULES
29 P225/55R17 $93.50 GENERAL $113.59 COOPER $86.26 UNIROYAL $86.31 FIRESTONE $80.00 GOODYEAR $92.00 FIRESTONE $75.10 HERCULES
30 225/65R17 $91.89 GENERAL $108.71 COOPER $91.39 UNIROYAL $88.24 FIRESTONE $76.00 GOODYEAR $85.00 FIRESTONE $82.40 HERCULES
31 P235/75R17 $115.76 GENERAL NO BID NO BID $130.95 MICHELIN $149.53 COOPER $134.52 GOODYEAR $112.00 FIRESTONE $137.40 COOPER




Bid 20-006
Tires for the County of El Paso
Opening Date: Thursday December 12, 2019

American Tire Distributors

Border Parts Group, Inc.

Border Recapping LLC.

Broadway Motors

The Goodyear Tire & Rubber

Southern Tire Mart, LLC

Tire Connection

Fort Worth, TX dba NAPA dba Border Tire dba Bill Williams Tires Company Columbia, MS El Paso, TX
' El Paso, TX El Paso, X El Paso, X Akron, OH ' '
Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture
32 P255/70R17 $112.79 GENERAL $148.58 COOPER $133.78 HANDKOOK $118.59 FIRESTONE $125.18 GOODYEAR $116.00 FIRESTONE $127.00 HERCULES
33 P265/70R17 $110.07 GENERAL $138.15 COOPER $125.32 HANDKOOK $117.36 FIRESTONE $135.00 GOODYEAR $118.00 FIRESTONE $99.95 HERCULES
34 P255/65R17 $116.75 GENERAL NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID $109.87 FIRESTONE NOBID GOODYEAR $110.00 FIRESTONE NO BID NO BID
35 P275/65R18 $128.37 GENERAL $160.20 COOPER $160.05 HANDKOOK $129.77 FIRESTONE $172.23 GOODYEAR $127.00 FIRESTONE $149.80 BF GOODRICH
36 225/70R19.5 $154.36 IRONMAN $281.24 BFG $200.00 UNIROYAL $231.00 BF GOODRICH $225.00 GOODYEAR $262.00 FIRESTONE $179.90 HERCULES
37 P275/55R20 $127.88 GENERAL $143.01 COOPER $136.72 HANDKOOK $123.00 FIRESTONE $118.04 GOODYEAR $121.00 FIRESTONE $124.80 UNIROYAL
Group 2: Off Road Tires-Heavy Duty Tires

1 7.50-15/14 NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID $121.00 POWERKING $137.75 SPECIALTY TIRE NO BID NOBID $125.00 AG DURA $149.00 CARLISLE
2 11R22.5/16 §327.00 FIRESTONE NOBID NOBID $275.00 BF GOODRICH $280.00 BF GOODRICH $260.00 GOODYEAR $265.00 YOKOHAMA $297.85 UNIROYAL
3 11R24.5/16 $355.44 FIRESTONE NO BID NO BID $338.15 BF GOODRICH $338.40 BF GOODRICH $280.00 GOODYEAR $275.00 YOKOHAMA $319.78 UNIROYAL
4 14.00-24/12 $514.80 FIRESTONE NOBID NOBID $369.13 POWERKING $508.15 TITAN $425.00 GOODYEAR $520.00 FIRESTONE $529.90 HERCULES
5 245[T5R/22.5 $315.00 BIDGESTONE NOBID NOBID $241.50 SUMITOMO $345.00 TOYO $350.00 GOODYEAR $315.00 BRIDGESTONE $297.45 TOYO

6 13.00-24TG 16 PLY $445.50 FIRESTONE NOBID NOBID $508.00 HERCULES $419.00 BKT $420.00 GOODYEAR $450.00 FIRESTONE $457.45 CARLISLE
7 11.00-20NHS NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID $390.00 DEESTONE NO BID NO BID $580.00 BRIDGESTONE $580.00 BKT

8 FRS G2 RB SGG NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID $563.25 FIRESTONE NOBID NO BID $450.00 FIRESTONE NO BID NO BID

9 14.00-24/112 $514.80 FIRESTONE NOBID NOBID $508.00 HERCULES $508.15 TITAN $425.00 GOODYEAR $520.00 FIRESTONE $640.00 HERCULES
10 BW G4 RBDT NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID $957.77 FIRESTONE NOBID NO BID $817.00 FIRESTONE NO BID NO BID
1 13.6-24/8 $310.13 FIRESTONE NOBID NOBID $308.91 FIRESTONE $302.50 BKT NOBID NO BID $310.00 FIRESTONE $340.80 FIRESTONE
12 16.9-34/6 NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID $445.97 SAMPSON $985.00 FIRESTONE NO BID NO BID $425.00 CARLISLE $560.55 CARLISLE
13 17.5-25/12 $569.25 FIRESTONE NOBID NOBID $454.00 POWER KING $563.00 BKT $625.00 GOODYEAR $575.00 FIRESTONE $702.00 HERCULES
14 17.5-25/16 $630.56 FIRESTONE NO BID NO BID $489.00 POWERKING $626.00 BKT $700.00 GOODYEAR $636.00 FIRESTONE $581.00 SAMSON
15 18X8.50-8/4 $41.80 CARLISLE NO BID NOBID $32.00 POWER KING $75.00 BKT NOBID NO BID $26.00 OTR ENGINEER $43.00 CARLISLE
16 20.5-25/20 $1,118.71 FIRESTONE NO BID NO BID $630.00 POWERKING $2,824.44 TITAN L5 $1,463.00 GOODYEAR $1,130.00 FIRESTONE $1,368.00 ARMOUR
17 305/70D16.5/10 $132.30 FIRESTONE NOBID NOBID $340.00 FIRESTONE $282.00 FIRESTONE NOBID NO BID $154.00 FIRESTONE $169.00 HERCULES
18 7.50-1414TT NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID $169.00 SOLAIR $86.25 SPECIALTY TIRE NO BID NOBID $40.00 TASK MASTER NO BID NO BID
19 10.00-16/8tt f2 3 rib $150.15 FIRESTONE NOBID NOBID $138.00 HARVEST KING $150.15 FIRESTONE NOBID NO BID $161.00 FIRESTONE NO BID NO BID
20 11L-15/10 $113.96 FIRESTONE NO BID NO BID $106.00 HARVEST KING $153.00 BKT $151.00 TITAN TIRE $113.00 FIRESTONE $138.58 HERCULES
21 11L-16/10 $130.00 FIRESTONE NOBID NOBID $139.00 HERCULES $130.00 BKT $159.00 TITAN TIRE $130.00 FIRESTONE $138.58 HERCULES
22 18x9.50x 8 $39.87 CARLISLE NOBID NO BID $33.00 NAN KANG $60.00 BKT NO BID NOBID $25.00 OTR ENGINEER $49.00 CARLISLE




Bid 20-006
Tires for the County of El Paso
Opening Date: Thursday December 12, 2019

American Tire Distributors

Border Parts Group, Inc.

Border Recapping LLC.

Broadway Motors

The Goodyear Tire & Rubber

Southern Tire Mart, LLC

Tire Connection

Fort Worth, TX dba NAPA dba Border Tire dba Bill Williams Tires Company Columbia, MS El Paso. TX
' El Paso, TX El Paso, TX El Paso, TX Akron, OH : :
Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture
Group 3: Trucks / Vans / Buses
1 LT265/75R16 $121.94 GENERAL NO BID NO BID $137.36 BF GOODRICH $137.75 FIRESTONE $139.00 GOODYEAR $130.00 FIRESTONE $107.85 HERCULES
2 ST225/75R15/10 $75.98 STC NO BID NO BID $75.00 NATIONAL $73.74 SPECIALTY TIRE $104.00 GOODYEAR $61.00 DYNATRAIL $78.80 HERCULES
3 LT225/75R16/10 $107.07 GENERAL NOBID NO BID $123.63 NATIONAL $118.89 FIRESTONE $134.62 GOODYEAR $115.00 FIRESTONE $105.43 HERCULES
4 LT245/75R17/10 $131.25 GENERAL NO BID NO BID $153.26 BF GOODRICH $120.58 FIRESTONE $130.00 GOODYEAR $125.00 FIRESTONE $134.25 HERCULES
5 LT265/70R17/10 $142.14 GENERAL NO BID NO BID $162.74 BF GOODRICH $142.88 FIRESTONE $135.00 GOODYEAR $139.00 FIRESTONE $134.40 HERCULES
6 195/60R15 $60.10 GENERAL NO BID NO BID $59.25 BF GOODRICH $66.04 FIRESTONE $60.41 GOODYEAR $57.00 FIRESTONE $49.75 HERCULES
7 P235/75/R17 $118.23 GENERAL NO BID NO BID $130.95 MICHELIN $114.62 FIRESTONE $134.52 GOODYEAR $112.00 FIRESTONE $137.40 COOPER
8 LT225/75/R17 NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID $123.63 HANKOOK $118.69 FIRESTONE NO BID NOBID $112.00 FIRESTONE $155.00 COOPER
9 P235/70/R17 $86.81 GENERAL NOBID NOBID $140.00 HANKOOK $106.02 FIRESTONE $133.24 GOODYEAR $106.00 FIRESTONE $121.80 HERCULES
10 P235/75/R16 $88.06 GENERAL NO BID NO BID $110.00 HANKOOK $108.43 FIRESTONE $118.46 GOODYEAR $106.00 FIRESTONE $114.50 COOPER
1 205/70/R15 $61.84 GENERAL NOBID NOBID $70.00 HANKOOK $64.21 FIRESTONE $58.77 GOODYEAR $58.00 FIRESTONE $62.00 HERCULES
12 LT245/70/R17 $118.21 GENERAL NO BID NO BID $135.09 BF GOODRICH $125.97 FIRESTONE $125.00 GOODYEAR $122.00 FIRESTONE $105.00 HERCULES
13 LT225/75/R17/10/116-AT $182.48 COOPER NOBID NOBID $150.89 BF GOODRICH $118.69 FIRESTONE NOBID NO BID $115.00 FIRESTONE $179.25 COOPER
14 225/65/R17 $91.52 GENERAL NO BID NO BID $72.25 HANKOOK $88.24 FIRESTONE $76.00 GOODYEAR $85.00 FIRESTONE $82.40 HERCULES
15 225/65/R17 $91.52 GENERAL NOBID NO BID $72.25 HANKOOK $158.46 FIRESTONE $106.45 GOODYEAR $85.00 FIRESTONE $82.40 HERCULES
16 P225/50/R17 $92.75 GENERAL NO BID NO BID $97.96 BF GOODRICH $90.06 FIRESTONE $77.00 GOODYEAR $92.00 FIRESTONE $75.80 HERCULES
Goup 4: Pursuit Tires

1 245-55R18 103W $118.42 GENERAL NO BID NO BID $130.35 BF GOODRICH $130.84 FIRESTONE $140.00 GOODYEAR $127.00 FIRESTONE $121.95 BF GOODRICH
2 P265/60R17 108V $112.91 GENERAL NO BID NO BID $143.60 BF GOODRICH $124.40 FIRESTONE $115.00 GOODYEAR $122.00 FIRESTONE $115.95 BF GOODRICH
3 235/55R17 $100.96 GENERAL NO BID NO BID $90.85 BF GOODRICH $111.70 FIRESTONE $104.00 GOODYEAR $109.00 FIRESTONE $90.80 BF GOODRICH
4 P225/60R16 97V $87.18 GENERAL NO BID NO BID $84.53 BF GOODRICH $97.85 FIRESTONE $90.00 GOODYEAR $95.00 FIRESTONE $84.50 BF GOODRICH




Bid 20-006

Tires for the County of El Paso
Opening Date: Thursday December 12, 2019

American Tire Distributors Border Parts Group, Inc. Bor:ebraRBe:radpgi:igreLLC. Bro.adw.ay' Motor.s The Goodzz::;ai;ey& Rubber Southern Tire. Mart, LLC Tire Connection
Fort Worth, TX dba NAPA dba Bill Williams Tires Columbia, MS El Paso, TX
El Paso, TX ElPaso, TX El Paso, TX Akron, OH
Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture
Group 5: Mowers / Utility Tractos / Utility Vehicles

1 19X10.5-8 $62.73 CARLISLE NOBID NO BID $40.00 HERCULES NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID
2 18X9.50-8 $37.59 CARLISLE NO BID NO BID $38.23 NAN KANG $60.00 BKT NO BID NOBID $25.00 OTR ENGINEER $38.70 HERCULES
3 23X10.50-8 $74.50 CARLISLE NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID $84.40 PREM
4 20X12.00-10 $65.94 CARLISLE NO BID NO BID $62.50 CARLISLE $71.00 CARLISLE NO BID NOBID $70.00 CARLISLE $67.90 CARLISLE
5 26.5X14.00-12 $157.47 CARLISLE NO BID NO BID $164.10 CARLISLE $167.00 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID $163.00 CARLISLE $149.96 CARLISLE
6 22X9.50-10 $67.40 CARLISLE NO BID NO BID $67.18 CARLISLE $71.00 CARLISLE NO BID NOBID $68.00 CARLISLE $75.95 CARLISLE
7 13X5.00-6 $18.06 CARLISLE NOBID NO BID $17.75 NAN KANG $29.50 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID $19.00 CARLISLE $18.58 CARLISLE
8 21X11.00-8 $87.43 CARLISLE NO BID NO BID $65.00 CARLISLE $78.40 CARLISLE NO BID NOBID $70.00 CARLISLE $72.99 CARLISLE
9 20X10.00-10 $49.38 CARLISLE NOBID NO BID $48.75 NAN KANG $80.80 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID $29.00 OTR ENGINEER $50.82 HERCULES
10 24X13.00-12 $130.97 CARLISLE NO BID NO BID $128.40 CARLISLE $157.00 CARLISLE NO BID NO BID $135.00 CARLISLE $133.52 CARLISLE
1 24X12-10 $86.60 CARLISLE NOBID NO BID $76.50 CARLISLE $97.60 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID $112.00 CARLISLE $89.10 CARLISLE
12 23X11.00-10 $77.40 CARLISLE NO BID NO BID $77.91 CARLISLE $95.20 CARLISLE NOBID NO BID $103.00 CARLISLE $99.80 CARLISLE
13 25X13-9 $98.49 CARLISLE NOBID NO BID $79.79 POWER KING $118.00 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID $107.00 CARLISLE $101.40 CARLISLE
14 22.5X10-8 $79.57 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID $68.50 CARLISLE $97.60 CARLISLE NOBID NO BID $77.00 CARLISLE $81.90 CARLISLE
15 33X16 LL-16 NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID
16 22X10-14 $67.98 CARLISLE NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID $81.00 OTR ENGINEER $134.00 MOJAVE
17 11X4.00-5 $12.71 CARLISLE NOBID NO BID $15.49 NAN KANG $30.40 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID $10.00 HIRUN $24.00 CARLISLE
18 13X6.50-6 $23.07 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID $22.77 POWER KING $35.20 CARLISLE NO BID NOBID $26.00 CARLISLE $29.85 CARLISLE
19 26X12.00-12 $81.25 CARLISLE NOBID NO BID $84.47 POWERKING $115.60 CARLISLE NO BID NOBID $105.00 CARLISLE $99.85 CARLISLE
20 4.10-350-4 $10.55 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID $15.20 NAN KANG $29.20 CARLISLE NO BID NOBID $21.00 CARLISLE $23.40 CARLISLE
21 24X12.00-12 $83.81 CARLISLE NOBID NO BID $70.87 POWERKING $91.60 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID $99.00 CARLISLE $86.25 CARLISLE
22 24X9.50-10 $80.49 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID $69.95 CARLISLE $85.60 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID $96.00 CARLISLE $82.10 CARLISLE
23 24X10.50-10 $95.19 CARLISLE NOBID NO BID $105.11 CARLISLE $114.40 CARLISLE NO BID NOBID $107.00 CARLISLE $97.98 CARLISLE
24 23X8.50-12 $71.32 CARLISLE NO BID NO BID $67.79 POWER KING $85.60 CARLISLE NOBID NO BID $38.00 GLADIATOR $73.40 CARLISLE
25 44X18.00-20 $298.22 CARLISLE NO BID NO BID $328.00 CARLISLE $349.60 CARLISLE NO BID NOBID NOBID NO BID $378.52 CARLISLE

NOTE: These vendors do not qualify for the Local Business Preference Policy,




