
Bid 20-032 

Wrecker and Towing Services for the County of El Paso

Opening Date: Thursday, July 9, 2020

Item Description
Price

(Public)

County 

Vehicle Price

(less 30%)

Price

(Public)

County 

Vehicle Price

(less 30%)

Price

(Public)

County 

Vehicle Price

(less 30%)

Price

(Public)+A9:NI

9:J15

County 

Vehicle Price

(less 30%)

Price

(Public)

County 

Vehicle Price

(less 30%)

Price

(Public)

County 

Vehicle Price

(less 30%)

1 Flat tow $24.95 $17.25 $100.00 $70.00 $100.00 $70.00 $100.00 $70.00 $75.00 $52.50 $100.00 $70.00

2 Tow with a dolly $4.00 $3.00 $145.00 $101.50 $150.00 $105.00 $150.00 $105.00 $95.00 $66.50 $145.00 $101.50

3 Wait time $19.95 $13.95 90 per hr $60.00 $95.00 per hr $66.50 per hr $95.00 per hr $66.50 per hr $75.00 $52.50 $90.00 hr $63.00 hr

4 Work time $19.95 $13.95 $85.00 $59.50 $100.00 per hr $70.00 per hr $100.00 per hr $70.00 per hr $75.00 $52.50 $85.00 $59.50

5 Winch/Recovery $19.95 $13.95 150 per hr $105.00 $145.00 per hr $101.50 per hr $145.00 per hr $101.50 per hr $125.00/hr $87.50/hr $150.00 hr $105.00

6 Per loaded mile $3.45 $2.20 $3.10 $2.10 $3.00 $2.10 $3.00 $2.10 $2.00 $1.40 $3.00 $2.10

1 Flat tow $74.95 $52.45 $350.00 $245.00 $350.00 $245.00 $350.00 $245.00 $95.00 $66.50 $350.00 $245.00

2 Wait time $29.95 $20.95 $145.00 $101.50 $100.00 per hr $70.00 per hr $100.00 per hr $70.00 per hr $95.00 $66.50 $145.00 $101.50

3 Work time $29.95 $20.95 90 per hr $60.00 $220.00 per hr $154.00 per hr $220.00 per hr $154.00 per hr $95.00 $66.50 $90.00 hr $63.00/hr

4 Winch/Recovery $29.95 $20.95 250 per hr $175.00 $300.00 per hr $210.00 per hr $300.00 per hr $210.00 per hr $175.00/hr $122.50/hr $250.00 hr $175.00 hr

5 Per loaded mile $3.45 $2.40 $4.00 $2.80 $5.00 $3.50 $5.00 $3.50 $4.00 $2.80 $4.00 $2.80

1 Flat tow $149.95 $104.95 No Bid No Bid $450.00 $315.00 $450.00 $315.00 $375.00 $262.50 No Bid No Bid

2 Wait time $49.95 $34.95 No Bid No Bid $150.00 per hr $105.00 per hr $150.00 per hr $105.00 per hr $375.00 $262.50 No Bid No Bid

3 Work time $49.95 $34.95 No Bid No Bid $200.00 per hr $140.00 per hr $200.00 per hr $140.00 per hr $375.00 $262.50 No Bid No Bid

4 Winch/Recovery $49.95 $34.95 No Bid No Bid $400.00 per hr $280.00 per hr $400.00 per hr $280.00 per hr $250.00 $175.00 No Bid No Bid

5 Per loaded mile $3.45 $2.40 No Bid No Bid $7.00 $4.90 $7.00 $4.90 $4.00 $2.80 No Bid No Bid

1 Flat tow $149.95 $104.95 No Bid No Bid $500.00 $350.00 $500.00 $350.00 $600.00 $420.00 No Bid No Bid

2 Wait time $49.95 $34.95 No Bid No Bid $150.00 per hr $105.00 per hr $150.00 per hr $105.00 per hr $600.00 $420.00 No Bid No Bid

3 Work time $49.95 $34.95 No Bid No Bid $450.00 per hr $315.00 per hr $450.00 per hr $315.00 per hr $600.00 $420.00 No Bid No Bid

4 Winch/Recovery $49.95 $34.95 No Bid No Bid $500.00 per hr $350.00 per hr $500.00 per hr $350.00 per hr $250.00/hr $175.00/hr No Bid No Bid

5 Per loaded mile $3.45 $2.40 No Bid No Bid $7.00 $4.90 $7.00 $4.90 $4.00 $2.80 No Bid No Bid

Approved By (Signature) Approved By (Print)

Recommendation Date BG7/13/20

NOTE: *Extreme Towing- Ethics Training Form was not properly filled out. Purchasing verified through Human Resources and no record of on-line training was available. As a result vendor has been disqualified.

*Extreme Towing

El Paso, TX

MEDIUM DUTY VEHICLES

HEAVY DUTY VEHICLES

HEAVY EQUIPMENT

AD Wrecker Service, Inc.

El Paso, TX

Extreme Recovery & Towing

Socorro, TX

Pantusa Towing & Recovery, LLC

San Antonio, TX

Raul Fernandez JR dba 

Dependable Towing

El Paso, TX

Best Wrecker & Towing Inc.

El Paso, TX

LIGHT DUTY VEHICLES


