
Item Description Price Per Price Per Sheets Per Delivery Price Per Price Per Sheets Per Delivery Price Per Price Per Sheets Per Delivery

1 20 lb., 8-1/2 x 11  $2.88 $102.80 500/5000 1 Day P $2.699 26.99 500/5000 2 Days S $2.79 $27.90 500/5000 1 Day

BRAND: 

2 20 lb., 8-1/2 x 14  S $4.00 $40.00 500/5000 1 Day P $3.97 $39.70 500/5000 1 Day

BRAND: 

3 20 lb., 11 x 17 P $6.30 $31.50 500/2500 1 Day S $6.40 $32.00 500/2500 1 Day

BRAND: 

4 20 lb., 8-1/2 x 11, 3-Hole Punch
S $3.48 $34.80 500/5000 1 Day P $3.20 $32.00 500/5000 1 Day

BRAND: 

5
20 lb., 8-1/2 x 11, 19-Hole GBC 

Punch
P $4.87 $24.35 500/2500 S $5.92 $29.60 500/2500 7-10 Days

BRAND: 

6 25% Cotton, 8-1/2 x 11 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID P $16.95 $169.50 500/5000 1 Day

BRAND: 

Item Description Price Per Price Per Sheets Per Delivery Price Per Price Per Sheets Per Delivery Price Per Price Per Sheets Per Delivery

7

2-Part NCR                            

Reverse Sequence
S $10.28 $102.80 500/5000 1 Day P $9.10 $91.00 500/5000 1 Day

BRAND: 

8

3-Part NCR                         

Reverse Sequence
S $11.56 $115.60 500/5000 1 Day P $10.20 $102.00 500/5000 1 Day

BRAND: 

9

3-Part NCR                         

Straight Sequence
S $11.56 $115.60 500/5000 1 Day P $10.20 $102.00 500/5000 1 Day

BRAND: 

10

4-Part NCR                             

Reverse Sequence 
S $12.34 $123.40 500/5000 1 Day P $10.85 $108.50 500/5000 1 Day

BRAND: 

11

5-Part NCR                        

Reverse Sequence  
S $12.70 $127.00 500/5000 1 Day P $11.22 $112.20 500/5000 1 Day

BRAND: 

Bid 21-017

Purchase of Copy Paper, Carbonless (NCR) Paper, and Envelopes for the County of El Paso

Opening Date: Thursday, February 11, 2021

Shelby Distributions, Inc.

El Paso, Texas

Spectrum Paper Co., Inc.

El Paso, Texas

Olmsted Kirk 

Dallas, Texas

NO BID

USA Copy or Equal

USA Copy or Equal

USA Copy or Equal

USA Copy or Equal

Impreso or Equal

Mohawk Via

COMET

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

BOND PAPER

MULTIPURPOSE

NO BID 

NO BID NCR

NCR

NCR

NO BID

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

IP RELAY

IP RELAY

IP RELAY

PERFORMANCE

NO BID

NCR NO BID 

NO BID 

NCR PAPER

NCR

NCR

NCR

NO BID 

NCR NO BID NCR

NO BID 

NCR



Item

No.
Description

Price Per

Case

Sheets Per

Case

Delivery

ARO

Price Per

Box

Price Per

Case

Sheets Per

Case

Delivery

ARO

Price Per

Box

Price Per

Case

Sheets Per

Case

Delivery

ARO

12 #9 NO Window S $9.50 $47.50 500/2500 1 Day P $9.35 $46.75 500/2500 1 Day

BRAND: 

13 #9 Window S $10.87 $54.35 500/2500 1 Day P $10.69 $53.45 500/2500 1 Day

BRAND: 

14 #10 NO Window S $9.50 $47.50 500/2500 1 Day P $9.35 $46.75 500/2500 1 Day

BRAND: 

15 #10 Window S $10.87 $54.35 500/2500 1 Day P $10.69 $53.45 500/2500 1 Day

BRAND: 

Approved By (Signature) Approved By (Print) 

Multiple 

Recommended Vendor Date

2/18/21BG

Olmsted Kirk 

Dallas, Texas

Shelby Distributions, Inc.

El Paso, Texas

Willing to accept a secondary/alternate 

award? 
Yes

QUESTION

OKCO

OKCO

Yes

NO BID

NO BID

Yes

Impact

Impact

NO BID

ENVELOPES

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Price Per 

Box

OKCO

OKCO

Spectrum Paper Co., Inc.

El Paso, Texas

NO BID

NO BID

Impact

Impact


