Bid 21-031
Traffic Control Products for the County of El Paso
Opening Date: Thursday, September 30, 2021

Osburn Associates, Inc. Pathmark Traffic Equipment, LLC
Logan, OH San Marcos, TX
Description
MANUAL DRIVER EQUIPMENT TO INSTALL
1 |SOCKET FOR SIGNPOST (or equivalent) 2 EA NOBID $975.00
2 IDDRIVE CAP 2-7/8 OD (or equivalent) 2 EA NO BID $249.00
RU-BPS-48R48" REFL ROLL UP BE PREPARED
3 |TO STOP 4 EA $163.80 $119.00
RU-RWA-48R/48" REFL ROLL-UP ROAD WORK
4 4 EA $163.80 $119.00
AHEAD
RU-BLANK-48R/48" REFL ROLL BLANK
5 |SHOULDER WORK AHEAD 10 EA $163.80 $129.00
RU-BLANK-48R/48" REFL ROLL BLANK FRESH
6 |OIL 4 EA $163.80 $129.00
7 IRU-BLANK-48R/48" ROLL-UP LOOSE GRAVEL 4 EA $163.80 $129.00
|RU-ORLA-48R/48" REFL ROLL-UP ONE LANE
8 AHEAD 4 EA $163.80 $119.00
30234/2" X 59 YDS RED/WHITE HI SHTG $64.50/ roll
9 |conspuiTy 6 6 rollsfeach 30234/2" X 50 yrds $149.00
10 9 X.60 YDS WHITE SHEETING ROLLS (or 10 10 boxes/each $I?21 .50 /roll $219.00
equivalent) 9" X 50 yrds
12" X 50 YDS BLUE SHEETING ROLLS 10 BOXES
11 ) 10 10 boxes/each $162.00 / roll $289.00
(or equivalent)
24" X 50 YDS BLUE SHEETING ROLLS 10 BOXES
12 ) 10 10 boxes/each $324.00/roll $575.00
(or equivalent)
13 30894A/POZ LOCK WEDGE (or equivalent) 370 EA NO BID $4.99
.080 BLANK/24" X 30" .080 ALUMINUM BLANKS
14 ) 200 EA $16.75 $23.05
(or equivalent)
.080 BLANK/24" X 24" .080 ALUMINUM BLANK:
15 080 ) K 080 ALUMINU S 150 EA $13.40 $18.44
(or equivalent)
16 .080 BI_.ANK/12 X 12" .080 ALUMINUM BLANKS 100 EA $3.35 $4.61
(or equivalent)
.080 BLANK 9 X 18" STREET NAME BLANK NO
17 lHoLes 150 EA $3.75 $5.19
.080 BLANK 9 X 24" STREET NAME BLANK NO
18 |HOLES (or equivalent) 150 EA $5.03 $6.92
.080 BLANK/30" BLANK UNIVERSAL HOLE
19 PATTERN (or equivalent) 100 EA e §28.81
.080 BLANK 12 X 24" BLANK UNIVERSAL HOLE
20 |PATTERN (or equivalent) 100 EA a0 $9.22
.080 BLANK 18 X 24" BLANK UNIVERSAL HOLE
21 [PATTERN (or equivalent 100 EA $10.05 $13.83
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2 PATTERN (or equivalent) 100 EA $1675 $23.05
.080 BLANK 18 X 30" BLANK UNIVERSAL HOLE
28 |PATTERN (or equivalent) 100 EA $12.56 $17.29
24 36 XSQ YDS PREMIUM OVERLAY W/PREMASK 4 EA $382.50 $1399.00
(or equivalent)
30" X 60 YDS PREMIUM OVERLAY W/PREMAK (or $318.75
5 Lequivalent) 4 EA 30" X 50 yds $1,165.00
24" X 50 YDS PREMIUM OVERLAY W/PREMASK
26 ) 4 EA $255.00 $932.00
(or equivalent)
20320/BLUE FAST DRY WATERBORNE TRAFFIC
2z JPAINT GALLON (or equivalent) 2 EA NOBID $29.50
20318/BLACK REGULAR DRY WATERBORNE
28 [TRAFFIC PAINT GALLON (or equivalent) 10 EA NOBID el
20403/BLACK AEROSOL TRAFFIC STRIPING
29 JPAINT CASE (or equivalent) 2 12 each / case NOBID $64.95
30 20404/BLUE AEROSOL TRAFFIC STRIPPIG 1 12 each / case NO BID $64.95
PAINT (or equivalent)
31 20402/RED AEROSOL TRAFFIC STRIPPING 1 12 each/ case NO BID $64.95
PAINT (or equivalent)
24" X 50 YDS HI WHITE PRISMATIC SHEETING
32 ) 10 EA $324.00 $575.00
(or equivalent)
" X 50 YDS HI WHITE PRISMATIC SHEETIN
33 30 5.0 S S s ¢ 10 EA $405.00 $725.00
(or equivalent)
36" X 50 YDS EG WHITE ENGINEERING GRADE
34 SHEETING (or equivalent) 2 EA U $655.00
24" X 50 YDS EG WHITE ENIGINEERING GRADE
35 |SHEETING (or equivalent) 2 EA 2 $439.00
36 RU-RWA-48R/48" REFL ROLL-UP WORKERS 4 EA $163.80 $129.00
AHEAD
37 RU-RWA-48R/48" REFL ROLL-UP PAINT CREW 4 EA $163.80 $129.00
AHEAD
RU-RWA-48R/48" REFL ROLL-UP FRESH PAINT
38 U- 8R4 OLLU S 2 EA $163.80 $129.00
AHEAD
RU-RWA-48R/ REFL ROLL UP LEFT LANE
39 CLOSED 4 EA $163.80 $129.00
30220LB/LITTLE
40 BUSTERSPRINGLOADEDSIGNSTANDW/ROLL-UP| 6 EA NOBID $189.00
BRACKET (or equivalent)
41 FEF(])_ONE SIGNS WITH WHITE/BLACK KEEP 10 EA NO BID $19.50
4 NR CONE SIGNS WITH WHITE/BLACK KEEP 10 EA NO BID $19.50
RIGHT
43 INR CONE SIGNS ORANGE BLACK BOLD ARROW 30 EA NO BID $19.50
T2X18".080 M YELLOW/BLACRK PARK AT YOU
44 OWN RISK FLY OR FOUL BALLS MAY STRIKE 5 EA $9.75 $16.75
VEHICLES
12X18" .080 HI WHITE/RED NO PARKING
4 [EERaENCY AND MAINTENANCE USE ONLY 8 EA e $16.75
IRU-BLANK-48/48" REFLECTIVE ROLLUP
46 SHOULDER WORK AHEAD-SLOW DOWN 6 EA $163.80 $129.00
47 30220C-202/202 COMPACTSIGN STAN WIND 12 EA NO BID $125.00

JDEFI SPRING
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48 24" X 50 YDS RED EC FILM 25 EA $276.00 $575.00

49 12" X 50 YDS RED EC FILM 25 EA $138.00 $289.00

50 9" X 50 YDS OVERLAY FILM 1160 25 EA $85.50 $325.00

51 12"X 50 YDS OVERLAY FILM 1160 25 EA $114.00 $435.00
|0PTIONAL
Catalog Discount I 5% I % I
Approved By (Signature) Approved By (Print)
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