Purchasing Department

Bid #06-110, Mobile Computer Terminals for the Sheriff's Office
Opening Date: Wednesday, December 27, 2006

Portable Computer Systems R.T.C. Inc.
EXTENDED EXTENDED
DESCRIPTION QTY ITEM # UNIT COST COST ITEM # UNIT COST COST
Mobile Computer Model CF-29EWKGZKM 10 CF-30CAQAZBM |$ 3,797.00 | $ 37,970.00 No Bid $ - 1% -
Mobile Computer 3 Year Warranty 10 CF-SVCLTNF3Y No Cost $ - No Bid $ - |9 -
DVD/CD-RW for CF-29 10 CF-VDR282U $ 232.00|$ 2,320.00 No Bid $ - 1% -
771-1057-

25-ft Serial Cable 10 No Bid $ - 1S - FKN-4367A $ 51.00 | $ 510.00
Precision Mount Center Mount 10 MS40283CLF $ 1,199.00 | $ 11,990.00| No Bid $ -1 $ -
Vehicular Radio Modem 850, 35 Watt 10 No Bid $ - |8 - F4454 $ 2103.75|$ 21,037.50
VRM One Year Warranty 10 No Bid $ - 1S - Included No Cost $ -
Roof Mount Antenna, 3 DB Gain 10 No Bid $ - 1% - RRA4983A $ 4165 $ 416.50
TX Messenger Applications Software 10 No Bid $ - 1% - SCA0020 $ 610.00 | $ 6,100.00
Power Surge Protector Fuse 10 CG-MP $ 74.00 | $ 740.00 || M2P-24 $ 148.75($ 1,487.50
CD Rom Media 10 No Bid $ - |9 - No Cost $ -
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