
Item Qty Description

Alamo 
Shooters 
tactical & 
Uniform 

Supply Co
Bob Barker 
Company

Uniforms 
of Texas

Tactical 
Weapons 

USA
GT Dist. 

Inc.

Law 
Enforcement 
Sales, USA

Scope Mount
3 

sets Leopold Mark 4 30 mm Scope Mounts $199.89 No bid $234.00 $123.89 $124.50 $118.00

Pro Tech Level 
IIIAAssault Vest 16

Pro Tech "Titan" Assault Vest. Best Musgtinclude Yoke 
System, Bicep Protector, Groin Protector, and 6 Molle 
equipment pouches.  NIJ Level IIIA-No Substitions. $919.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid

Ballistic Plate 16 Pro Tech 10 x 12 Level IV Ballistic Front Plate $275.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
EO Tech Sights 15 EO Tech Holographic Sight# EOT-512.A65 $328.00 *313.33 358.00 ea. $359.40 $319.90 $369.00
AR 30 Roound 

Magazines 60 Bushmaster ARRifle, 30 Round Magazines $10.99 No bid 19.95 ea. $13.95 $13.95 $18.18
GG& G Buis Back 

up Iron Sight 15 GG & G Buis Back Up Iron Sight for M4 Rail System $119.00 No bid 121.00 ea $119.10
 Qty  (5) 

83.50 $95.00
Pro Tech Delta Lt 
Ballistic Helmet 16 Pro Tech Level IIIA Ballistic Hellmet $303.75 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

Def Tech Optic Fit 
Tactical Gas Mask 16 Def Tech Opti Fit Tactical Gas Mask $135.90 143.33 ea. 150.00 ea No bid No bid No bid

5.11 Tactical TDU 
Ply/Cotton Shirt 20

5.11 Tactical TDU Poly/Cotton RIP Shirt, 7.14 oz 
Polyester/35% cotton with triple stictching and 28 bartacks 
for stength.  Removable neoprene elbow pads $23.95 No bid No bid No bid $27.75 No bid

5.11 Tactical TDU 
Ply/Cotton Pants 20

5.11 Tactical TDU Poly/Cotton RIP Pants, 7.14 oz 
Polyester/35% cotton with double knee and removable 
neoprene Knee pads, Triple stitching, and removable 
blousing straps. $23.95 No bid No bid No bid $27.75 No bid

M4 Rail System 10

Tow Piece hand guard for M4 Carbine Rifle designed to 
replace standard plastic hand guar.  This System has a 4-
rail Pica tinny design.  Must be 6061 Aluminum and hard 
coat anodized. $143.99 No bid No bid No bid $89.95 No bid
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