PURCHASING

Bid # 08-009, Officer Uniforms, Patches, Badges, and Insignias
Opening Date: March 12, 2008

Guardian- Lawmen's & .
Vendor Tactical.com Shooters Supply Uniforms of Texas
DEPUTY UNIFORM (Item) Cost each Cost each Cost each

Dress Shirt Men Gray Long Sleeve No Bid No Bid $47.00
Dress Shirt Men Gray Short Sleeve No Bid No Bid $38.00
Dress Shirt Female Gray Long Sleeve No Bid No Bid $41.00
Dress Shirt Female Gray Short Sleeve No Bid No Bid $38.00
Dress Shirt Men White Long Sleeve No Bid No Bid $32.95
Dress Shirt Men White Short Sleeve No Bid No Bid $31.95
Dress Shirt Lady White Long Sleeve No Bid No Bid $32.95
Dress Shirt Lady White Short Sleeve No Bid No Bid $31.95
Dress Pants No Bid No Bid $47.35
Rain Coat No Bid No Bid $19.95
Champ Duty Jacket No Bid No Bid $162.00
Light Weight Jacket No Bid No Bid $101.00
Light Weight Liner No Bid No Bid $25.00
Badge $42.59 $38.50 $46.90
Sheriff Patch $1.29 No Bid $1.71

Deputy Raincoat No Bid No Bid $19.95
Motorcycle Pants Special Order No Bid No Bid $154.00
Seniority Patches/Sew On Rank $1.12 No Bid $3.95

Pin On Rank No Bid No Bid $3.95

DETENTION OFFICER UNIFORM
Cost each Cost each Cost each

DO Badge $42.76 $38.50 $46.90
Sheriff Dept Patch $1.29 No Bid $1.71

BDU Badge Patch $1.09 No Bid $1.75

Name Tag (Sew On) No Bid No Bid $5.50

BDU Shirt Tan No Bid No Bid $49.80
BDU Pant Tan No Bid No Bid $49.80
SRT Black Shirt No Bid No Bid $20.00
SRT Black Pants No Bid No Bid $20.00
Dress Shirt No Bid No Bid $37.50
Dress Pant No Bid No Bid $39.90
Light Weight Jacket No Bid No Bid $101.00
Light Weight Liner No Bid No Bid $25.00
Female White Dress Shirt Long Sleeve No Bid No Bid $32.95
Female White Dress Shirt Short Sleeve No Bid No Bid $31.95




Men White Dress Shirt Long Sleeve No Bid No Bid $32.95
Men White Dress Shirt Short Sleeve No Bid No Bid $31.95
Seniority Patches/Sew on Rank $1.12 No Bid $3.95
Pin on Rank No Bid No Bid $3.95
COURTHOUSE SECURITY UNIFORM
Cost each Cost each Cost each
Men’s Long Sleeve Shirt No Bid No Bid $32.00
Men’s Short Sleeve Shirt No Bid No Bid $31.00
Courthouse Pants No Bid No Bid $21.00
Security Badge $42.76 $38.50 $46.90
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