
Vendors Vendors Vendors Vendors Vendors

Qty Item Description Portable Computer 
Systems, Inc.

Howard Industries, 
Inc. dba Howard 

Technologies 
Solutions

CDW 
Government Alamo Auto Supply R.T.C., Inc.

37

Panasonic Core Duo 1.66GHz 
Processor
1GB RAM 
80GB HDD

13.3”  Transmissive -Touchscreen
Factory No-glare

Ruggedized Magnesium Casework
56K Modem, 10/100 ethernet card

Intel 802.11 a+b +g LAN 
Bluetooth

Emissive Backlit Keyboard

$139,527.00 $144,041.00 $139,675.00 $144,052.68 NO BID

37 PANASONIC TOUGHBOOK 
PROTECTION PLUS   (3 YEARS) $9,250.00 $9,509.00 $8,954.00 $9,542.11 NO BID

37 Panasonic Combo DVD/CDRW for 
CF-30 $8,695.00 $8,621.00 $8,510.00 $8,866.76 NO BID

37 12V Power Surge Protection, 
Transtector Surge Protectors 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $5,446.40 

Purchasing Department
 BID #08-110, Thirty-seven (37) Mobile Computer Terminals 

OPENING DATE: Wednesday, August 6, 2008



37 25ft serial cable NO BID NO BID $370.00 NO BID $2,042.40 

37

Precision CF-29 Dock - part # 
DP29P; PA1555-655 Power cord for 

P4    Precision Light switch; Precision 
screen support ; Cnetermount lift 
system,standalone armrest,30" 

baesplate,front and rear crown vic 
brackets ; Angle console for Center 
Mount w/ faceplates ; face plates for 

Motorola Radio

$45,843.00 NO BID No BID $44,400.00 $36,482.00 

37 Motorola Vehicular Radio Modem 
850, 35 Watt,  800 MHz NO BID NO BID $104,340.00 No BID $90,206.00 

37 Motorola TWO YEAR Extended 
Warranty, Total of three years. NO BID NO BID No BID No BID $9,472.00 

37 Roof Mount Antenna, 3 db Gain, 
Teflon Low Loss Cable NO BID NO BID No BID No BID $1,957.30 

37
Motorola TXMESSENGER 

Applications Software, W/ 128 bit 
Encryption/Compression capable 

License

NO BID NO BID No BID No BID $22,570.00 

37 Motorola CD ROM MEDIA for TX 
Messenger Software NO BID NO BID No BID No BID N/C

Total Cost $203,315.00 $162,171.00 $261,849.00 $206,861.55 $168,176.10 
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