Corrected

Purchasing Department
Bid #008-114, Computer and Software Equipment for the Amber Project
Opening Date: Thursday, August 21, 2008

Global Gov/Ed Solutions

Computer Express Inc Logicalis, Inc. Newbart Products, Inc. Zones Inc.
QTY Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price |Total Price Unit Price Total Price
5 Fargo DTC 400 No Bid $ - No Bid $ - No Bid $ - $ 2,558.57 | $ 12,792.85 No Bid $ -
4 BAC Secure Touch No Bid $ - No Bid $ - No Bid $ - $ 21427 | % 857.08 No Bid $ -
9 T
Siglite Signature Pad No Bid $ - $ 87.00 | $ 783.00 No Bid $ - $ 14285 | $ 1,285.65 No Bid $ -
9 Digital Camera Canon
Powershot A57 No Bid $ - No Bid $ - No Bid $ - $ 200.00 | $ 1,800.00 No Bid $ -
9 HP Compag Laptop
6710b $ 1,218.00 | $ 10,962.00 | $ 1,019.00 [ $ 9,271.00| $ 999.99( $ 8,991.00| $ 1,658.42 | $ 14,925.78 | $ 1,29291 | $ 11,636.19
6 Pelican Case No Bid $ - No Bid $ - No Bid $ - $ 32142 (3% 1,928.52 No Bid $ -
6 . .
Lid Organizer No Bid $ - No Bid $ - No Bid $ - $ 4284 $ 257.04 No Bid $ -
5 Cables to go 6 foot USB
to Parallel $ 16.00| $ 80.00 | $ 9.951 % 4975 | $ 10.00| $ 50.00( $ 3750 | $ 17850 | $ 1054 | $ 52.70
9 Fargo YMCKO Ribbon
w/ Cleaning roller $ 3543 | $ 318.87 No Bid $ - No Bid $ - $ 58.29 | $ 524.61 No Bid $ -
Total Cost $ 11,360.87 $ 10,003.75 $ 9,041.00 $ 34,550.03 $ 11,688.89
Freight $ 1,999.97
$ 36,550.00
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