Purchasing Department
BID #08-145, Rebid Exterior/Interior and Communiction Equipment for the Patrol Vehicles

Opening Date: Wednesday, October 8, 2008

ey . Portable
Description Alamo Auto Supply| SoundOff Signal Daily am! W‘ells EratEas Mm}ntmg R.T.C., Inc Computer
Communication, Technologies Systems, Inc.
Inc.

Item A. Prisoner Transport Seat $8,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6,000.00 No Bid
Item B. Prisoner Barrier $14.520.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9,140.00 No Bid
Item C. Go Rhino Grill Gard $4,752.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,780.00 No Bid
Item D. Siren Speaker $2,100.00 No Bid No Bid $2.500.00 No Bid
Item E. Federal Signal Legend $30,990.00 No Bid No Bid $34,000.00 No Bid
Item F. Federal Electronic Siren/Switch $6,580.00 No Bid No Bid $6,000.00 No Bid
Item G. Fire Extinguish $1,400.00 No Bid No Bid $1,800.00 No Bid
Item H. Headlight Flasher $975.00 No Bid No Bid $1,700.00 No Bid
Item I. Kustom Signal s Digital

Eyewitness ION Eclipse $117,940.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $97,000.00 No Bid

$995.00 per unit
$30.00 freight

Item J. Mouting Bracket Total $1,025.00 X 20 units

$24,740.00 No Bid No Bid | 2280000 No Bid

Item K. Trunk equipment mount slide
out shelf for mounting radio & modem

box $3,560.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,000.00 No Bid
Item L. Battery protection unit $1,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,900.00 No Bid
Item M. Programmable Shut Down
Timer $1,300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Charge No Bid
Item N. Secure-ldle $3,270.00 No Bid No Bid $2,700.00 No Bid
Item O. Mobile Radios - MA-COM
Model $49.410.00 No Bid $51,317.00 No Bid $57,000.00 No Bid
Item P. Motorola VRM 850(Vehicle
Radio Modem) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $77,000.00 No Bid

Item Q. Panasonic CF30 Toughbook w/3
years warranty & Technical Support. $88.400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $86,000.00 $82,000.00

Item R. Installation of all equipment
listed included warranty labor on any

repairs for five (5) years $28.000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $26,000.00 No Bid
%d«. V2 u)a/{x
Jack Waite
Approved By (signature) Approved By (Print)
Sheriff's Office 17-Oct-08
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