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2 x 12 x 24 104 $3.45 $358.80 $4.08 424.32* $16.80 $1,747.20 $2.46 $255.84 $4.00 $416.00 $152.70 $3,206.70 $2.48 $257.92 $2.65 275.6* $2.39 $248.56 $3.00 $312.00 $2.98 309.92* $1.95 $202.80
2 x 16 x 20 720 3.51 2527.20 3.95 2844.00 2.82 2030.40 2.21 1591.20 4.09 2944.80 188.25 27108.00 2.51 1807.20 2.64 1900.80* 1.99 1432.80 3.12 2246.40 2.99 2152.80 2.29 1648.80
2 x 16 x 25 288 4.03 1160.64 4.50 1296.00 2.76 794.88 2.42 696.96 4.67 1344.96 218.85 12675.90 3.06 881.28 2.92 840.96* 2.28 656.64 3.54 1019.52 3.39 976.32* 2.47 711.36
2 x 18 x 24 2,600 4.50 11700.00 5.25 13650.00 3.08 8008.00 3.96 10296.00 5.42 14092.00 195.75 101790.00 3.68 9568.00 3.20 8320.00* 2.49 6474.00 4.08 10608.00 3.91 10166.00 2.49 6474.00
2 x 20 x 25 91 4.76 433.16 5.16 469.56 3.05 277.55 2.67 242.97 5.59 508.69 220.50 4789.50 3.41 310.31 3.28 298.48* 2.67 242.97 4.20 382.20 3.94 358.54* 2.79 253.89
2 x 24 x 24 216 5.39 1164.24 5.75 1242.00 3.72 803.52 3.02 652.32 6.34 1369.44 214.05 9418.20 3.93 848.88 3.54 764.64* 2.88 622.08 4.80 1039.80 4.42 954.72* 3.12 673.92
1 x 20 x 20 104 3.34 347.36 3.37 350.48 1.86 193.44 2.25 234.00 3.92 402.68 no bid no bid 3.24 336.96 2.56 266.24* 2.39 248.56 2.94 305.76 3.05 317.2* 2.25 234.00

1 x 12 x 20 144 2.98 429.12 3.40 489.60 1.79 257.76 3.74 538.56 3.50 504.00 no bid no bid 2.94 423.36 2.56 368.64* 1.99 286.56 2.64 380.16 2.88 414.72* 1.95 280.80

1 x 16 x 20 208 2.97 617.76 3.05 634.40 1.78 370.24 2.11 438.88 3.50 728.00 16.97 3529.76 2.94 611.52 2.31 480.48* 1.93 401.44 2.64 549.12 2.76 574.08 2.06 428.48
1 x 16 x 25 36 3.30 118.80 3.35 120.60 1.88 67.68 2.24 80.64 3.84 138.24 16.97 610.92 3.24 116.64 2.54 91.44* 2.19 78.84 2.88 103.68 3.02 108.72* 2.25 81.00

24 x 24 x 11 
1/2 hepa  filter 2 141.65 283.30 320.00 640.00 212.00 424.00 176.22 352.44 151.00 302.00* no bid no bid 308.25 616.50 118.39 236.78 135.66 271.32 120.00 240.00 115.00 230.00 148.50 297.00
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2 x 20 x 20 336 4.12 1384.32 4.53 1522.08 2.78 934.08 2.35 789.60 4.84 1624.24 no bid no bid 3.06 1028.16 2.92 981.12* 2.44 819.84 3.66 1229.76 3.45 1159.20 2.47 829.92
2 x 16 x 25 48 4.03 193.44 4.50 216.00 2.76 132.48 2.42 116.16 4.67 224.16 218.85 2188.50 3.06 146.88 2.92 140.16* 2.28 109.44 3.54 169.92 3.39 162.72* 2.47 118.56
2 x 16 x 20 192 3.51 673.92 3.95 758.40 2.82 541.44 2.21 424.32 4.09 785.28 188.25 7341.75 2.51 481.92 2.64 506.88* 1.99 382.08 3.12 599.04 2.99 574.08 2.29 439.68
16  x 16 x 2 144 5.82 838.08 5.80 835.20 4.40 633.60 2.70 388.80 6.84 984.96 no bid no bid 4.17 600.48 3.06 440.64* 3.27 470.88 5.16 743.04 5.00 720.00* 4.05 583.20
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25 x 25 x 2 72 6.32 455.04 5.25 378.00 3.44 247.68 6.30 453.60 7.34 528.48 no bid no bid 4.71 339.12 118.39 8524.08 3.67 264.24 5.40 388.80 5.29 380.88 2.79 200.88

lg3/24/09

TRI-Dim Filter Corp.

* Total price on bid was wrong unit price utilized.

Jail Annex

Purchasing Department
Bid # 09-017, 2009 Heating and Cooling Filter Elements for the Jail Annex and the Sheriff’s Headquarters

Wednesday, March 11, 2009

TRI-Dim Filter Corp.

Disqualified         
(NO CIQ)           

G & E Enterprises
Dominquez Sheet Metal 

Works, Inc.      Eco-Worx, Inc.

Department's Recommendation

Approved By (Signature)

Department

Termica dba One Hour Air
Conditing & Heating

Dominquez Sheet Metal 
Works, Inc.      Eco-Worx, Inc.

Disqualified         
(NO CIQ)           

G & E Enterprises

Disqualified            
(NO CIQ)              

Home Depot**Sheriff's 

Addendum 1

Date

Approved By (Print)

Disqualified           
(NO CIQ)             

Joe W. Fly Co., Inc. Koch Filter Corp

Disqualified             
(NO CIQ)               

MSC Industrial Supply Co. TCB Contractors

18,375.13$                    $24,436.94* 13,010.25$                         19,559.90$                         

ACR Supply

Disqualified          
(NO CIQ)            

Armour Filtration

TCB Contractors
Termica dba One Hour Air

Conditing & Heating

Disqualified            
(NO CIQ)              

Home Depot**

Disqualified           
(NO CIQ)             

Joe W. Fly Co., Inc. Koch Filter Corp

Disqualified             
(NO CIQ)               

MSC Industrial Supply Co.ACR Supply

Disqualified          
(NO CIQ)            

Armour Filtration

p
each case (sold only in 
cases). Unable to deliver 
in 36 hr notice.  Special 
delivery only

Total Cost 22,685.18$                 $25,870.04* 17,463.95$                      13,458.29$                          17,552.29$                 26,897.93$                 172,059.00$                    $20,317.20*


