Purchasing Department

Bid #09-022, Amminution for the Sheriff's Office
Opening Date: Wendsday, March 25, 2009

*International Cartridge Bailey's House of Guns, Inc. GT Distributors, Inc.

QTY Part # Item Brand/Description Unit Price Total Price | Unit Price |Total Price Unit Price [Total Price

60cs | ccl-s3e52 |40 A gg%‘ggfoﬁnmdr;‘“”'“on Speer Lawman .40 SW, 180 Gr. No Bid No Bid None given $11.368.20 | $215.90/1000 [ $  12,954.00

.40 cal Duty Ammunition | Speer Gold Dot/.40 SW, 180 Gr.

20¢cs | CCI-53962 20,000 rounds GDHP

No Bid No Bid None given | $ 6,000.00 | $386.50/1000 | $ 7,730.00

30 cs | CCI-53651 omm ZE)agt(l)((:)ergLT]réﬁ:nltlon Speed Lawman / 9mm, 124 Gr. No Bid No Bid None given | $ 5,684.10| $161.50/1000 | $ 4,845.00

60cs | 24459 223 Cal. Practicel Speer Lawman/ 223 Cal. S5 Gr. |\ iven | $ 12,995.40| None given | $ 8,052.60 | $288.80/1000 | $  8,664.00
Ammunition FMJ
. PBT-PC3- . . . . . )
3 jars P375 PepperBall Ammunition Pepperball/Purple-talc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $249.00/jar | $ 747.00
. PBT-PP- . . . . . )
4 jars W375 PepperBall Ammunition Pepperball/Water No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $249.00fjar | $ 996.00
4 cs 5307010 Simulation Rounds Simunation/9mm-Yellow No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $499.00 $ 1,996.00
4cs 5307010 Simulation Rounds Simunation/9mm-Blue No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid $499.00 $ 1,996.00
100 ALS 1208 12 Ga. Bore Thunder Distractin Rounds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Rounds




*International Cartridge

Bailey's House of Guns, Inc.

GT Distributors, Inc.

QTY Part # Item Brand/Description Unit Price Total Price | Unit Price |Total Price Unit Price [Total Price
1 7200 M Mini-Flash Bang Training | 1 free training body & 70 training No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
System fuses

1 9500 Sting Ball Training kit | * ™®® tra'”'”gﬂtj’;’s: & 70 training No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 DT-6325 40 mm Exact impact sponge rounds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2950 $ 147.50
5 |DT-1027-ws Gredades White Smoke TripleCcharge No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 46.80| $ 234.00

Granades
5 DT-1026-CS Gredades CS Rriot Control Grenades No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 4790 $ 239.50
5 DT-1082-CS Gredades CS Rriot Control Grenades No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 3535 $ 176.75
Total $ 12,995.40 | Total $ 31,104.90 | Total $  40,725.75
Approved by (Signature) Approved by (print)
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