



**Purchasing Department**

**BID # 09-054, Bid - Interior and Exterior for 4 Marked Patrol Vehicles**

**OPENING DATE: Wednesday, July 1, 2009**

<b>Discription</b>	<b>John Wright Associates, Inc.</b>	<b>Alamo Auto Supply</b>	<b>R.T.C., Inc.</b>	<b>Dailey and Wells</b>	<b>Adamson Industries Corp.</b>	<b>AEP, Inc.</b>	<b>Emergency Vehicle Supply Co. LLC</b>	<b>911 Vehicle</b>	<b>Southwestern Wireless, Inc.</b>	<b>Precision Mounting Technologies</b>	<b>GT Distributors</b>
Item A. Prisoner Transport Seat	No Bid	\$1,700.00	\$1,936.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,596.00	\$1,679.80	\$1,824.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,611.60
Item B. Prisoner Barrier	No Bid	\$2,980.00	\$3,306.00	No Bid	\$2,758.36	\$2,596.00	\$2,199.80	\$2,900.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,599.60
Item C. Go Rhino Grill Gard	No Bid	\$950.40	\$994.00	No Bid	\$634.56	\$916.00	\$799.80	\$708.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$927.60
Item D. SirenSpeaker	No Bid	\$420.00	Part of Item E	No Bid	\$435.56	\$588.00	\$519.80	\$612.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$519.60
Item E. FederalSignal Legend	No Bid	\$5,300.00	\$7,480.00	No Bid	\$7,180.00	\$4,600.00	\$5,396.00	\$6,620.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$3,919.60
Item F. Federal Electronic Siren/Switch	No Bid	\$1,440.00	Part of Item E	No Bid	\$1,355.56	\$1,260.00	\$1,140.00	\$1,372.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,287.60
Item G. Fire Extinguisher	No Bid	\$280.00	\$280.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$79.96	\$155.80	\$190.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$263.60
Item H. HeadlightFlasher	No Bid	\$252.00	\$276.00	No Bid	\$252.80	\$238.00	\$159.80	\$196.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$151.60
Item I. KustomSignals Digital Eyewitness ION Eclipse	No Bid	\$23,980.00	\$23,788.00	No Bid	No Bid	Vendor requested to Delet bid	No Bid	\$25,280.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Item J. Mouting Bracket	No Bid	\$4,520.00	\$5,068.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$5,500.00	\$4,783.80	\$3,580.00	No Bid	\$4,100.00	No Bid

Item K. Trunk equipment mount	No Bid	\$712.00	\$1,100.00	No Bid	\$628.08	\$554.00	\$623.80	\$576.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$643.60
Item L. Battery protection unit	\$374.64	\$320.00	\$300.00	No Bid	\$266.80	\$236.00	\$340.00	\$468.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$279.60
Item M. Programmable Shut Down Timer	\$374.64	\$320.00	\$300.00	No Bid	\$344.80	Intergrated w/Item L	\$278.00	\$316.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Item N. Secure-Idle	No Bid	\$540.00	\$620.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$421.08	\$559.80	\$396.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Item O. Mobile Radios-MA-COM	No Bid	\$10,796.00	\$8,510.00	\$10,721.00	No Bid	\$11,476.24	No Bid	\$15,880.00	\$9,400.00	No Bid	No Bid
Item P. Panasonic CF30 Tough w/3 yr warranty, prts & labor	\$17,460.00	\$19,200.00	\$18,080.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$17,420.48	\$19,700.00	\$20,100.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Item Q. Radar System	No Bid		\$11,320.00	\$11,480.00	No Bid	No Bid	Vendor requested to Delet bid	No Bid	\$11,544.00	No Bid	No Bid

**Corrected Copy**

LB 07/09/09

Approved By (signature)

Approved By (print)

**Sheriff's Office**

Department

Date