BID # 09-088,Re-bid Bid - Interior and Exterior for 4 Marked Patrol Vehicles

Purchasing Department

OPENING DATE: Wednesday, December 9, 2009

Discription Fleet Safety Alamo Auto Dailey and Adamspn AEP,NM A | Southwestern Precm.on GT
Equipment Suppl R-T.C., Inc. Wells Industries Soncell Co Wireless, Inc Mounting Distributors
(TOtaI for 4 ) quip PRl Corp. ) ’ _ | Technolodies
Item A. _ Prisoner $2,000.00 $1,640.00 | $1,592.00 No Bid No Bid $2,216.96 No Bid No Bid $1,611.60
Transport Seat
gsr”r”i;' Prisoner No Bid $2,700.00 $2,904.00 No Bid $3,183.56 | $3,422.20 No Bid No Bid $3,273.16
gae:; €. GoRhino Grill | o775 60 $908.00 $864.00 No Bid $639.48 $883.92 No Bid No Bid $927.60
Item D. SirenSpeaker $540.00 $420.00 $352.00 No Bid No Bid $647.00 No Bid No Bid $519.60
LfngnEd FederalSignal | o7 557 36 $4,740.00 $5,320.00 No Bid No Bid $7,030.40 No Bid No Bid $3,919.60
Item F. Federal . . . .
e . $1,313.28 $1,124.00 $1,180.00 No Bid No Bid $1,370.80 No Bid No Bid $1,287.60
Eleclronic Siren/Switch
Item G. Fire . . . . .
L No Bid $260.00 $256.00 No Bid No Bid $111.76 No Bid No Bid $263.60
Extinguisher
Item H. $807.84 $1,888.96 $880.00 No Bid $252.80 $796.80 No Bid No Bid $151.60
HeadlightFlasher
Item I. KustomSignals
Digital Eyewitness 10N No Bid $19,400.00 $19,996.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Eclipse
IBtfaTkit Mouting No Bid $4,400.00 $4,300.00 No Bid No Bid $4,458.40 No Bid $4,100.00 No Bid
Item K. Trunk $534.80 $680.00 $696.00 No Bid $628.28 $696.96 No Bid No Bid $643.60
equment mount
ltem L. Battery $374.64 $316.00 $260.00 No Bid $351.20 $240.00 No Bid No Bid $279.60
prOteCthn unit
Item M. Programmable . . . .
$374.64 $316.00 $260.00 No Bid $344.80 $200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Shut Down Timer




Item N. Secure-ldle No Bid $540.00 $512.00 No Bid No Bid $523.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid
;;ZTCSMMOb"e Radios 1 No Bid $10,720.00 | $8508.00 | $9,977.00 NoBid | $16,453.60 | $8,600.00 No Bid No Bid
Item P. Panasonic No Bid $16,800.00 | $17,200.00 No Bid No Bid $16,560.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
CF30 Toughbook

Item Q. Radar System No Bid $11,000.00 $11,220.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No CIQ - Deadlline is 12/18/09

Approved By (signature)

Sheriff's Office

Department

LB 12/14/09

Approved By ( Print)

Date




