Cabling Services for the County of El Paso Bid #11-019
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Cat5 cable - installed, terminated, tested and labeled including Ngg;:l(?;:m PLENUM COST Ng:;:ﬁi';:m PLENUM COST Ng:;:‘;';:m PLENUM COST Ng:;:ﬁi';:m PLENUM COST NZL‘;:L;:::M PLENUM COST NZL‘;:L;:::M PLENUM COST NZL‘;:L;:::M PLENUM COST NZL‘;:L;:::M PLENUM COST Ngg;:&i’;:m PLENUM COST Ngg;:&i’;:m PLENUM COST Ngg;:&i’;:m PLENUM COST Ngg;:"(i'::"' PLENUM COST Ngg;:"(i'::"' PLENUM COST
wall plate, jack and certification report Foom (PER FOOT) Foom (PER FOOT) Foom (PER FOOT) Foom (PER FOOT) Foom (PER FOOT) Foom (PER FOOT) Foom (PER FOOT) Foom (PER FOOT) Foom (PER FOOT) Foom (PER FOOT) Foom (PER FOOT) Foom (PER FOOT) Foom (PER FOOT)
0-10 Pulls
0-150 ft B 105.00 | $ 118.00 [ S 95.00 | $ 115.00 | S 80.00 | S 92.50 No Bid No Bid S 7439 | 87.90|$ 82275 9461 82.50 S 40.00 | $ 50.00 | No Bid No Bid S 105.00 [$ 125.00 S 105.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
151-300 ft. B 129.00 | S 144.00 | S 100.00 [ S 12000 | S 85.00|$ 98.50 No Bid No Bid S 9239 11939 [$ 11410 [$ 13451 [ 95.00 S 4550 |$ 55.00 | No Bid No Bid S 155.00 [$ 175.00 S 115.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11-50 Pulls
0-150 ft B 102.00 | $ 11500 | S 90.00 | $ 11000 | S 7650 | S 91.50 No Bid No Bid S 7216 | S 8526 | S 8145 9367 ]S 82.00 S 40.00 | $ 50.00 | No Bid No Bid S 100.00 [ $ 120.00 S 95.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
151-300 ft. B 126.00 | S 141.00 | S 95.00 | $ 115.00 | S 80.00|$ 92.50 No Bid No Bid S 8962 | 11581 [ S 11295 [$ 13317 [ S 94.50 S 4550 |$ 55.00 | No Bid No Bid S 150.00 [ $ 170.00 S 115.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
51-100 Pulls
0-150 ft S 99.00 [ $ 112,00 | S 85.00|$ 105.00 | S 7200 91.50 No Bid No Bid S 7067 | S 8351 8064 | S 9273 81.50 S 40.00 | $ 50.00 | No Bid No Bid S 95.00 | $ 115.00 S 95.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
151-300 ft. B 123.00 | S 136.00 | S 90.00 | S 11000 | S 7650 | S 92.50 No Bid No Bid S 87.77]$ 11342 [ 11183 [$ 13184 [ 94.00 S 4550 |$ 55.00 | No Bid No Bid S 14500 [ $ 165.00 S 115.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
101-200 Pulls
0-150 ft S 97.00 [ S 108.00 | S 80.00 | S 11000 | S 71.00|$ 89.50 No Bid No Bid S 68.44 | S 80.87 | S 7983 |$ 91.80|$ 81.00 S 40.00 | $ 50.00 | No Bid No Bid S 90.00 | $ 110.00 S 95.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
151-300 ft. B 12000 | $ 132.00 | S 85.00|$ 105.00 | S 75.00|$ 91.50 No Bid No Bid S 85.00|$ 109.84 [ S 11071 [ S 13052 [ S 93.50 S 4550 |$ 55.00 | No Bid No Bid S 140.00 | $ 160.00 S 115.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Over 200 Pulls
0-150 ft S 95.00 [ S 106.00 | S 75.00|$ 95.00|$ 70.00 | S 88.50 No Bid No Bid S 66.95 | S 7911 ]S 79.03|$ 90.89 | S 80.50 S 40.00 | $ 50.00 | No Bid No Bid S 85.00|$ 105.00 S 95.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
151-300 ft. B 117.00 | S 129.00 | S 80.00|$ 100.00 | S 74.00 | S 90.50 No Bid No Bid S 83.15|$ 10745 [ S 109.60 [$ 12921 [ 93.00 S 4550 | $ 55.00 | No Bid No Bid S 13500 [$ 155.00 S 115.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cat 5e cable - installed, terminated, tested and labeled including "2:;:‘;'::” PLENUM COST "'2:;?;’::” PLENUM COST "'2:;?;’::” PLENUM COST "'2:;?;’::” PLENUM COST "zg;:ﬁi’::m PLENUM COST Nzg;:L(i’::M PLENUM COST Nzg;:L(i’::M PLENUM COST Nzg;:L(i’::M PLENUM COST "g:;:ﬁ'::m PLENUM COST "g:;:ﬁ'::m PLENUM COST "g:;:ﬁ'::m PLENUM COST Ngg;:i’::'“ PLENUM COST Ngg;:i’::'“ PLENUM COST
wall plate, jack and certification report FoOT) (PER FOOT) Foom (PER FOOT) Foom) (PER FOOT) Foom (PER FOOT) Foomn (PER FOOT) Foomn (PER FOOT) Foomn (PER FOOT) Foon (PER FOOT) Foom (PER FOOT) Foom (PER FOOT) Foom (PER FOOT) Foom (PER FOOT) S (PER FOOT)
0-10 Pulls
0-150 ft $ 105.00 | $ 118.00 | S 95.00 | S 115.00 | S 80.00 | S 9250 S 7795 ]S 10137 [ S 7439 | 87.90|$ 8227 9461 93.00 S 5150 |$ 65.00 | S 76.00 [ $ 87.00|$ 11500 [$ 135.00 S 95.00|$ 9636 | $ 113.16 [ $ 11500 [ $ 120.00
151-300 ft. S 129.00 | S 144.00 | S 11000 [ S 12000 | S 85.00|$ 9850 | S 98.90 | S 138.00 [$ 9239 11939 [$ 11410 [$ 13451 [ 109.00 S 60.50 | $ 81.00]$ 100.00 [ $ 13500 [$ 165.00 [ $ 185.00 S 115.00 [ $ 119.25 [ $ 152.86 [ $ 12500 [ $ 135.00
11-50 Pulls
0-150 ft $ 102.00 | $ 115.00 | S 90.00 | $ 11000 | S 7650 | S 9150|$ 7316 | S 96.09 | $ 7216 | S 8526 | S 8145 9367 ]S 92.50 S 5150 |$ 65.00 | S 7000 [ $ 80.00|$ 11000 [ $ 130.00 S 95.00 | $ 9360 |$ 109.29 [$ 11500 [ $ 120.00
151-300 ft. S 126.00 | S 141.00 | S 95.00 | S 115.00 | S 80.00 | S 9250|$ 9227 13073 [ S 8962 | 11581 [ S 11295 [$ 13317 [ S 108.50 S 60.50 | $ 81.00]$ 95.00 | $ 13000 [$ 155.00 [$ 180.00 S 115.00 [ $ 11497 | $ 14633 [$ 12500 [ $ 135.00
51-100 Pulls
0-150 ft B 99.00 [$ 112.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 105.00 | $ 72.00 | $ 9150 $ 71323 94.09 | $ 7067 | $ 8351]$ 80.64 | $ 927313 92.00 S 5150 | $ 65.00 | $ 7000 [$ 80.00]$ 105.00 | $ 125.00 S 95.00]$ 91193 10589 | $ 115.00 | $ 120.00
151-300 ft. $ 123.00 | $ 136.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 11000 [ $ 7650 | S 9250 ]S 8836 |S 12648 [$ 87.77]$ 11342 [ S 11183 [$ 13184 [$ 108.00 S 60.50 | $ 8100 95.00 | $ 13000 [$ 150.00 [ $ 175.00 $ 11500 [ $ 11112 | $ 14062 [ $ 12500 [ $ 135.00
101-200 Pulls
0-150 ft B 97.00 [ $ 108.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 71.00 | $ 8950 | $ 69.69 | $ 92333 68.44 | $ 8087 |$ 7983 |$ 91803 91.50 S 5150 | $ 65.00 | $ 7000 [$ 80.00]$ 100.00 | $ 120.00 S 95.00]$ 89.06 | $ 102.90 | $ 11000 | $ 115.00
151-300 ft. $ 12000 | $ 132.00 | $ 85.00|$ 105.00 | $ 75.00 S 9150|$ 8673 | S 12472 |$ 85.00|$ 109.84 |$ 11071 [$ 13052 [$ 107.50 S 60.50 | $ 8100 95.00 | $ 13000 [$ 14500 [ $ 170.00 $ 11500 [ $ 10791 [$ 13559 [$ 11500 [ $ 130.00
Over 200 Pulls
0-150 ft B 95.00 [$ 106.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 8850 | $ 6550 | $ 8777]$ 66.95 | $ 79.11]$ 7903 |$ 9089 |$ 91.00 S 5150 | $ 65.00 | $ 70.00 [$ 80.00]$ 95.00 | $ 115.00 S 95.00]$ 8717 (S 10024 | $ 11000 | $ 115.00
151-300 ft. S 117.00 | $ 129.00 | $ 80.00|$ 100.00 | $ 74.00 | S 90.50 | $ 8255|$ 12015 [$ 83.15|$ 10745 [$ 109.60 [ $ 12921 [ 107.00 S 60.50 | $ 8100 95.00 | $ 13000 [$ 140.00 [ $ 165.00 S 11500 | $ 10497 | $ 13111 [$ 11500 [ $ 130.00
Cat 6 cable - installed, terminated, tested and labeled including "':g;:l(?:ﬁm PLENUM COST "z:;l(i';im PLENUM COST "z:;'ﬂ;:m PLENUM COST "z:;l(i';im PLENUM COST Ng:;:ﬁﬂm PLENUM COST Ng:;:ﬁﬂm PLENUM COST Ng:;:ﬁﬂm PLENUM COST Ng:;:ﬁﬂm PLENUM COST "g:;:";’:ﬁ"' PLENUM COST "g:;:";’:ﬁ"' PLENUM COST "g:;:";’:ﬁ"' PLENUM COST Ngg;:";’::"' PLENUM COST Ngg;:";’::"' PLENUM COST
wall plate, jack and certification report ) (PER FOOT) i) (PER FOOT) ) (PER FOOT) ) (PER FOOT) ) (PER FOOT) ) (PER FOOT) ) (PER FOOT) o) (PER FOOT) o) (PER FOOT) o) (PER FOOT) o) (PER FOOT) o) (PER FOOT) o) (PER FOOT)
0-10 Pulls
0150t S 11800 [ § 134.00 [$ 11500 [$ 13000 [$ 89.50 [ $ 11650 | 90.71[$ 12491 |$ 87.09]$ 108.09 [ $ 90.78[$ 111.73 [ $ 114.00 S 68.75 S 89.25|$ 8500 9500 125.00 [ $ 145.00 $ 115.00 [ $ 116.95 [ § 142.52 [ § 125.00 [ $ 135.00
151-300 ft. S 152,00 [ § 184.00 | $ 12000 [$ 135.00 |$ 91.50[$ 13650 | 12092 [$ 179.78 | 11559 [ § 157.59 127.31 [$ 162.07 | $ 140.00 s 8300 114.00 | $ 125.00 [ $ 165.00 | $ 175.00 [ $ 195.00 $ 125.00 [ $ 152.75 [ § 20388 | 135.00 [ § 155.00
1150 Pulls
0150t S 115.00 [ § 131.00 [$ 11000 [$ 12500 |$ 89.50 [ $ 11650 | 8591 119.63 | $ 84483 104.85 [ § 89.87 S 11061 [ $ 113.50 S 68.75 S 89.25 S 80003 90.00]$ 120.00 [ § 140.00 $ 115.00 [ $ 112.82 [ $ 136.69 [ $ 125.00 [ § 135.00
151-300 ft. S 148.00 [ § 180.00 | $ 11500 [$ 13000 [$ 91.50[$ 13650 | 11429 [$ 172.50 | 112.12 [§ 152.86 | $ 126,04 [ $ 160.45 | $ 139.00 s 8300 114.00 | $ 120.00 [ § 160.00 | $ 170.00 [ $ 190.00 $ 125.00 [ $ 146.23 [ $ 193.96 [ $ 135.00 [ § 155.00
51-100 Pulls
0150t S 112.00 [ § 127.00 |'$ 105.00 [ $ 12000 [$ 89.50 [ $ 114.50 | $ 84.07[$ 117.63 | $ 82745 102,69 [ $ 8897 S 109.50 [ § 113.00 S 68.75 S 89.25 ¢ 8000 90.00]$ 115.00 [ $ 135.00 $ 115.00 [ $ 109.21 [ $ 131.58 [ § 125.00 [ $ 135.00
151-300 ft. S 145.00 [ § 174.00 |'$ 11000 [$ 12500 |$ 91.50[$ 133.50 | $ 11038 [$ 168.25 | $ 109.81 [ § 149.71 [ $ 124.78 [ $ 158.88 | $ 138.00 s 8300 114.00 | 120.00 [ $ 160.00 | $ 165.00 [ $ 185.00 $ 125.00 [ $ 140.53 [ § 185.27 [ $ 135.00 [ § 155.00
101-200 Pulls
0150t S 109.00 [ § 123.00 [$ 100.00 [$ 11500 |$ 87.50 S 114.50 | $ 82443 11587 | $ 8012 [ 99.44]$ 8808 S 10841 [ $ 112.50 S 68.75 S 89.25 S 8000 90.00]$ 110.00 [ § 130.00 $ 115.00 [ $ 106.02 [ $ 127.08 [ $ 120.00 [ $ 130.00
151-300 ft. S 142.00 [ § 169.00 | $ 105.00 [ $ 12000 [$ 91.00[$ 133.50 | $ 108.75 [ $ 166.49 | $ 106.34 [ $ 144.98 [ § 123.53 [ § 157.25 [ $ 137.00 s 8300 114.00 | $ 120.00 [ § 160.00 | $ 160.00 [ $ 180.00 $ 125.00 [ $ 135.50 [ § 117.61 [ $ 130.00 [ $ 150.00
Over 200 Pulls
0150t S 106.00 [ § 12000 [$ 9500 11000 [$ 87.50 S 113.50 | $ 78.26 [ $ 11131 |$ 7838 [ $ 97.28]$ 87.20]$ 107.32 [ $ 112.00 S 68.75 S 89.25 ¢ 80003 90.00]$ 105.00 [ $ 125.00 $ 115.00 [ $ 103.19 [ $ 123.07 [ $ 120.00 [ $ 130.00
151-300 ft. S 139.00 [ § 165.00 | $ 100.00 [ $ 11500 | $ 91.00]$ 13250 | $ 104.56 | 161.93 | $ 104.03 [$ 141.83 [ § 122.30 [ $ 155.68 | $ 136.00 s 8300 114.00 | $ 120.00 [ $ 160.00 | $ 155.00 [ $ 175.00 $ 125.00 [ $ 131.03 [ $ 170.80 [ $ 130.00 [ $ 150.00
Cat Ge cable - installed, terminated, tested and labeled including | "one o™ | prenum cost | NONPLENUM | oy cosr | NONPLENUM | o) ey cost [ NONPLENUM | ey cost | NONPLENUM | by vy cost | NONPLENUM | oy eyym cost | NONPLENUM | ey cost | NONPLENUM | by vy cost | NONPLENUM | oy ey cost [ NONPLENUM | ) enym cost | NONPLENUM | oy vy cost | NONPLENUM | oy eyyyp cost [ NONPLENUM |, enym cost
wall plate, jack and certification report G5 (PER FOOT) Sesyes (PER FOOT) EEI (PER FOOT) Sesyes (PER FOOT) EEA (PER FOOT) G (PER FOOT) G (PER FOOT) COST (PER (PER FOOT) COST (PER (PER FOOT) COST (PER (PER FOOT) B (PER FOOT) CEACEE (PER FOOT) CEACEE (PER FOOT)

. FooT) FooT) FooT) FooT) FooT) FoOT) FoOT) FoOT) FoOT) FoOT) FoOT) FooT) FooT)

0-10 Pulls
0-150 ft s 146.00 | § 188.00 | $ 140.00 [ $ 160.00 [$ 89.50 | $ 11650 [ 9515 126.27 [ § 105.09 [$ 147.09 [ $ 9863 123.02 No Bid $ 8800 120.75 NoBid No Bid $ 135.00 [ $ 155.00 No Bid s 153.69 [ $ 21310 NoBid NoBid
151-300 ft. s 206.00 [ § 289.00 [ $ 145.00 [$ 165.00 [$ 91.50[$ 136.50 | 12018 [§ 18232 [$ 15159 [$ 23559 |$ 140.40 [ $ 18090 No Bid $ 10850 [ $ 157.75 No Bid No Bid $ 185.00 [ $ 205.00 No Bid s 21383 [$ 33266 NoBid NoBid
11-50 Pulls
0-150 ft S 143.00 [ § 18400 [$ 135.00 [$ 155.00 [$ 89.50 [ $ 11650 [ 90.36 [ $ 121.00 [$ 10194 [$ 14268 [ $ 9762 12179 No Bid $ 88003 12075 No Bid No Bid $ 130.00 [ $ 150.00 No Bid s 147.11 [ § 20256 NoBid NoBid
151-300 ft s 201.00 [ § 283.00 [ $ 140.00 [ $ 160.00 [$ 91.50[$ 136.50 | 12254 [$ 175.04 [ $ 14704 [$ 22852 [$ 139.00 [ $ 179.09 No Bid $ 10850 [ $ 157.75 No Bid No Bid $ 18000 [ $ 200.00 No Bid $ 203.25 | $ 31415 NoBid NoBid
51-100 Pulls
0-150 ft s 140.00 [ § 178.00 | $ 130.00 [ $ 150.00 [$ 89.50 [ $ 114.50 [ $ 8852 119.00 [ $ 99.84[$ 13974 [$ 9667 [ S 12058 No Bid $ 88003 120.75 NoBid No Bid $ 12500 [§ 145.00 No Bid $ 14135 [ $ 193.34 NoBid NoBid
151-300 ft. s 196.00 | § 274.00 | 135.00 [$ 155.00 [$ 91.50[$ 13350 [ $ 11863 [$ 170.79 [ $ 14401 [$ 22381 [$ 13761 [ $ 17730 No Bid $ 10850 [ $ 157.75 No Bid No Bid $ 17500 [$ 195.00 No Bid s 193.98 [ $ 297.96 NoBid NoBid
101-200 Pulls
0-150 ft s 137.00 [ § 172.00 [$ 125.00 [$ 145.00 [$ 87.50 S 11450 [ $ 86.89 [ S 117.24 [ § 96.68 | $ 13532 [§ 9570 S 11937 No Bid $ 88003 120.75 NoBid No Bid $ 12000 [$ 14000 No Bid $ 13627 [$ 18520 NoBid NoBid
151-300 ft s 192,00 [ § 265.00 [ $ 130.00 [ $ 150.00 [$ 91.00[$ 133.50 [ $ 117.00 [$ 16004 |$ 13946 [ $ 21674 | $ 13623 [$ 17552 No Bid $ 10850 [ § 157.75 No Bid No Bid $ 17000 [$ 19000 No Bid $ 185.80 [ $ 283.66 NoBid NoBid
Over 200 Pulls
0-150 ft s 134.00 [ § 169.00 | $ 120.00 [ $ 140.00 [$ 87.50 [ $ 11350 [ $ 82715 11267 [ § 9458 13238 [§ 9475 11818 No Bid $ 88003 120.75 NoBid No Bid s 11500 [$ 135.00 No Bid $ 13176 [$ 17797 NoBid NoBid
151-300 ft s 188.00 | § 260.00 [ $ 125.00 [$ 145.00 [$ 91.00[$ 132.50 [ $ 112.82 [§ 164.47 [ § 13643 [$ 212,03 |$ 13487 [$ 17377 No Bid $ 10850 [ $ 157.75 No Bid No Bid $ 165.00 [ $ 185.00 No Bid $ 17854 [$ 27096 NoBid NoBid
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Cat 6a cable - installed, terminated, tested and labeled including "g:;:l;':ﬁm PLENUM COST Ng:;"(i';:"' PLENUM COST Ng:;"(i';:"' PLENUM COST Ng:;"(i';:"' PLENUM COST "g:;"(i'z:"' PLENUM COST "g:;"(i'z:"' PLENUM COST "g:;"(i'z:"' PLENUM COST "g:;"(i'z:"' PLENUM COST "gg;"(i'::"' PLENUM COST "gg;"(i'::"' PLENUM COST "gg;"(i'::"' PLENUM COST Ngg;"(i':;m PLENUM COST Ngg;"(i':;m PLENUM COST
wall plate, jack and certification report ) (PER FOOT) ) (PER FOOT) ) (PER FOOT) ) (PER FOOT) e (PER FOOT) e (PER FOOT) e (PER FOOT) e (PER FOOT) et (PER FOOT) et (PER FOOT) et (PER FOOT) Fatom) (PER FOOT) Fatom) (PER FOOT)
0-10 Pulls
0150t S 146.00 [ § 188.00 | $ 175.00 [$ 195.00 [ § 179.00 [ § 233.00 [$ 13037 [$ 172.27 [ $ 112.00 [ $ 151.00 [ $ 12007 [$ 171.23 [ $ 160.00 $ 109.50 [ $ 148.75 [§ 110.00 [ $ 135.00 [ $ 145.00 [ $ 165.00 No Bid s 164.16 | $ 21286 | 150.00 [ $ 185.00
151-300 ft. S 206.00 [ § 289.00 | $ 180.00 [ $ 200.00 |$ 183.00 [ $ 273.00 |$ 182.43 [ $ 26024 | $ 163.00 [ $ 241.00 | $ 173.09 [ $ 25817 |$ 21000 $ 138.00 [ $ 196.75 | $ 180.00 [ $ 260.00 | $ 195.00 [ $ 215.00 No Bid $ 23478 | $ 33218 |$ 175.00 [ $ 235.00
11-50 Pulls
0150t $ 143.00 [ § 184.00 | $ 170.00 [ $ 190.00 ['$ 179.00 [$ 233.00 [$ 12558 [ $ 167.48 | 10864 [ $ 146.47 [ $ 11887 [ $ 169.52 | § 158.00 s 109.50 [ $ 148.75 [ § 100.00 [ $ 130.00 [ § 140.00 [ $ 160.00 No Bid s 156.88 [ $ 20234 |'$ 150.00 [ $ 185.00
151-300 ft. $ 201.00 [ § 283.00 | $ 175.00 [ $ 19500 |$ 183.00 [ $ 273.00 |'$ 17579 [ $ 25361 | $ 158.11 [ $ 23377 |'$ 17136 [ $ 25559 | $ 208.00 s 138.00 [ $ 196.75 | $ 170.00 [ $ 255.00 | $ 190.00 [ $ 21000 No Bid s 22279 [$ 31370 | $ 175.00 [ $ 235.00
51-100 Pulls
0150t $ 140.00 [ § 178.00 |'$ 165.00 [ $ 185.00 | $ 179.00 [$ 233.00 [$ 12374 [$ 165.64 | $ 106.40 [ $ 143.45 [ § 117.68 [ $ 167.82 [ $ 156.00 s 109.50 [ $ 148.75 [ $ 100.00 [ $ 130.00 [ § 135.00 [ $ 155.00 No Bid s 150.52 [ $ 193.13 [ $ 150.00 [ $ 185.00
151-300 ft. $ 196.00 [ § 274.00 |'$ 170.00 [ $ 190.00 |$ 183.00 [ $ 273.00 |'$ 171.88 [$ 249.70 | $ 154.85 [ $ 22895 |'$ 169.65 | $ 253.03 |$ 206.00 s 138.00 [ $ 196.75 | $ 170.00 [ $ 255.00 | $ 185.00 [ $ 205.00 No Bid s 212318 29753 | 175.00 [ $ 235.00
101-200 Pulls
0150t $ 137.00 [ § 172.00 |'$ 160.00 [ $ 180.00 | $ 179.00 [$ 233.00 [$ 12211 [$ 164.01 | $ 103.04 [ $ 138.92 [ § 116.50 [ § 166.14 | $ 154.00 s 109.50 [ $ 148.75 [ § 100.00 [ $ 130.00 [ § 130.00 [ $ 150.00 No Bid s 144.90 [ § 185.00 [ $ 145.00 [ $ 180.00
151-300 ft. $ 192.00 [ § 265.00 | $ 165.00 [ $ 185.00 |$ 183.00 [ $ 273.00 |'$ 17025 [ $ 248.07 | $ 149.96 [ $ 2172 |$ 167.95 [ $ 25050 | 204.00 s 138.00 [ $ 196.75 | $ 170.00 [ $ 255.00 | $ 180.00 [ $ 200.00 No Bid s 20350 | $ 28327 | $ 170.00 [ $ 23000
Over 200 Pulls
0150t $ 134.00 [ § 169.00 | 155.00 [ $ 175.00 | $ 179.00 [$ 233.00 [$ 117.92 [$ 159.82 | $ 100.80 [ § 13590 [ § 11534 [ $ 164.48 [ $ 152.00 s 109.50 [ $ 148.75 [ $ 100.00 [ $ 130.00 [ § 125.00 [ $ 145.00 No Bid s 139.90 [ § 177.78 [$ 145.00 [ $ 180.00
151-300 ft. S 188.00 [ § 260.00 | $ 160.00 [ $ 180.00 | $ 18300 [$ 273.00 |$ 166.07 | $ 24388 | $ 146.70 [ § 21690 | $ 166.27 [ $ 24800 | $ 202.00 B 13800 [ $ 196.75 |$ 170.00 [ $ 255.00 | $ 175.00 [ $ 195.00 No Bid $ 194.83 [ § 27058 | 170.00 [ $ 23000
Lowest Total Combined Cost $ 8,513.00 $ 6,785.00 $ 6,864.00 Not Complete $ 6,896.42 $ 7,181.80 No Bid $ 5,391.25 Not Complete B 8,000.00 Not Complete Not Complete Not Complete
(OPTIONAL) Cat 7 cable - installed, terminated, tested and "2:;:1(?:{,:'” PLENUM COST Ngg;:t(ir::m PLENUM COST Ngg;:t(ir::m PLENUM COST Ngg;:t(ir::m PLENUM COST ﬁ:z:\';ﬁ: ﬁ:z:\';ﬁ: Ng:;:"(i’::M PLENUM COST Ng:;:"(i’::M PLENUM COST Ng:;:"(i’::M PLENUM COST "g(’:;:"(i’::M PLENUM COST "g(’:;:"(i’::M PLENUM COST "g(’:;:"(i’::M PLENUM COST Ngg;:"(i’::M PLENUM COST Ngg;:"(i’::M PLENUM COST
labeled including wall plate, jack and certification report ) (PER FOOT) ) (PER FOOT) ) (PER FOOT) ) (PER FOOT) Recogniced Recogniced ) (PER FOOT) ) (PER FOOT) ) (PER FOOT) ) (PER FOOT) ) (PER FOOT) ) (PER FOOT) o) (PER FOOT) o) (PER FOOT)
0-10 Pulls No Bid No Bid
0-150ft S 251.00 | $ 251.00 No Bid No Bid S 358.00 [ S 466.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 235.00 No Bid No Bid S 175.00 | $ 195.00 S 225.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
151-300 ft. S 372.00 [ S 372.00 No Bid No Bid S 366.00 | S 546.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 420.00 No Bid No Bid S 225.00 | S 245.00 S 410.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11-50 Pulls No Bid No Bid
0-150ft S 245.00 | $ 245.00 No Bid No Bid S 358.00 [ S 466.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 235.00 No Bid No Bid S 173.00 | $ 193.00 S 225.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
151-300 ft. S 364.00 [ S 364.00 No Bid No Bid S 366.00 | S 546.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 420.00 No Bid No Bid S 223.00 | S 221.00 S 410.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
51-100 Pulls No Bid No Bid
0-150ft S 238.00 | $ 238.00 No Bid No Bid S 358.00 [ S 466.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 235.00 No Bid No Bid S 171.00 | $ 191.00 S 225.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
151-300 ft. S 353.00 [ S 353.00 No Bid No Bid S 366.00 | S 546.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 420.00 No Bid No Bid S 221.00 | $ 219.00 S 410.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
101-200 Pulls NoBid No Bid
0150t S 23000 | $ 230.00 No Bid No Bid S 358.00 [ $ 466.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid s 235.00 No Bid No Bid s 169.00 [ $ 189.00 s 225.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
151-300 ft. S 342.00 [ S 342.00 No Bid No Bid S 366.00 | S 546.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 420.00 No Bid No Bid S 219.00 | $ 217.00 S 410.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Over 200 Pulls NoBid No Bid
0-150ft S 225.00 [ $ 225.00 No Bid No Bid S 358.00 | $ 466.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 235.00 No Bid No Bid S 167.00 | $ 187.00 S 225.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
151-300 f. S 334.00 | § 334.00 No Bid No Bid B 366.00 | $ 546.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 420.00 No Bid No Bid S 217.00 | $ 215.00 3 410.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
" NON-PLENUM | 5, cnum cost | NONPLENUM | gy ey cost | NONPLENUM | ) ey cost | NON-PLENUM| by ey cost | NONPLENUM | gy ey cost | NONPLENUM |, ey cost | NON-PLENUM T by vy cost | NONPLENUM | oy ey cost | NONPLENUM | ) ey cost | NON-PLENUM T by vy cost | NONPLENUM | gy ey cost | NONPLENUM |y enym cost | NON-PLENUM T 5y vy cost
Fiber Optic cable (Multi Mode) (OM2 -50 Standard) COST (PER {PERFoOT) COST (PER {PERFoOT) COST (PER {PERFoOT) COST (PER {PERFoOT) COST (PER {PER FoOT) COST (PER {PER FoOT) COST (PER {PER FoOT) COST (PER (PERFoOT) COST (PER (PERFoOT) COST (PER (PERFoOT) COST (PER (PERFoOT) COST (PER (PERFoOT) COST (PER (PERFoOT)
FoOT) FoOT) FoOT) FoOT) FOOT) FOOT) FOOT) FOOT) FOOT) FOOT) FOOT) FOOT) FOOT)
Fiber cable should be quoted as a price per linear foot installed, NOTE: Plenum Innerduct for Plenum . . .
terminated, tested and labeled with certification report Rated: +$1.62t. No Footage Given thTE Pr:es are for OM3F.0. Lazer No Bid No Bid No Bid
nhance
2 Strands S 200 [s 365 [$ 3.00[$ 350 ¢ 2.95 [$ 395 [ 347 498 [ 223 [ 5087/52.49 [$ 3619 474 147 s 068 [$ 060 S 478 S 4.66 /A $ 057 No Bid NoBid NoBid $ 290 [$ 427
4 Strands s 206 [$ 371[$ 350 400 395 [ 495 [$ 375 [ 526 S 250 | $1.10/52.72 [$ 3879 502 [$ 161 S 112 [¢ 100 [$ 574 [$ 5.54 N/A $ 0.89 No Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid
6 Strands S 208 s 373[$ 4.00 [$ 450 [$ 495 [$ 695 S 395 [ 546 S 250 | $1.10/52.72 [$ 425 [ 540§ 174 s 151 [$ 139 [$ 647 [$ 632 N/A $ 162 No Bid NoBid NoBid $ 405 [$ 539
8 Strands s 226 [$ 391[¢ 7.50 [$ 8003 695 [ 895 [ 432[ 578 S 287 | $1.40/53.02 [$ 455 [ 582 [$ 1.88 S 197 [ 186 [$ 733 [$ 7.26 N/A N/A No Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid
10 Strands s 221 [ 409 [ 8003 850 695 [ 895 [ 4713 616 S 289 | $1.55/53.17 [$ 504 [$ 620 [$ 2.02 S 242 [ 230 [$ 813 [ 819 N/A N/A No Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid
12 Strands S 254 [ 402 [$ 850 [$ 9.00[$ 695 S 895 [ 545 679 S 292 | $1.55/53.17 [$ 528 [$ 644 [$ 215 s 274 [$ 262 [$ 898 S 8.83 N/A $ 2.80 No Bid NoBid NoBid $ 532 [$ 6.70
60 Strands S 7.99 [$ 1188 S 40.00 [ $ 42.00]$ 1795 [$ 2005 [$ 14.00 [$ 1673 [ $ 749 | $7.63/59.25 [$ 1501 [$ 2278 5.40 S 1097 [$ 1075 [$ 3131 [ 30.90 N/A $ 12.95 No Bid NoBid NoBid $ 10.13 [ $ 10.70
72 Strands s 1314 [$ 17.08|$ 45008 5000 2395 [$ 2695 S 1548 [$ 1820 [ $ 861 95/51057 [$ 1647 [$ 25.08|$ 621 s 1298 [$ 1274 37618 36.67 N/A $ 18.40 No Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid
96 Strands $ 1176 [ $ 17.42]$ 65.00]$ 7000 | $ 3595 39.95 ] 19.16 [$ 2566 | $ 1232 | $14.20/$15.82 [ § 2091 [$ 3283 (S 7.83 S 17.38 | S 17.04 [ $ 4788 ]S 46.63 N/A $ 20.40 No Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid
Fiber Optic cable (singie Moda) S28€ Standard Ng:;:‘;’;:m PLENUM COST "g:;:ﬁi’::m PLENUM COST "g:;:ﬁi’::m PLENUM COST "g:;:ﬁi’::m PLENUM COST "g:;:i’:ﬂm PLENUM COST "g:;:i’:ﬂm PLENUM COST "g:;:i’:ﬂm PLENUM COST "g:;:i’:ﬂm PLENUM COST "g:;:L(EP'::M PLENUM COST "g:;:L(EP'::M PLENUM COST "g:;:L(EP'::M PLENUM COST Ngg;:i’::'“ PLENUM COST Ngg;:i’::'“ PLENUM COST
PER FOOT] PER FOOT] PER FOOT] PER FOOT] PER FOOT] PER FOOT] PER FOOT] PER FOOT] PER FOOT] PER FOOT] PER FOOT] PER F PER F
FooT) ( 00T) FooT) ( 00T) FooT) ( 00T) FooT) ( 00T) FooT) ( 00T) FooT) ( 00T) FooT) ( 00T) FooT) ( -00T) FooT) ( 00T) FooT) { -00T) FooT) { 00T) FooT) { -00T) FooT) [{ 00T)
lenum Innerduct for Plenum
Installed, terminated, tested and labeled with certification report AU
2 Strands B 195]$ 3605 2005 250 % 3955 495]5 355|s 5.06f% 224 | $077/$239 | 3585 485 101 B 069 |5 0595 4743 4.60 A $ 0.59 No Bid S 502 |s 530f% 286 [ ¢ 4.5
4 Strands B 1985 363[5 250 s 300 495 |s 6.95]5 391]s 542$ 233 $0.88/$2.50 | S 396§ 521]% 125 B 146 [ $ 136f$ 554 |$ 5.40 A S 0.87 No Bid B 5.68 [$ 5.97 No Bid No Bid
6 Strands B 193 [$ 358[% 300(s 350 % 595|s 7.95[$ 419 |s 570 f$ 233 $0.88/$2.50 | S 437]s 558]% 1.50 B 204 (3 193] % 630 [$ 6.17 A $ 120 No Bid S 6.25 [ $ 676 % 370 [$ 5.20
8 Strands B 2085 373[$ 550|s 6.00]5 795 s 9.95]5 4.64 | 6.09]% 261 $1.21/$2.83 |$ 475 |s 598]% 174 B 262 [ ¢ 251% 713 (% 7.26 A N/A No Bid S 7.03 (% 7.43 No Bid No Bid
10 Strands B 2215 384 6005 650]5 795 |$ 9.95]5 51105 6569 267 $1.30/52.92 |$ 5205 631]$ 1.98 B 322 [$ 310] % 792 [$ 8.06 A N/A No Bid S 761 (¢ 8.01 No Bid No Bid
12 Strands B 212|$ 375] % 650|$ 7.00 | $ 795 |s 9.95]5 578 s 727$ 267 | $130/5292 |$ 5523 6635 222 B 381 369 % 867 |% 853 A $ 250 No Bid S 795 (% 82695 47418 6.10
60 Strands B 3685 7.56 | $ 3200 | s 35.00f$ 18.95 [ $ 2195 % 1332 [ ¢ 1547 $ 5.95 $5.65/$7.27 | 1598 | $ 2180 8.01 B 7.01]$ 16.99f 2969 | $ 29.57 A S 12.95 No Bid S 2326 | 24.10[ % 875 (¢ 930
72 Strands B 2995 518$ 40.00 [ $ 42.00] % 24.95 | ¢ 27.95)$ 1550 [ $ 1765 6.95 $7.35/$8.97 | $ 1850 | $ 2428 9.46 B 2079 |'$ 2027 % 3571 ¢ 35.59 A S 18.45 No Bid B 2551 [ 26.50 No Bid No Bid
96 Strands s 400 5.65]% 53.00 | 5600 $ 3695 | 3095[$ 1998 | s 2276 § 892 ] s1506/51668 | 2345 ['s 3137]$ 1235 s 27.76 | $ 27.04] $ 4882 |5 45.56 N/A s 20.40 No Bid s 2081 s 33.88 No Bid No Bid
Lowest Total Combined Cost $ 11001 s 361.00 s 270.10 s 187.00 $ 226.32 No Bid $ 127.78 $ 305.74 Not Complete No Bid Not Complete Not Complete
! i ibuti i -PLE -PLE -PLE -PLE -PLE -PLE -PLE -PLE -PLE -PLE NON-PLEN NON-PLEN
[P D (7 MEd (Zw, Gaxy pLenum cost [ NONPLENUM by enim cost | NONPLENUM | enym cost | NONPEENUM | g enum cost | NONPLENUM | pyenum cost | NONPLENUM | enum cost | NONPEENUM | pienum cost | NONPLENUM | pienum cost | NONPLENUM | i enum cost | NONPLENUM | pienum cost | NONPEENUM | pienum cost | NONPENUM | enum cost | NONPLENUML penum cost
satellite (DSS, VSAT)) - installed, terminated, tested and labeled| ~ COST (PER o COST (PER o COST (PER o COST (PER o COST (PER e COST (PER e COST (PER e COST (PER ) COST (PER ) COST (PER ) COST (PER ) COST (PER ey COST (PER ey
including wall plate, jack and certification report FooT) FooT) FooT) FoOT) FOOT) FoOoT) FoOoT) FOOT) FoOT) FoOT) FOOT) FOOT) FOOT)
RG6 Coaxial Cable Weatherproof direct burial cable for outdoor o indoor hook|
o of satelite lsh, offair antonna, Vs, VCR, fc, NO BID NO BID $ 045 | $ 0.65 $ 14140 | $ 22726 $ 065 | $ 08| s 043 | % 0.67 No Bid No Bid $ 051 | $ 0.54 $ 042 | $ 0.98 $ 105.00| $ 183 | $ 209 $ 090 | $ 098
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[mis Cabling Products Description
19 Data Rack - Including rack screws and Installation kit" 175.00 281.00 22000 175.00 195.00 173.56 187.90 150.00 209.00 159.00 39% 207.15 22000
Ladder Rack-Including installation kit — (Price per ft] 16.00 9.00 24.95 14.83 7.25 2930 1737 075 1836 12.50 20% 24.00 15.00
RaceWav (Price per foot) 185 3.50 195 154 024 457 5.95 1.60 15.99 235 20% 10.25 6.70
Conduit (2in PVC) (Price per Foot) 055 1.00 495 067 025 348 514 7.50 076 2.85 6.50 059
24 Port Patch Modular 23.00 30.00 185.00 20.89 23.00 3198 2154 24.00 28.00 90.00 39% 23.15 | (5e) 125.00 (cat 6 175.00
48 port Patch Modular 42.00 54.00 255.00 3857 42.33 55.06 3975 45.00 46.00 125.00 39% 44.15 | (cat5e) 250.00 | (cat 6) 345.00
24 Port Patch Full 184.00 | Cat 5e $156.00 | Cat 6 $213.00 265.00 121.21 121.49 157.26 171.73 130.00 14175 129.00 39% 189.65 | (Se) 113.00 (6) 159.00
48 port Patch Full 395.00 | Cat 5e$310.00 | Cat 6 $460.00 395.00 242.09 242.65 31135 37050 255.00 27675 214.00 39% 409.17 | (5e) 225.00 6) 343.00
Single Faceplate 170 260 17.95 121 121 2.58 124 150 158 1.60 39% 2.08 140
Dual Faceplate 170 260 17.95 153 153 2.58 158 150 189 1.80 39% 2.08 172
Quad Faceplate 170 260 21.95 153 153 2.58 158 175 189 2.20 39% 2.08 172
Six Port Faceplate 170 260 21.95 153 153 2.58 158 175 189 225 39% 2.08 172
Horizontal Rack Mount-3.5" Panduit” Wire Manager 38.00 63.00 76.95 34.69 44.00 48.73 45.25 45.00 58.00 62.00 39% 63.12 52.00
Horizontal Rack Mount-1.75" Panduit" Wire Manager 33.00 57.00 48.95 29.70 3738 42.02 38.45 55.00 66.00 55.00 39% 53.65 43.00
Vertical-Dual Sided Rack Mount Wire Manager (Fits 19 Data Rack) $ 178.00 $ 290.00 $ 205.95 $ 30.01 $ 161.42 $ 287.59 $ 166.03 $ 170.00 $ 236.00 $ 210.00 39% $ 23163 $ 183.00
Fiber 24 Port Box s 161.00 s 370.00 s 205.95 s 146.29 s 146.62 s 427.10 s 150.81 s 160.00 s 187.00 s 421.00 N/A s 179.61 s 184.00
Fiber 72 Port Box s 201.00 s 730.00 S 475.00 S 182.04 s 182.45 s 860.64 s 187.66 s 199.00 s 227.00 s 22349 s 260.00
Connectors: 50pk Bulk Price
Cats 214.00 268.50 387.50 No Bid 227.85 23863 No Bid 150.00 NoBid 7.00 38.75% NoBid
Cat Se 214.00 268.50 387.50 193.05 227.85 238.63 s 199.50 213.40 $ 149.00 8.00 38.75% 268.00 s 10.00
Cat6 313.00 370.50 495.00 282.15 E 33285 301.88 S 291.00 30635 s 360.00 9.00 38.75% 37150 s 12.00
Cat 6e 446.00 370.50 495.00 282.15 E 33285 301.88 No Bid 43395 No Bid 10.00 No Bid 526.00 NoBid
Cat6a 446.00 699.50 682.50 404.25 469.35 501.98 s 417.50 44055 s 500.00 11.00 No Bid 526.00 No Bid
1000ft Cable Box: Bulk Price
Cats 209.00 85.00 210.00 168.75 275.00 No Bid 11235 193.20 136.85 205.85 s 140.40 117.85 203.01 No Bid No Bid 192.00 280.00 No Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid
Cat Se 209.00 85.00 210.00 168.75 275.00 115.41 11235 193.20 136.85 205.85 s 194.40 122.85 21301 |8 14800 [ § 251.00 207.00 295.00 No Bid 142.43 24697 | $ 130.00 [ $ 22000
Cat6 330.00 115.00 309.00 231.25 387.50 185.74 179.55 307.65 178.25 296.70 S 31320 192.11 32931 268.00 [ $ 387.00 232.00 32000 No Bid 22273 38181 |$ 20000 [ $ 32000
Cat 6e 638.00 115.00 309.00 245.00 416.50 214.63 179.55 307.65 224.25 362.25 No Bid 274.43 492,67 No Bid No Bid 249.00 380.00 No Bid 37424 743.93 No Bid NoBid
Cat6a 638.00 244,95 81595 437.50 750.00 351.52 340.20 587.10 32315 615.25 s 616.60 378.98 64034 | 44500 | $ 752.00 325.00 429.00 No Bid 493.40 74243 | $ 38000 | $ 640.00
Cable Jumpers/Patch Bulk Price
3t RIS Patch Cord Bulk Price 10/pk
Cats 285 3.01 4.60 No Bid 2.87 351 s 187 29.50 NoBid 4.00 39% No Bid NoBid
Cat Se 285 3.01 4.60 255 2.87 351 s 2.64 2950 s 3.46 4.80 39% s 343 s 283
Cat6 5.55 3.60 9.00 5.03 5.82 6.57 S 3.47 57.20 S 6.72 5.80 39% S 6.64 S 5.48
Cat 6e 850 3.60 9.00 5.03 582 657 No Bid 59.50 NoBid 6.40 No Bid $ 1017 NoBid
Cat6a 850 1375 12.50 771 891 1007 $ 7.95 87.70 s 1130 870 No Bid' NoBid s 9.40
5ft R4S Patch Cord Bulk Price 10/pk
Cats 315 430 5.40 No Bid 3.20 381 s 197 30.00 NoBid 6.00 39% No Bid NoBid
Cat Se 315 430 5.40 284 3.20 381 s 2.93 33.10 s 3.89 6.80 39% 384 s 317
Cat6 6.00 8.00 10.60 5.43 628 741 $ 561 61.80 s 7.26 7.80 39% 717 s 592
Cat 6e 935 8.00 10.60 5.43 628 741 No Bid 65.00 NoBid 8.40 No Bid 11.17 NoBid
Cat6a 935 1554 17.25 847 9.80 11.06 $ 874 96.30 s 1231 10.70 No Bid 11.17 s 10.22
7ft R4S Patch Cord Bulk Price 10/pk
Cats 450 6.20 No Bid 3.62 4.43 s 592 35.00 NoBid 6.50 39% No Bid NoBid
Cat Se 450 6.20 322 3.62 443 s 333 37.50 s 4.40 7.80 39% 435 s 359
Cat6 . 835 14.00 5.86 6.79 7.65 S 6.05 66.70 S 7.83 8.80 39% 7.73 S 6.38
Cat 6e 10. 835 14.00 5.86 679 765 No Bid 67.50 NoBid 9.40 NoBid 12.20 NoBid
Cat6a 10. 1734 21.00 923 10.69 12.06 s 951 105.20 s 1335 11.70 No Bid 12.20 s 11.00
10 ft - 15 ft RIAS Patch Cord 10ft 15ft ulk Price 10/pk
Cats 4. 5.60 7.40 No Bid 432 5.02 5.19 s 427 40.00 NoBid 6.90 39% NoBid
Cat Se 4. 5.60 7.40 385 432 5.02 519 s 4.60 43.70 s 513 835 39% 5.07 s 418
Cat6 8. 950 16.20 6.49 751 8.49 848 $ 756 73.90 s 868 9.10 39% 857 $ 7.08
Cat 6e 12. 950 16.20 6.49 751 8.49 8.48 No Bid 75.00 No Bid 10.40 No Bid 13.37 NoBid
Cat6a 1290 20.08 28.40 10.13 11.72 13.50 13.23 s 13.03 115.30 s 1454 No Bid 13.37 s 12.00
Lowest Total Combined Cost $ 524925 $ 589078 $ 722190 $ 316585 $ 451651 $ 585178 $ 367611 $ 5,881.34 $ 401573 $ 3,387.90 $ 561093 $ 203410
Cabling Services / Standard Rate Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost
General Per Hour Rate 37. 32, 32. 6 5 5 40.00
Cabling Technical Support/ 75, 32 38, 4 5 7 20.00
Cabling System Design/Large Project 150. 45 48. 8 12 5 50.00
Cable Removal 751 32, 32, 2 4 5 40.00
Furniture/ Office Equipment Moving and Replacing 75 32, 32, 5: 4 7 5 20.00
Labor Cost per Pull - Copper(No Materials)
Oft — 150ft S 75.00 s 50.00 s 52.50 s 58.50 s 35.00 s 32.50 s 56.09 s 35.00 $ 100.00 s 50.00 s 30.00 s 45.00 s 40.00
151ft - 300ft S 112.50 S 50.00 S 65.00 S 64.75 S 45.00 S 40.62 S 57.89 S 35.00 S 150.00 S 85.00 S 35.00 S 55.00 s 45.00
Cost per ft. after 300ft S 050 S 50.00 S 75.00 S 120 S0.15ft S 012 S 57.89 S 35.00 N/A S 2.00 S 65.00 s 45.00
Labor Cost per Pull - Fiber (No Materials) Nobid
Oft - 150ft S 112.50 S 55.00 3 95.00 S 58.50 S 35.00 S 48.74 S 131.95 S 55.00 s 150.00 S 55.00 S 75.00 s 40.00
151ft - 300ft S 150.00 S 55.00 S 155.00 S 64.75 S 45.00 S 56.87 S 131.95 S 55.00 S 200.00 S 85.00 S 85.00 s 45.00
Cost per ft. after 300ft s 075 s 55.00 s 225.00 s 120 S0.15ft s 018 s 131.95 S 55.00 N/A $ 3.00 $ 95.00 s 45.00
Fiber Termination Labor Cost (Per Pair) S 1875 $ 24.00 S 65.00 $ 22.00 $ 1733 $ 18.00 S 85.00 $ 25.00 S 60.00 $ 92.00
Lowest Total Combined Cost $ 882.50 $ 609.00 $ 102650 $ 443.90 $ 260.00 $ 38025 $ 72072 $ 627.50 $ 940.00 $ 574.00 $ 21250 $ 775.00 $ 562,00

GREEN - lowest in category

PINK - No Response or % Response
YELLOW - Overall Lowest

GOLD - 2nd Lowest




