
Business Forms 

Inc.
O.K. Paper

Shelby 

Distributions Inc.
Spectrum Paper

Western Paper 

Distributors

Description Ordered
Estimated 

Usage
Price Price Price Price Price

8 ½ x 11 Paper Bond 

White Letter Size 20#
(As Per Demand) 2400 CS. $29.25 $29.50 $27.95 $27.80 $28.50

8 ½ x 14 Paper Bond 

White Legal Size 20#
(As Per Demand) 500 CS. $43.25 $33.50 $41.00 $39.00 NO BID

11 x 17 Paper Bond White 

20#
(As Per Demand) 50 CS. $37.25 $34.40 $31.80 $30.25 NO BID

8 ½ x 11 Letter Size 25% 

Cotton Paper
(As Per Demand) 200 CS. NO BID $96.10 NO BID $94.80 NO BID

2-Part NCR 20# Reverse 

Sequence Imation
(As Per Demand) 80 CS. NO BID $61.20 NO BID $65.00 NO BID

3-Part NCR 20# Reverse 

Sequence Imation
(As Per Demand) 80 CS. NO BID $68.80 NO BID $73.20 NO BID

4-Part NCR 20# Reverse 

Sequence Imation
(As Per Demand) 80 CS. NO BID $73.55 NO BID $78.25 NO BID

5-Part NCR 20# Reverse 

Sequence Imation
(As Per Demand) 80 CS. NO BID $75.60 NO BID $80.99 NO BID

2-Part NCR 20# Straight 

Sequence Imation
(As Per Demand) 50 CS. NO BID $61.20 NO BID $65.00 NO BID

3-Part NCR 20# Straight 

Sequence Imation
(As Per Demand) 50 CS. NO BID $68.80 NO BID $73.20 NO BID

4-Part NCR 20# Straight 

Sequence Imation
(As Per Demand) 50 CS. NO BID $73.55 NO BID $78.25 NO BID

#10 Envelope 24# 

Window
(As Per Demand) 600 BX. $9.65 $9.26 NO BID $8.95 NO BID

#10 Envelope 24# Regular 

Plain
(As Per Demand) 600 BX. $8.25 $7.80 NO BID $7.69 NO BID

#9 Envelope 24# Window (As Per Demand) 300 BX. $8.95 $9.26 NO BID $8.95 NO BID

#9 Envelope 24# Regular 

Plain
(As Per Demand) 300 BX. $7.61 $7.80 NO BID $7.69 NO BID
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