BID # 13-011
Vehicles for the County of El Paso
Bid Opening: March 20, 2013

Casa Ford Inc.

Massey Automotive L.P.

Dick Poe Dodge L.P.

Rudolph Chevrolet LLC

DESCRIPTION Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
Item 1
Pickup truck, % ton, extended cab, 2 wheeldrive,
Chevrolet Silverado 1500, Dodge Ram 1500, Ford f- $20,147.43 $21,914.00 $20,980.00 $24,051.00
150 or equal
Brand of Vehicle Ford 2013 Dodge Ram Quad Cab Tradesman 2014 Chevrolet
Express 4x

Model F150 Supercab Ram 1500 DSIL41-23B Silverado 1500
Earliest Possible Delivery A.R.O. 10 wks ARO 90 Days 90 - 120 Days 6 - 8 wks

Warranty

36 mo/36,000 miles
Bumper to Bumper
60 mo/60,000 Powertrain

3 year 36000 miles

3 yrs - 36000 miles
5 yrs or 100,000 miles Power
Train warranty

3 yrs - 36000 miles
5 yrs - 100,000 Drive Train

Item 2
Pickup truck, % ton, regular cab, 2 wheel drive,
Chevrolet Silverado 2500, Dodge Ram 2500, Ford F- $19,887.27 $22,905.00 $22,617.00 $21,369.00
250 or equal
Brand of Vehicle Ford 2013 Dodge Ram Reg Cab Tradesman 2014 Chevrolet

4x2 2500

Model F250 Ram 2500 DJ2L62 -26A Silverado 2500
Earliest Possible Delivery A.R.O. 10 wks ARO 90 Days 90 - 120 Days 6 - 8 wks

3 yrs - 36000 miles

3 yrs - 36000 miles

Warranty Same as above 3 year 36000 miles Syrsor 109,000 miles Power 5 yr - 100,000 Drive Train
Trﬂn warranty
Item 3
Cargo Van, 2 wheel drive, Dodge Ram $17,578.43 $21,100.00 NO BID $18,846.00
Cargo Van Tradesman or equal
Brand of Vehicle Ford 2013 Dodge NO BID 2014 Chevrolet
Model E150 Ram c/v Tradesman NO BID Express 1500
Earliest Possible Delivery A.R.O. 65-120 days ARO 90 Days NO BID 6 - 8 wks
. 3 yrs - 36000 miles
Warranty Same as above 3 year 36000 miles NO BID 5 yrs - 100,000 Drive Train
Item 4
Cargo Van, 2 wheel drive, Chevrolet
Express 2500 Cargo Van with extended $19,328.43 NO BID NO BID $21,666.00
Wheelbase WT RWD or equal
Brand of Vehicle Ford 2013 NO BID NO BID 2014 Chevrolet
Model E250 Supercargo NO BID NO BID Express 2500
Earliest Possible Delivery A.R.O. 65-120 days ARO NO BID NO BID 6 - 8 wks
- il
Warranty Same as above NO BID NO BID 3 yrs - 36000 miles

5 yrs - 100,000 Drive Train




Casa Ford Inc.

Massey Automotive L.P.

Dick Poe Dodge L.P.

Rudolph Chevrolet LLC

DESCRIPTION Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
Item 5
Passenger/Cargo van, 2 wheel drive, V6 automatic
transmission w/overdrive,
antilock brakes, dual air bags, daytime
lights, power steering, tilt wheel, cruise
control, front and rear air conditioning/ $21,622.43 $22,425.00 NO BID NO BID
heater, cloth interior, power windows and
doors, power mirrors, seven or eight
passenger with removable rear seat,
package rack on top, overhead console,
Brand of Vehicle Ford 2013 Dodge NO BID NO BID
Model E150 Clubwagon Grand Caravan SE NO BID NO BID
Earliest Possible Delivery A.R.O. 65-120 days ARO 90 Days NO BID NO BID
Warranty Same as above 3 year 36000 miles NO BID NO BID
Item 6
Sedan, all standard equipment and choice
of optional equipment. Ford Taurus SE, $21,251.43 $27,233.00 $18,692.00 $19,152.00
Model P2D, 3.5L engine, or equal.
Brand of Vehicle Ford 2013 Chrysler Dodge Avenger 2014 Chevrolet
Model Taurus SE 300 JSD H41 -27X Impala
Earliest Possible Delivery A.R.O. 10 wks ARO 90 Days 90- 120- Days 6 -8 wks

Warranty

Same as above

3 year 36000 miles

3 yrs or 36000 miles

3 yrs - 36000 miles
5 yrs - 100,000 Drive Train

All vendors have taken the Ethics Training and filed the CIQ

Approved by Signature

Purchasing

Department

Formal Bid Buyer

Approved by Signature

Date

LB 3/26/13




