Bid #13-013 General IT Hardware Equipment for the County of El Paso

CIP approved equipment Purchases

Description Check Point Services TSA * No Bid Bond Provided * Thrff*c': J :;::iogv
pe ode Q 0 ended Co De ptio Q 0 ended Co o ded
Award Basic User Desktop Dell Optiplex 310 MT 650 $621.98 | S 404,287.00 Basic User Desktop 650 S 666.32 | S 433,108.00
Award Laptop Dell Latitude E5430 350 $956.62 | S 334,817.00 Laptop w/dock 350 S 992.70 | $ 347,445.00
Laptop Options 350 |$ 200.34 | $ 70,119.00
Re-bid LaserJet Pro 400 Printer M401dn Dell B2360DN Laser Print/3yr 30 $254.99 | $ 7,649.70 M401dn Printerw/3yr 30 $ 392.35 | $ 11,770.50
Re-bid LaserJet Enterpr5ise 600 Printer M601dn Dell B3460DN Laser Print/3yr 16 $674.99 | $  10,799.84 M601dn 600 Printer/3yr 16 S 93470 | $ 14,955.20
Re-bid LaserJet Enterprise 600 Printer M602x Dell B5460DN Laser Print/3yr 4 $990.00 | $ 3,960.00 Laserjet 600 M602x/3yr 4 $ 1,512.70 | $ 6,050.80
Re-bid Desktop Scanner Fujitsu FI-6240Z 120 S 1,809.49 | $ 217,138.80 HP Scanjet 3000/3yr 120 S 391.77 | $ 47,012.40
Re-bid Label/Barcode Scanner Barcode Scanner 69 No-Bid No-Bid Barcode Scanner 69 $ 1,428.92 | $ 98,595.48
* AIR-CAP3502E-AK910 AIR-CAP3502E-AK910 6 No-Bid No-Bid
* AIR-ANT2422DB-R AIR-ANT2422DB-R 180 No-Bid No-Bid HP J9420A 1 S 4,294.20 | $ 4,294.20
* AIR-ANT5135DB-R AIR-ANT5135DB-R 180 No-Bid No-Bid J9420A ABA 1 S - S -
* SWAP3500-RCOVRY-K9 SWAP3500-RCOVRY-K9 6 No-Bid No-Bid J9697A 2 $ 455.78 | $ 911.56
* AIR-AP-BRACKET-1 AIR-AP-BRACKET-1 60 No-Bid No-Bid A110A3 1 S - S -
* AIR-AP-T-RAIL-R AIR-AP-T-RAIL-R 60 No-Bid No-Bid HA1001A3 2C4 2 S 247.21| S 494.42
* AIR-CAP3502E-ABULK AIR-CAP3502E-ABULK 60 No-Bid No-Bid J9590A 60 S 62043 | $ 37,225.80
* CON-SNT-3502EA CON-SNT-3502EA 60 No-Bid No-Bid HA109A3 1 S - S -
* CON-SNT-C352EA10 CON-SNT-C352EA10 6 No-Bid No-Bid HA109A3 2TM 60 S 183.53 | $ 11,011.80
* SP-SAU-NCS1M SP-SAU-NCS1M 6 No-Bid No-Bid S -
* APC Metered Rack APC Metered Rack 12 No-Bid No-Bid APC Metered Rack 12 S 2,764.68 | $ 33,176.16
* APC Smart-UPS APC Smart-UPS 12 No-Bid No-Bid APC Smart-UPS 12 S 553.26 | $ 6,639.12
* Virtualization Manager Virtualization Manager 1 No-Bid No-Bid Virtualizaion Manager 1 $ 1513172 | $ 15,131.72
3 R
S 5,308.07 | $ 978,652.34 $ 30,770.61 | $ 1,137,941.16 - S -

Recommendation to award the Dell Optiplex 3010MT and Dell Latitude E56430 Laptops to Check Point Services.

Recommendation to Re-Bid on: LaserJet Pro M401nd Printer, LaserJet Enterprise M601dn Printer, LaserJet Enterprise
M602x Printer, the Desktop Scanner, and Barcode Scanners.

* Recommendation to purchase the Network equipment under the City/County Interlocal Catolog agreement (through

State DIR) that was approved by Commissioner's Court on 3-4-13

TSA did not provide a "Bid Bond" and are disqualified

Three C's Technology was a "No Bid"

Approved by David Garcia, IT Director of ITD

Date:




