
Description QTY Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost

LaserJet Pro 400 Printer M401dn 30 $297.51 $8,925.30 $388.00 $11,640.00 NO BID NO BID $392.35 $11,770.50 $380.40 $11,412.00 NO BID

LaserJet Enterprise 600 Printer M601dn 16 $815.59 $13,049.44 $925.00 $14,800.00 NO BID NO BID $934.70 $14,955.20 $996.70 $15,947.20 NO BID

LaserJet Enterprise 600 Printer M602x 4 $1,314.56 $5,258.24 $1,493.00 $5,972.00 NO BID NO BID $1,512.70 $6,050.80 $1,466.50 $5,866.00 NO BID

Scanners 120 $849.26 $101,911.20 $894.00 $107,280.00 $798.78 $95,853.60 $1,122.01 $134,641.20 $379.80 $45,576.00 $839.00

Barcode Scanners 69 $1,262.48 $87,111.12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $383.80 $26,482.20 NO BID

TOTAL COST $216,255.30 $139,692.00 $95,853.60 $167,417.70 $105,283.40

NOTE:

SHI Government Solutions

Department Date

Department Recommendation

6/7/2013-EC(revised)

Toshiba Business Solutions

Approved By: (Signature) Approved By: (Print)

CDW Government LLC 

Vernon Hill, IL

Decision Tree Technologies 

El Paso, TX

The following bidders have been disqualified due to "No Bid Bond".

Bid #13-028

Printers, Scanners and Bar Code Readers for the County of El Paso

Opening Date:  Wednesday, May 8, 2013

CDW Government LLC-Price does not include the toner requirements.

Decision Tree Technologies stated that pricing was only good through June 30th.

Technical & Scientific Application (TSA)-stated all items included a 3yr extended warranty.

SHI Government Solutions 

El Paso, TX

Toshiba Business Solutions 

San Antonio, TX

Southern Computer 

 Warehouse, Inc. 

Marietta, GA

Technical & Scientific 

Application (TSA) 

Houston, TX



Extended Cost

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$100,680.00

NO BID

$100,680.00

6/7/2013-EC(revised)

Bid #13-028

Printers, Scanners and Bar Code Readers for the County of El Paso

Opening Date:  Wednesday, May 8, 2013

Toshiba Business Solutions 

San Antonio, TX


