b
Bid 13-029
Janitorial Supplies for the County of El Paso
Opening Date: May 15, 2013

Baron Brady El Paso Office . AOSS Medical Central Champion Chemical . . Interboro Tronex International,
Chemical Industries Products SET;eDIby DI_?;( SpEelcltDrum P:)E)er Supply, Inc. Poly Corp. Co. IcS Ja\lllviggp_:_fs‘ Inc. Packaging Inc.
El Paso,TX El Paso, TX El Paso, TX aso, aso, Monroe, LA Linden, NJ Whittler, CA ' Montgomery, NY Mount Olive, NJ
No DESCRIPTION EST. QTY] Price per cs/ea. Price per cs/ea. Price per cs/ea. | Price per cs/ea. Price per cs/ea. Prciz/e;g.er Iﬁiiaglh;f;jf Prciz/e;g.er Iilzl)ii;h;?:f Prcizle;z‘er Iilzl)ii;h;?:f Price per cs/ea. C/Ziiglh;::f Prci;eez.er Iﬁigh‘fg ngfe:er Iﬁigh‘fg
APRON-COOKING-DISPOSABLE- $5.70 $64.68 $35.55 $38.73 $36.00 $44.00
1 JPLASTIC WHITE ON SIZE FITS 48 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid $39.89 $37.08 $45.32
ALL /1000/CS--1 MIL 100/BX 1000/CS 1000/CSs 1000/CS 1000/Cs 100/10bx
$12.65 $13.98 . . $12.05 . . . . . . . . . . . .
2 |BAG-PAPER #10 /500 BAGS/BDL |45 BDLS No Bi No Bi No Bi No Bi No Bi No Bi No Bi No Bi No Bi No Bi No Bi No Bi No Bi No Bi
500/BDL 500 o Bid o Bid 500/BDL o Bid o Bid o Bid o Bid o Bid o Bid o Bid o Bid o Bid o Bid o Bid o Bid
3 |BAG-PAPER #12 /500 BAGS/BDL |45 BDLS $14.55 $16.07 No Bid No Bid i No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
500/BDL 500 500/BDL
BAG-POLYBAG-PLASTIC-CLEAR $18.95 $20.99 . _ $9.90 . . . ) ) ) . | $10.32 . .
4 18 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.63 No Bid No Bid
QT 4 X2X12 /1000 PK 1000/CS 1000 1000 1000/CS $
BAG-POLYBAG-PLASTIC-SANDWICH-
5 |Fmropo s xere-sireauar. | 50 | $15:10 $16.69 NoBid | NoBid S NoBid | NoBid | Nogid| Nosid | NoBid | NoBid | Noid | nosid | ¥93* | s962 | Nosid | NoBid
2000/PK 2000/CS 2000 2000 2000/CS
BLEACH-CLOROX 5.25% SODIUM
$10.20 $13.94 $14.99 $9.05
6 |oreea SR 96 CS No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid| NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
4 GAL/CS 6GAL/CS 6/96 OZ. 6/960zCS 6-1GAL
BOWL-SOUP-STYROFOAM 5 0Z
$22.70 $25.57 $18.84
1000/CS MAY BE RECYCLED . . . . . . . . . . . . . .
7 MATERIAL THAT WITHSTANDS 48 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
HOT/COLD SAMPLE REQUIRED 1000/CS 1000 1000/CS
BOWL-SOUP-STYROFOAM 8 OZ. $29 65 $33 37 $30 60
1000/CS MAY BE RECYCLED : ) . . ' . . . . . . . . . . . .
8 | MATERIAL THAT WITHSTANDS 48 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
HOT/COLD SAMPLE REQUIRED 1000/CS 1000 1000/CS
BOWL-SOUP-STYROFOAM 12 OZ. $1990 $2241 $2015
g e o RECroLeD MATERIAL 135 ¢S No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
SAMPLE REQUIRED 1000/CS 1000 1000/CS
BROOM-UNISAN-PLASTIC-FLAG
TIP 42 X 88 WOOD PLASTIC $41.00
10 |BRISTLE ANGLE BROOM *MUST | 25 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
HAVE FIBERGLASS HANDLE**12/ 12/CS
cs
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Baron Brady El Paso Office . AOSS Medical Central Champion Chemical . . Interboro Tronex International,
Chemical Industries Products SErlmle:Iby DI_;_S; Sp:lcgum P_?)E)er Supply, Inc. Poly Corp. Co. ICS Ja\l/l\/:éjgjp_lrfs, Inc. Packaging Inc.
El Paso,TX El Paso, TX El Paso, TX aso, aso, Monroe, LA Linden, NJ Whittler, CA ' Montgomery, NY Mount Olive, NJ
No DESCRIPTION EST. QTY| Price per cs/ea. Price per cs/ea. Price per cs/ea. | Price per cs/ea. Price per cs/ea. P:zfeg,er Iﬁiiaglh;f; P:zfeg,er Iilzl)ii;hgfgf Prcizleezler Iilzl)ii;hgfgf Price per cs/ea. Iﬁiighgfgf P:Zfezler Iﬁiiaglhlit::f szfe:er Iﬁiiaglhlit::f
BROOM-ANGLED FIBERGLASS
W/POLYPROPYLENE BRISTLES $46.55 $52.41 $41.00
11 JTRIM 10" WIDE--1 PIECE--12/CS |515 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
METAL HANDLES WILL NOT BE 12/CS 12 12/CS
ACCEPTED
BUCKET-MOP 26 QT. $39.00 $44.44 $33.95 $37.49 $34.50 , . . . $57.94 . . . .
12 WAWRINGER YELLOW—1 SET 32 SET| SET 1 SET 1SET 1 SET $40.00 | $41.20 | NoBid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid 1 SET $59.68 | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
CAFETERIA-KITCHEN-FOOD . . . . $8.99 . . $7.99 . . . . . . . .
13 WRAP 18 X 1000 (PLASTIC) 159 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Rl No Bid No Bid 1000 $8.23 No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
CAFETERIA-KITCHEN-FOOD $14.15 $15.67 ) . $12.29 ) . $12.29 . . . . . . . .
14 | /RAP 18 X 2000 (PLASTIC) 159 EA BX 1 No Bid No Bid 1RL No Bid No Bid 2000' $12.66 No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
CAFETERIA-KITCHEN ROLL 18 X $42.40 $47.74 . . $35.40 . . $44.66 . . . . . . . .
15 1000 (HEAVY DUTY FOIL) 18 EA BX 1 No Bid No Bid 1RL No Bid No Bid 1000 $46.00 No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
CAP-CAFETERIA-BOUFFONT $3.00 $32.82 . . $24.55 . . . . . . $21.01 . . $16.20
16 COLOR: WHITE 10/100/CS 48 CS 100/BX 100 No Bid No Bid 10/100CS No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid 10/100CS $21.64 | No Bid | No Bid 100bx/5bx $16.69
CAP-CAFETERIA-BOUFFONT $28.95 $32.62 . ; $25.40 : : ; ; ; ; $21.19 ; ; $16.20
17 COLOR: BLUE 10/100/CS 48 CS 1000 1000 No Bid No Bid 10/100CS No Bid No Bid | NoBid ] No Bid No Bid | No Bid 10/100CS $21.83 | No Bid | No Bid 100bx/5bx $16.69
CAP-CAFETERIA-BOUFFONT . . . . $25.40 . . . . . . $21.41 . . $16.20
18 COLOR: GREEN 10/100/CS 48 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/100CS No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid 10/100CS $22.05 | No Bid | No Bid 100bx/5bx $16.69
19 [CATETERIMSURGICALFACE |40 BX|  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $33.20 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid| NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | $314 | $323 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
: 10/50CS 50/BX
CLEANER-GLASS-AEROSOL-18 $24.90 $29.07 $22.95 $25.80 $22.88 . . . . . . . . . . . .
2 1 No B No B No B No B No B No B No B No B No B No B No B No B
0 0Z. 12/CS 0Cs 12/CS 12 cs 1902/12/CS 12/CS o Bid o Bid o Bid o Bid o Bid o Bid o Bid o Bid o Bid o Bid o Bid o Bid
CLEANER-POWDERED
DETERGENT DISINFECTANT-ST- _ _ _ . $53.22 . . . _ $23.90 . . _ . . .
21 |803A EQUIVALENT OR BETTER 40 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.62 No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
1.B.S 400 X .5 WT OZ.PKT.PER 400/CS 180/CS
DALl
CLEANER-NEUTRAL CLEANER
22 |CONCENTRATE ST-709 60CS| NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.52 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid| NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
EQUIVALENT OR BETTER 72/2 o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi
FLUID OZ. POUCHES PER CASE 72.CS
CLEANER-GLASS- $17.15
23 JCONCENTRATED ST-840; 48/2 500 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
FLUID OZ. POUCHES PER CASE 48/CS
CLEANER-NEUTRAL CLEANER- $41.68
WATER FLAKES ST-800--400 X 0.5 . . . . : . . . . . . . . . . . .
24 WT.0Z.PERAIL:EQUIVALENT OR 84 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid J00/CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
BETTER
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Baron Brady El Paso Office . AOSS Medical Central Champion Chemical . . Interboro Tronex International,
Chemical Industries Products SErlmle:Iby DI_;_S; Sp:lcgum P_?)E)er Supply, Inc. Poly Corp. Co. ICS Ja\l/l\/:éjgjp_lrfs, Inc. Packaging Inc.
El Paso,TX El Paso, TX El Paso, TX aso, aso, Monroe, LA Linden, NJ Whittler, CA ' Montgomery, NY Mount Olive, NJ
No DESCRIPTION EST. QTY| Price per cs/ea. Price per cs/ea. Price per cs/ea. | Price per cs/ea. Price per cs/ea. Prcizjeegler IY\c/)iigtht’(::f Prcizjeegler Iil\éii;h;?:f P:zzz.er Iil\éii;h;?:f Price per cs/ea. C,Zeciglh;::f P:z/eezler Iﬁiiaglh;?gf P:zfez,er Iﬁiiaglh;?gf
CLEANER-AJAX-W/CHLORINE 21 $20.80 $24.71 $18.85
25 JOZ. CONTAINS NO 12Cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
PHOSPHOROUS 24/CS 24/CS 24 24/CS
CLEANER-HILLYARD SUPER
8 $25.00 $19.69 $44.00
26 |SHINE ALLITEM #140G,CLEANS | 51 cg No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid| NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
VINYL FLOOR 4 GAL/CS; 4/CS 4 4-1GAL
EQUIVALENT OR BETTER
CLEANER-HARVARD CHEMICAL- $23.59 $16.25
27 [ e coneentratena | 30CS|  NoBid , NoBid | NoBid saca, | NeBid| NoBid | Noid [ NoBid | Noid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid [ Nogid
GAL/CS ;
CLEANER-ADVANCED FORMULA $28.62 $25.18
28 JLAUNDRY DETERGENT ST-1044 |600 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
72 X 2 FL.OZ. PER CASE 6 72/CS
COFFEE-STIRRERS (PLASTIC) $11.90 $1.34 $3.50 . $1.79 . . . . . . . . . . . .
29 1000/ BX 24 BX 10,000/CS 1000 BOX No Bid 1000/CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
f000Cs Ay B RECYCLED $23.65 $26.61 $2295 | $26.04 $23.80 . . . . . . _ _ _ _ _ _
30 JATERIAL THAT WITHSTANDS 150 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
HOT/COLD SAMPLE REQUIRED 1,000/CS 1000 CASE 1000/CS 1000/CS
CUP-COFFEE-STYROFOAM-10 OZ.
$21.60 $24.35 $20.95 $23.23 $21.70
31 [re o IATERIAL TRATWITHSTANDSL 100 CS NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
SAMPLE REQUIRED 1,000/CS 1000 CASE 1000/CS 1000/CS
CUP-COFFEE-STYROFOAM-8 OZ. $16.40 $18.45 $15.95 $18.39 $16.45 ) ) ) ) ] ] ] ] ) ] ] ]
32 |1000/CS MATERIAL THAT WITHSTANDS] 160 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
HOT/COLD SAMPLE REQUIRED 1,000/CS 1000 CASE 1000/CS 1000/CS
CUP-DIXIE-4 OZ.-PAPER WATER CUP $37.90 $42.70 $39.18
33 |5000/CT MATERIAL THAT WITHSTANDS| 12 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
HOT/COLD SAMPLE REQUIRED 5,000/08 5000 5000/CS
"y o $25.25 28.42 ; ; $24.30 . . . . . . . . : . . .
DISPENSER-NAPKIN-7" X 3
34 27 EA 10 000/CS 10000 No Bid No Bid 10.000/CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Iﬂj No Bid
EXAMINING GLOVES-NON $36.30 2.45 $4.60 . $2.48 $31.00 . . . . $3.39 $2.48 $2.77
35 STERILE VINYL MEDIUM 100/BX 200 BX 10/100/CS BOX BOX No Bid 100/BX 100bx/10cs $31.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid 100/BX $3.49 100/10CS| $2.55 100bx/10bx $2.85
EXAMINING GLOVES-NON $36.30 2.45 $4.60 . $2.48 $31.00 . . . . $3.39 $2.48 $2.77
36 STERILE VINYL LARGE 100/BX 205 BX 10/100/CS BOX BOX No Bid 100/BX 100bx/10cs $31.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid 100/BX $3.49 10/100CS| $2.55 100bx/10bx $2.85
EXAMINING GLOVES-NON
37 |STERILE VINYL EXTRA LARGE 205 BX $36.30 2 No Bid No Bid $2.59 $31.00 $31.93 | NoBid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid $3.39 $3.49 $2.48 $2.55 $2.77 $2.85
100/BX 10/100/CS BOX 100/BX 100bx/10cs 100/BX 10/100CS 100bx/10bx
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Baron Brady El Paso Office . AOSS Medical Central Champion Chemical . . Interboro Tronex International,
Chemical Industries Products SErlmle:Iby DI_;_S; Sp:lcgum P_?)E)er Supply, Inc. Poly Corp. Co. ICS Ja\l/l\/:éjgjp_lrfs, Inc. Packaging Inc.
El Paso,TX El Paso, TX El Paso, TX aso, aso, Monroe, LA Linden, NJ Whittler, CA ' Montgomery, NY Mount Olive, NJ
No DESCRIPTION EST. QTY| Price per cs/ea. Price per cs/ea. Price per cs/ea. | Price per cs/ea. Price per cs/ea. Prcizjeegler IY\c/)iigtht’(::f Prcizjeegler Iil\éii;h;?:f P:zzz.er Iil\éii;h;?:f Price per cs/ea. C,Zeciglh;::f P:z/eezler Iﬁiiaglh;?gf P:zfez,er Iﬁiiaglh;?gf
LINER-TRASH BAG-15 X 9 X 32-(8 $18.60 $20.92 $14.58 $16.43 $15.40 $14.30 No Bid | $14.74
38 |MICRON) HIGH DENSITY "HEAVY 1100 CS No Bid | No Bid $14.73 | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid $15.18 | NoBid | No Bid
IDPLIJTE\Z"nl\OOO/CS 15 GAL. CAP. 1,000/CS 1000 CASE 1000/CS 1000/CS 1000/CS| 1000
LINER-TRASH BAG-22 X 16 X 58-
$24.80 $22.82 $16.98 $18.21 $17.80 $17.05 $23.24
39 %‘;{ Q"F'{iRﬁE“/‘gVHY'%'ﬁYEN;')TJCS 5 |100CS No Bid | No Bid $17.56 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid $23.94 | NoBid | NoBid
loal cap cieam 100/CS 200 CASE 200/Cs 200/Cs 200/Cs 200
LINER-TRASH BAG-23 X 100 X 30-
40 |"HEAVY DUTY" 100 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.86 No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.90 | No Bid No Bid
500/CS 33 GAL.CAP. (BEIGE- 10/25=250 500 500/CS 500/CS 500
BROWN-CLEAR)
LINERS-SMALL-CLEAR-24 X 33 8 $18.60 $20.13 $14.58 . $18.15 . . $14.10 . . . . $20.48 ) )
41 1000 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.52 No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid 21.09 No Bid No Bid
MICRONS--1000/CS 1,000/CS 1000 CASE 1000/CS 1000/CS| s 1000 $
a2 [N RSB RO M CLEARS3X40 500 Cs $11.95 $22.41 $25.95 No Bid $20.20 NoBid | Nogid | *272°| $17.72 | noBid | NoBid | NoBid | noBid | ¥924 | $5.40 | Nosid | NoBid
10/25=250 500 CASE 500/CS 500/CS 5CS/100BX|
43 | NERSUARGE-CLEAR-38X60 400 cg| ~ $14.20 $18.07 $15.25 | \p id $14.90 | Nogid | NoBid | $2040) $1071 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | Nosid | $10-32 | $10.63 | NoBid | No Bid
: 100 200 CASE 200/CS 100/CS 2CS/100BX
44 [(NERSLARGEBLACKS8 X %0 1500 Cs $24.20 $30.86 $21.75 No Bid $25.65 NoBid | Nogid | ¥2620| s16.69 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | Nosid | ®3268 | $32.63 | Noid | NoBid
: 100 100 CASE 200/CS 100/CS 100
MOP HEAD-RAYON DOUBLE $27.40 $30.84 $63.00 . $37.30 . . . . . . . . . . . .
45 |STITCHED 24 07.-12/CS 40 CS 12 12 CASE No Bid 12/CS NoBid | NoBid | NoBid] NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
PAD-FLOOR POLISHER-20"
46 |DIAMETER BLACK-STRIPPING--5 | 15 CS $14.10 $12.37 No Bid $26.41 S No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
PADS/CS 5/CS 5 5/CS 5/CS
PAD-FLOOR POLISHER-20" $14.10 $10.78 $11.18
47 |DIAMETER GREEN SCRUBBING-- | 15 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 PADS/CS 5/CS 5 5/CS
PAD-FLOOR POLISHER-20" 14.10 9.32 26.41 11.18
48 |IDIAMETER RED-SCRUBBING-5 | 15 CS $ 3 No Bid $ 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
PADS/CS 5/CS 5 5/CS 5/CS
PAD-FLOOR POLISHER-20" 14.10 10.78 26.41 11.18
49 |DIAMETER WHITE NATURAL 20 CS $ ¥ No Bid $ $ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
FINISH--5 PADS/CS 5/CS 5 5/CS 5/CS
PADS-SANITARY NAPKIN- $35.45 $39.91 $33.99 $38.21 $29.48 , , . . . . $14.91 . . . .
50 |REGULAR- 250/CS 300Cs 250/CS 250 CASE 250/0S 250/CS No Bid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid 250/CS $15.36 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
PAD-SCOURING-SYNTHETIC 6 X 9 $13.40 . . $10.40 . . . . . . . . . . . .
51 (GREEN NYLON)~60 PADS/CS 60 CS 60/CS $11.62 No Bid No Bid 60/CS No Bid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid
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Baron Brady El Paso Office ) AOSS Medical Central Champion Chemical . . Interboro Tronex International,
Chemical Industries Products SET(;Iby Dist. |Spectrum Paper Supply, Inc. Poly Corp. Co. ICS Jail Supplies, Inc. Packaging Inc.
El Paso, TX aso, TX | El Paso, TX : . Waco, TX :
El Paso, TX El Paso, TX J Monroe, LA Linden, NJ Whittler, CA Montgomery, NY Mount Olive, NJ
. . . ) ) Price per Weighted Price per Weighted Price per Weighted . Weighted Price per Weighted Price per Weighted
No DESCRIPTION EST. QTY| Price per cs/ea. Price per cs/ea. Price per cs/ea. | Price per cs/ea. Price per cs/ea. cslea. Local Pref csfea. Local Pref csjea. Local Pref Price per cs/ea. Local Pref cslea. Local Pref csfea. Local Pref
PAPER-DRINKING 45.1 212 2.15
52 |STRAWS/WRAPPED--JUMBO -- |96 BXS S 3 No Bid No Bid $ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
500/ BX 12,000/CS 24/500 500/BX
53 |PAPER-BUTCHER-18 X 2000 /1 RL | 19 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
54 |paper-BuTCHER-18 X 10001 RL | 10 EA fzf’E'OAO $2i'88 NoBid | NoBid $i/5§i° NoBid | NoBid | Nogid| Nosid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | Nosid | NoBid
PLATES-3 COMPARTMENT-
STYROFOAM 10 1/4"--1" DEEP-- $19.90 $22.41 $19.85
55 |500/CS MAY BE RECYCLED 297 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
MATERIAL THAT WITHSTANDS 500/CS 500 500/CS
HOT/COLD SAMPLE REQUIRED
PLATES-3 COMPARTMENT-
STYROFOAM WITHLID 91/8 X9 $17.55 $19.75 . . $16.35 . ) ) . . . ) . . . . .
56 |1/8--3" DEEP-- 200/CS MAY BE 400 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
RECYCLED MATERIAL THAT 200/CS 200 200/CS
[PLATES S COMPARTMENT:
STYROFOAM 9 1/4 X 9 1/4--3" $16.40 $18.45 $15.78
57 |PEEP--500/CS MAY BE 250 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
RECYCLED MATERIAL THAT
WITHSTANDS HOT/COLD 500/CS 500 500/CS
58 1000CS AV BERECYCLED. 10 CS $19.75 $22.23 No Bid No Bid $15.97 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid| NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
MATERIAL THAT WITHSTANDS o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi
HOT/COLD SAMPLE REQUIRED 1000/CS 1000 1000/CS
PLATES-3 COMPARTMENT-
STYROFOAM WITH LID 9 1/4 X 9 1/4-- 3" $1755 $1975 $1605
59 |DpEEP--200/CS MAY BE RECYCLED 50 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
MATERIAL THAT WITHSTANDS
HOT/COLD SAMPLE REQUIRED ZOO/CS 200 ZOOICS
X N ) 25.15 7.26 7.99 9.02 6.30 20.60
60 [SLVERWAREFORKPLASTIC- | 59 g $ $ $ $ ¢ NoBid | NoBid | Nosid| Nogid | NoBid | Nosia | ® $21.22 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
DINNER--1000/CS 1,000/CS 1000 CASE 1000/CS 1000/CS 100/CS
61 |5 Aane daooea T ONNERT 130 Cs $25.15 $7.26 $7.99 $9.02 $6.10 NoBid | NoBid | Nosid| NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | 222 | $22558 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
PLASTIC--1000/CS 1,000/ CS 1000 CASE 1000/CS 1000/CS 100/CS
62 [ (ERWARE SPOON-PLASTIC: 79 cg|  $25:15 $8.54 $7.99 $9.02 $6.30 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid| NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | $2999 | $21.62 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
~ 1.000/CS 1000 CASE 1000/CS 1000/CS 100/CS
SOAP-COLD CREAM (PINK OR
63 JWHITE) 3 0Z. BARS-WRAPPED- | 60 CS $32.25 $36.33 No Bid No Bid $32.96 No Bid No Bid | NoBid ] No Bid No Bid | No Bid T $20.26 | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
144/CS 72/CS 72 72/CS 72/CS
SOAP-GUEST-CASHMERE-1/2 OZ. . . . . . . . . . . . $37.90 . . . .
64 | WRAPPED WHITE-1000/CS 80 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid GRS $39.04 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid




BID # 13-029

Janitorial Supplies for the County of El Paso
Bid Opening: May 15, 2013

El Paso . . . .
Barqn Brady Office Shelby Dist.|Spectrum Paper AOSS Medical Central Champion Chemical ICS Jail Supplies, Inc. Interbqro Tronex International,
Chemical Industries Product El P > El P ™ Supply, Inc. Poly Corp. Co. Waco. TX Packaging Inc.
El Paso,TX El Paso, TX roaucts aso, aso, Monroe, LA Linden, NJ Whittler, CA ' Montgomery, NY Mount Olive, NJ
El Paso, TX

No DESCRIPTION EST. QTY| Price per cs/ea. Price per cs/ea. Price per cs/ea. | Price per cs/ea. Price per cs/ea. Prcizjeeger IY\c/)iigtht’(::f Prcizjeeger Iil\éii;h;?:f P:zzzer Iil\éii;h;?:f Price per cs/ea. C,Zeciglh;::f P:z/eezer Iﬁiiaglh;?gf P:zfezer Iﬁiiaglh;?gf
SOAP-PUMICE BAR-REGULAR $44.20 $49.72 $46.50

65 |SIZE WRAPPED LAVA OR 48 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
EQUIVALENT--4 OZ.- 48 /BARS/CS 48/CS 48 48/CS

$25.15 $3.54 . . $6.40 ) ) , . ) . $19.49 ) . . _

66 |SPOON-SOUP--1000/ CS 60 CS 1000/CS 1000 No Bid No Bid 1000/CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid 1000/CS $20.07 | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
SPORK & NAPKIN-NO SALT— $13.10 $14.74 $12.30

67 J340/Cs 340 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
MEAL KIT-SPORK & NAPKIN ONLY. 1000/CS 1000 1000/CS

$25.15 $8.54 . . $6.25 . . . . . . $22.21 . . . .
SPORKS ONLY 1000/CS

68 650 CS 1000/CS 1000 No Bid No Bid 1000/CS No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid 1000/CS $22.88 | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
TISSUE-TOILET-BATHROOM
MUST MAINTAIN TISSUE AS $24.30 $27.86 $33.00 $25.10 $24.99 $25.99
SUBMITTED INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED- . . . . . . . . . .

69 |4xs. 500 SHTS/IRL, 2 PLY- 96 RLCs | 1400 CS No Bid | No Bid $26.77 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
is\éPLE REQUIRED-SPECIFY SHEET 96/CS 96 CASE 96/RL 96RLS/CS 4 X35
TISSUE-TOILET-BATHROOM
MUST MAINTAIN TISSUE AS
SUBMITTED INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED- $36OO $4062 $3115 $3850 $3599

70 Jax4 1000 SHTS/RL; SINGLE PLY 96 RLS | 500 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid $37.07 No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
CS
SAMPLE REQUIRED-SPECIFY SHEET 96/CS 80 96/RL 96/RLS/CS 45X3.8
SIZE
TISSUE-TOILET-BATHROOM $20.50 $22.85 $18.95 $18.35 $19.80 $19.99

71 ]2 PLY-JUMBO ROLL TISSUE 9" X |200 CS No Bid No Bid $20.59 No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
1000 TRUE FEET 12/CS 12/CS 12 CASE 12/CS 12/CS 1000'/RU
TOWEL-PAPER SINGLE FOLD-

72 [BROWN 9 1/4 X 10 1/4, 235 X 260- | 55 g $15.90 $19.02 $18.95 No Bid $15.80 No Bid | No Bid S15-44 $15.59 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
MM TOWEL 250/SLY, 16 SLVS o Bi o Bi o Bi . o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi
PER CASE SAMPLE REQUIRED 4000/Cs 16 CASE 4000/CS 9.25X10.25
e $15.70 $18.84 $15.95 $17.60 $15.55 $15.65
PERFERATED 7-7/8" X 350 TRUE . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .

73 |cEET BROWN ROLL-12/CS 200 CSs No Bid | No Bid $16.12 | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid
SAMPLE REQUIRED 12/CS 12 CASE 12/CS 12/CS 8 X 350'

TOWEL-PAPER $16.50 $16.63 $14.30 $15.32 $14.65 $14.40

74 |MULTI FOLD-BROWN 9 1/4 X9 1/2 | 500 CS No Bid | No Bid $14.83 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
‘éiogl';EEF?ASE SAMPLE 4000/CS $16.00 CASE 4000/CS 4000/CSs 9.25X9.5
e APES $17.60 $18.42 $15.90 $16.39 $16.00 $15.16

75 ZAOL:)IE)TILESIE:?A_;VEH;&EMQPi/éXQ 12 1500 CS ' ' ' ' ' No Bid | No Bid ' $15.61 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
BEQIIBED 4000/CS 4000 CASE 4000/CS 4000/CSs 9.25X9.5




BID # 13-029
Janitorial Supplies for the County of El Paso
Bid Opening: May 15, 2013

DISQUALIFIED "NO ETHICS TRAINING"

All American Poly Pyramid School Products SOUthMV\;ﬁStem WaIIaceLlT_aC(::kaglng,
Piscaaway, N.J Tampa, FL El Paso, TX Tucson, AZ
No. DESCRIPTION EST. QTY] Price per cs/ea. Weigh't:igf tocal | pice per cs/ea. Weigh't:er(;f tocall  price per cs/ea. P:zzger xiiglh;(::f
1 APRON-COOKING-DISPOSABLE- 48 CS No Bid No Bid $31.96 $32.92 $37.23 No Bid No Bid
PLASTIC WHITE ON SIZE FITS o Bi o Bi . o Bi o Bi
ALL/1000/CS--1 MIL 1000/CS 1000/CS
2 |BAG-PAPER #10 / 500 BAGS/BDL |45 BDLS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.30 No Bid No Bid
500/BDL
3 |BAG-PAPER #12 /500 BAGS/BDL |45 BDLS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.50 No Bid No Bid
500/BDL
4 |PAG-POLYBAG-PLASTIC-CLEAR | 10 ~g No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.98 NoBid | No Bid
QT 4 X2 X 12 /1000 PK ! ' ! ! 1000/CS ! !
BAG-POLYBAG-PLASTIC- $10.63
5 |SANDWICH-FLIP TOP 6.75" X 6.75 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ) No Bid No Bid
" + 1-REGULAR--2000/PK 2000/CS
BLEACH-CLOROX 5.25% SODIUM $9.46
6 JHYPOCHLORITE SUPER 96 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
DISINFECTANT 4 GAL/CS 6-1 GAL
BOWL-SOUP-STYROFOAM 5 OZ $23.00
1000/CS MAY BE RECYCLED . . . . : . .
7 MATERIAL THAT WITHSTANDS 48 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1000/CS No Bid No Bid
HOT/COLD SAMPLE REQUIRED
BOWL-SOUP-STYROFOAM 8 OZ. $33.00
1000/CS MAY BE RECYCLED . . . . ) . .
8 MATERIAL THAT WITHSTANDS 48 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
HOT/COLD SAMPLE REQUIRED 1000/Cs
BOWL-SOUP-STYROFOAM 12 OZ. $20.50
1000/CS MAY BE RECYCLED . . . . . . .
9 MATERIAL THAT WITHSTANDS 135CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
HOT/COLD SAMPLE REQUIRED 1000/CS
BROOM-UNISAN-PLASTIC-FLAG
TIP 42 X 88 WOOD PLASTIC $41.00
10 |BRISTLE ANGLE BROOM **MUST | 25 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
HAVE FIBERGLASS HANDLE**12/ 6/CS
cs
BROOM-ANGLED FIBERGLASS
W/POLYPROPYLENE BRISTLES ) ) ] ) $41.00 ] ]
11 ftrIM 10" WIDE--1 PIECE--12/Ccs |515 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
METAL HANDLES WILL NOT BE 12/CS
ACCEDTEDN




Janitorial Supplies for the County of El Paso
Bi

BID # 13-029

Quoeoning. Moy 18 2012

All American Poly Pyramid School Products SOUthMV\;ﬁStem WaIIaceLlT_aC(::kaglng,
Piscaaway, N.J Tampa, FL El Paso, TX Tucson, AZ
No. DESCRIPTION EST. QTY] Price per cslea. Weigh't;:::f Local | oice per cslea. Weigh't;?(:f Local Price per cs/ea. Prcizjeegler IY\c/)iigtht’(:Sf
BUCKET-MOP 26 QT. . . $34.47 $38.95 . .
12 WAWRINGER YELLOW—1 SET 32 SET No Bid No Bid 1 SET $35.50 SET No Bid No Bid
CAFETERIA-KITCHEN-FOOD . . . . . . .
13 WRAP 18 X 1000 (PLASTIC) 159 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CAFETERIA-KITCHEN-FOOD . . . . $13.25 . .
14 | vrap 18 X 2000 (PLASTIC) 159 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid RL No Bid No Bid
CAFETERIA-KITCHEN ROLL 18 X . . . . $40.50 . .
15 1000 (HEAVY DUTY FOIL) 18 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid RL No Bid No Bid
CAP-CAFETERIA-BOUFFONT . . . . $24.75 . .
16 COLOR: WHITE 10/100/CS 48 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1000/CS No Bid No Bid
CAP-CAFETERIA-BOUFFONT . . . . $24.75 . .
17 COLOR: BLUE 10/100/CS 48 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1000/CS No Bid No Bid
CAP-CAFETERIA-BOUFFONT . . . . $24.75 . .
18 COLOR: GREEN 10/100/CS 48 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1000/CS
CAFETERIA-SURGICAL FACE . . . . . . .
19 MASK: BLUE 30/BX 40 BX No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CLEANER-GLASS-AEROSOL-18 . ) $20.05 $25.70 ] ]
2 1 No B No B 20. No B No B
0102 1218 0CS o Bid o Bid 12/20 oz. $20.65 12-2002. o Bid o Bid
CLEANER-POWDERED
DETERGENT DISINFECTANT-ST- ] _ _ _ $54.25 _ _
21 |803A EQUIVALENT OR BETTER 40 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1.B.S 400 X .5 WT OZ.PKT.PER 400-.50z
DAl
CLEANER-NEUTRAL CLEANER $23.45
CONCENTRATE ST-709 . . . . ' . .
22 EQUIVALENT OR BETTER 72/2 60 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
FLUID OZ. POUCHES PER CASE 72-20z
CLEANER-GLASS- $17.20
23 JCONCENTRATED ST-840; 48/2 500 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
FLUID OZ. POUCHES PER CASE 48-20z
CLEANER-NEUTRAL CLEANER- $41.65
WATER FLAKES ST-800--400 X 0.5 . . . . . .
24 WT.0Z. PER PAIL:EQUIVALENT 84 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 400-.507 No Bid No Bid
OR BETTER :
CLEANER-AJAX-W/CHLORINE 21
25 |0z contams no 12cs|  NoBid No Bid $2389 | goa61 $21.90 No Bid | No Bid
PHOSPHOROUS 24/CS 24/210z. 24-210z




Janitorial Supplies for the County of El Paso
Bi

BID # 13-029

Quoeoning. Moy 18 2012

All American Poly Pyramid School Products South'\\/l/\i/ﬁstern WalIaceLlTj;:kaglng,
Piscaaway, N.J Tampa, FL El Paso, TX Tucson, AZ
No DESCRIPTION EST. QTY] Price per cslea. Weigh't;:::f Local | oice per cslea. Weigh't;?(:f Local Price per cs/ea. Prcizjeeger IY\c/)iigtht’(:Sf
CLEANER-HILLYARD SUPER
SHINE ALL ITEM #140G;CLEANS . . . . . . .
26 VINYL FLOOR 4 GAL/CS: 20Cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EQUIVALENT OR BETTER
CLEANER-HARVARD CHEMICAL- $15.95
1530 PINK POT & PAN . . . . . .
27 DETERGENT CONCENTRATED 4 30CSs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GAL/CS 4-1 gal
CLEANER-ADVANCED FORMULA $25.17
28 |LAUNDRY DETERGENT ST-1044 |600 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
72 X 2 FL.OZ. PER CASE 72-20z
29 [COFFESSTIRRERS (PLASTO 1 248X | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid
CUP-COFFEE-STYROFOAM 12
0Z.1000/CS MAY BE RECYCLED $23.95
30 |MATERIAL THAT WITHSTANDS | 150 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
SAMPLE REQUIRED
CUP-COFFEE-STYROFOAM-10 $21.50
0Z. 1000/CS MATERIAL THAT . . . . ' . .
31 WITHSTANDS HOT/COLD 100 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1000/CS No Bid No Bid
SAMPLE REQUIRED
CUP-COFFEE-STYROFOAM-8 OZ. $16.88
1000/CS MATERIAL THAT . . . . ' . .
32 WITHSTANDS HOT/COLD 160 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1000/CS No Bid No Bid
SAMPLE REQUIRED
CUP-DIXIE-4 OZ.-PAPER WATER
33 |CUP 5000/CT MATERIAL THAT 12 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid
WITHSTANDS HOT/COLD
CANMDIC DENIIDEN
Lo . . . . $24.95 . .
34 |DISPENSER-NAPKIN-7" X 3 27 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10M/CS No Bid No Bid
EXAMINING GLOVES-NON . . $2.69 $2.24 $2.30
35 |STERILE VINYL MEDIUM 1008|200 BX No Bid No Bid 10CS100BX $2.77 10/100CS 100/BX $2.37
EXAMINING GLOVES-NON . . $2.69 $2.24 $2.30
36 |STERILE VINYL LARGE 100/8x 205 BX No Bid No Bid 10CS100BX $2.77 10/100CS 100/BX $2.37
EXAMINING GLOVES-NON ] ] $2.69 $2.24 $2.30
37 205 BX No Bid No Bid 2.77 2.37
STERILE VINYL EXTRA LARGE 10cs1008x] ® 10n00cs | 100mx] ®




Janitorial Supplies for the County of El Paso

Rj

BID # 13-029

Quoeoning. Moy 18 2012

All American Poly Pyramid School Products SOUthMV\;ﬁStem WaIIaceLlT_aC(::kaglng,
Piscaaway, N.J Tampa, FL El Paso, TX Tucson, AZ
No. DESCRIPTION EST. QTY] Price per cslea. Weigh't:i(:}f Local Price per cs/ea. Weigh’t:er(:f Local Price per cs/ea. Prcizzger IY\c/)iigtht’(:Sf
LINER-TRASH BAG-15 X 9 X 32--(8 $22.94 $19.56
3g [V o T er DERSITY WEAVY 1100 Cs $23.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid
: : 1000/CS 1000/CS
(CLEAR)
LINER-TRASH BAG-22 X 16 X 58-
$25.93 $17.95
(16 MICRON) HIGH DENSITY . . . ,
39 "EXTRA HEAVY DUTY" 200/CS 55 100 CS $26.71 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GAL. CAP. (CLEAR) 200/CS 200/CS
LINER-TRASH BAG-23 X 100 X 30- $24.47 . . $17.65 . .
40 100 CS 25.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
|12 MICRON) HiGH DENSITY 500/CS $ ! ! 500/CS ! !
LINERS-SMALL-CLEAR-24 X 33 8 $19.92 . . $19.65 . .
41 MICRONS--1000/CS 1000 CS 1000/CS $20.52 No Bid No Bid 1000/CS No Bid No Bid
LINERS-MEDIUM-CLEAR-33 X 40 $12.22 . . $17.65 . .
42 11 MICRONS 500 CS 100/CS $12.59 No Bid No Bid %OO/CS No Bid No Bid
LINERS-LARGE-CLEAR-38 X 60 $25.03 . . 14.60 . .
43 | 52 MICRONS 400 CS 100/CS $25.78 No Bid No Bid 200/CS No Bid No Bid
LINERS-LARGE-BLACK-38 X 60 $21.53 ; : $23.35 : :
44 1< UPER HEAVY DUTY 2 MIL. 500 CS 100/CS $22.18 No Bid No Bid 100/CS No Bid No Bid
MOP HEAD-RAYON DOUBLE . . $40.56 $51.28 . .
45 STITCHED 24 0z.12/CS 40 CS No Bid No Bid 12/CS $41.78 12/CS No Bid No Bid
MOP HEAD-RAYON DOUBLE . . $40.56 $51.28 . .
45 STITCHED 24 0z.12/CS 40 CS No Bid No Bid 12/CS $41.78 12/CS No Bid No Bid
PAD-FLOOR POLISHER-20"
46 |DIAMETER BLACK-STRIPPING--5 | 15 CS No Bid No Bid $10.92 $11.25 $11.95 No Bid No Bid
PADS/CS 5/CS 5/CS
PAD-FLOOR POLISHER-20" $10.92 $11.95
47 IDIAMETER GREEN SCRUBBING-- | 15 CS No Bid No Bid $11.25 No Bid No Bid
5 PADS/CS 5/CS 5/CS
PAD-FLOOR POLISHER-20" 10.92 11.
48 |IDIAMETER RED-SCRUBBING--5 | 15 CS No Bid No Bid $10.9 $11.25 $11.95 No Bid No Bid
PADS/CS 5/CS 5/CS
PAD-FLOOR POLISHER-20"
10.92 11.95
49 |DIAMETER WHITE NATURAL 20 CSs No Bid No Bid ¥ $11.25 $ No Bid No Bid
FINISH--5 PADS/CS 5/CS 5/CS
) iereiliniOuaiy 300cs|  No Bid No Bid ggg/'gg $30.58 gszg/'gg No Bid | No Bid
R . 10.64 13.10
51 [ereen nvLons0 prosics | 89 €S| No Bid No Bid ¥ $10.96 s No Bid | No Bid
60/CS 60/CS
i i 1.99
52 [ e o WSWRAPPED-196 BXS| o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55(530/05 No Bid | No Bid




Janitorial Supplies for the County of El Paso
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BID # 13-029

Quoeoning. Moy 18 2012

All American Poly Pyramid School Products Southwestern Wallace Packaging,
Pi Mill LLC
iscaaway, N.J Tampa, FL
El Paso, TX Tucson, AZ
No DESCRIPTION EST. QTY] Price per cs/ea. Weigh't:erl:f Local | price per cs/ea. Weigh;ertif Locall  oice per cs/ea. P::izfez.er xiiaglh;f:f
53 |PAPER-BUTCHER-18 X 2000 /1 RL | 19 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid
$20.95
54 |PAPER-BUTCHER-18 X 1000/1 RL | 19 EA No Bid No Bid $21.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid
18X1000
PLATES-3 COMPARTMENT- $19 83
STYROFOAM 10 1/4"--1" DEEP--500/CS '
55 [MAY BE RECYCLED MATERIAL THAT | 297 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
WITHSTANDS HOT/COLD SAMPLE 500/CS
REQUIRED
PLATES-3 COMPARTMENT-
STYROFOAM WITH LID 9 1/8 X 9 1/8--3" $14.95
DEEP-- 200/CS . . . . . .
56 |ay BE RECYCLED MATERIAL THAT 1400 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
'WITHSTANDS HOT/COLD SAMPLE ZOO/CS
REQUIRED
PLATES-3 COMPARTMENT-
STYROFOAM 9 1/4 X 9 1/4--3" DEEP--
57 |500/cs MAY BE RECYCLED MATERIAL | 250 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
THAT WITHSTANDS HOT/COLD
SAMPLEREQUIRED
PLATE-DESSERT-STROFOAM-6"-- $13 50
58 | e tanms noreara TRA 10 €S| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid
SAMPLE REQUIRED lOOO/CS
PLATES-3 COMPARTMENT-
STYROFOAM WITH LID 9 1/4 X 9 1/4-- 3" $l495
59 [DEEP--200/CS MAY BE RECYCLED 50Cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
MATERIAL THAT WITHSTANDS ZOO/CS
HOT/COLD SAMPLE REQUIRED
SILVERWARE-FORK-PLASTIC- . . . . $6.89 $6.22
60 29 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.41
DINNER--1000/CS 1000/CS 1000/CS
SILVERWARE-KNIFE-DINNER- . . . . $6.53 $6.22
61 || AsTic-1000/CS 30Cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1000/cs  l1ooo/cs $6.41
SILVERWARE-SPOON-PLASTIC- . . . : $6.75 $6.22
62 70 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.41
DINNER--1000/CS 1000/CS 1000/CS]
SOAP-COLD CREAM (PINK OR $35.00
63 |WHITE) 3 OZ. BARS-WRAPPED- 60 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
144/CS 144/CS
64 SOAP-GUEST-CASHMERE-1/2 OZ. 80 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $39.95 NG Bid NG Bid
WRAPPED WHITE-1000/CS 0B 0Bl o bl o bl 1000/CS ool o Bl
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Approved By (Signature)

Approved By (Print)

Department

All American Poly Pyramid School Products SOUthMV\;ﬁStem WaIIaceLlT_aC(::kaglng,
Piscaaway, N.J Tampa, FL El Paso, TX Tucson, AZ
No DESCRIPTION EST. QTY] Price per cs/ea. Weigh't;:::f Local 1 price per cs/ea. Weigh't;?(:f tocall  price per cs/ea. Prcizjeegler IY\c/)iigtht’(:Sf
SOAP-PUMICE BAR-REGULAR $40.98 $39.75
65 |SIZE WRAPPED LAVA OR 48 CS No Bid No Bid $42.21 No Bid No Bid
EQUIVALENT--4 OZ.- 48 BARS/CS 48/CS 48-40z
66 [SPOON-SOUP--1000/ CS 60 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid %850 w22 $6.41
~SOUP-- 0B 0Bl o bl o bl 1000/CS ~ |1000/CS :
SPORK & NAPKIN--NO SALT-- _ _ _ _ $16.60 $12.32
67 |340/CS MEAL KIT-SPORK & 340 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.69
NAPKIN ONLY--NO SALT 1000/CS 1000/CS
68 |SPORKS ONLY 1000/CS 650 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.55 $6.22 $6.41
1000/CS 1000/CS
TISSUE-TOILET-BATHROOM
MUST MAINTAIN TISSUE AS $27.75
69 s too srame. mory va e l1a00cs|  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid
Z’-\Zl\r/IEPLE REQUIRED-SPECIFY SHEET 500RL/96CS
TISSUE-TOILET-BATHROOM
MUST MAINTAIN TISSUE AS $33.90
SUBMITTED INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED- . . . . . .
70 laxa 1000 SHTS/RL; SINGLE PLY 96 RLS 500 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
cs
SAMPLE REQUIRED-SPECIFY SHEET 500RL/96CS
TISSUE-TOILET-BATHROOM $20.55
71 J2PLY-JUMBO ROLL TISSUE 9" X 1000 | 200 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TRUE FEET 12/CS 12/1000'CS
TOWEL-PAPER SINGLE FOLD-BROWN $16 85
9 1/4 X 10 1/4, 235 X 260-MM TOWEL . . . . . . .
72 250/SLY, 16 SLVS PER CASE SAMPLE 650 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
REQUIRED 4000/CS
TOWEL-PAPER-ROLL NON- $1595
PERFERATED 7-7/8" X 350 TRUE FEET H H H H H H
73 |GROWN ROLL-12/0S SAMPLE 200 Cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12/350'CS No Bid | No Bid
REQUIRED
TOWEL-PAPER $13.95
74 IMULTI FOLD-BROWN 9 1/4 X 9 1/2 200 Cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4000 PER CASE SAMPLE REQUIRED 4000/CS
TOWEL-PAPER $17.45
75 |MULTI FOLD-WHITE 9 1/4 X 9 1/2 500 CS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4000 PER CASE SAMPLE REQUIRED 4000/CS
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