
Bid # 13-051

Uniforms, Body Armor and Badges

 for the  County of El Paso Sheriff's Office

Bid Opening: September 17, 2013

Global Uniform 

Solutions                                                                      

El Paso, TX.     

Item Deputy Badges Unit Price Unit Price
 Unit  Price           

Alternate #1

 Unit  Price           

Alternate #2
Unit Price

Weighted 

Price Local 

Preference

Unit Price

Weighted 

Price Local 

Preference

Unit Price

Weighted 

Price Local 

Preference

Unit Price
Weighted Price 

Local Preference

1 Sheriff No Bid $48.80 $31.10 $48.80 $55.90 $57.58 $64.00 $65.92 $43.87 $45.19 $31.50 $32.45

2 Executive Chief Deputy No Bid $48.80 $31.10 $48.80 $55.90 $57.58 $64.00 $65.92 $43.87 $45.19 $31.50 $32.45

3 Chief Deputy No Bid $48.80 $31.10 $48.80 $55.90 $57.58 $64.00 $65.92 $43.87 $45.19 $31.50 $32.45

4 Commander No Bid $48.80 $31.10 $48.80 $55.90 $57.58 $64.00 $65.92 $43.87 $45.19 $31.50 $32.45

5 Lieutenant No Bid $48.80 $31.10 $48.80 $55.90 $57.58 $64.00 $65.92 $43.87 $45.19 $31.50 $32.45

6 Sergeant No Bid $48.80 $31.10 $48.80 $55.90 $57.58 $64.00 $65.92 $43.87 $45.19 $31.50 $32.45

7 Deputy No Bid $48.80 $31.10 $48.80 $55.90 $57.58 $64.00 $65.92 $43.87 $45.19 $31.00 $31.93

Item

Courthouse Security, 

Communications and 

Animal Control Badges

Unit Price Unit Price
 Unit  Price           

Alternate #1

 Unit  Price           

Alternate #2
Unit Price

Weighted 

Price Local 

Preference

Unit Price

Weighted 

Price Local 

Preference

Unit Price

Weighted 

Price Local 

Preference

Unit Price
Weighted Price 

Local Preference

8 Courthouse Security No Bid $34.55 $22.95 $34.55 $39.91 $41.11 $64.00 $65.92 $40.66 $41.88 $30.50 $31.42

9 Communications No Bid $34.55 $22.95 $34.55 $39.91 $41.11 $64.00 $65.92 $40.66 $41.88 $30.50 $31.42

10 Animal Control Officer No Bid $34.55 $22.95 $34.55 $39.91 $41.11 $64.00 $65.92 $40.66 $41.88 $30.50 $31.42

11
Communications 

Supervisor
No Bid $34.55 $22.95 $34.55 $41.93 $43.19 $64.00 $65.92 $40.66 $41.88 $31.50 $32.45

Item Deputy Patches and Pins Unit Price Unit Price
 Unit  Price           

Alternate #1

 Unit  Price           

Alternate #2
Unit Price

Weighted 

Price Local 

Preference

Unit Price

Weighted 

Price Local 

Preference

Unit Price

Weighted 

Price Local 

Preference

Unit Price
Weighted Price 

Local Preference

12 Commander No Bid $68.50 $34.50 $68.50 $41.93 $43.19 $64.00 $65.92 $53.50 $55.11 $31.50 $32.45

13 Lieutenant No Bid $68.50 $34.50 $68.50 $41.93 $43.19 $64.00 $65.92 $53.50 $55.11 $31.50 $32.45

14 Sergeant No Bid $68.50 $34.50 $68.50 $41.93 $43.19 $64.00 $65.92 $53.50 $55.11 $31.50 $32.45

15 Corporal No Bid $68.50 $34.50 $68.50 $41.93 $43.19 $64.00 $65.92 $53.50 $55.11 $31.50 $32.45

16 Detention Officer No Bid 68.50 34.50 68.50 39.31 $40.49 $64.00 $65.92 53.50 $55.11 30.50 $31.42

Premier Uniform & Tactical Gear                                                                                

El Paso, TX.

GT Distributors, Inc.                                                                 

Austin, TX.                            

The Aby MFG Group Inc. 

dba Entenmann-Rovina                                                                                   

Los Angeles, CA.       

Metis Inc.                                   

Oklahoma City, OK.

Lawmen's & Shooters' 

Supply                                                     

Vero Beach, FL.



Bid # 13-051

Uniforms, Body Armor and Badges

 for the  County of El Paso Sheriff's Office

Bid Opening: September 17, 2013

Global Uniform 

Solutions                                                                      

El Paso, TX.     

Item Deputy Patches and Pins Unit Price Unit Price
 Unit  Price           

Alternate #1

 Unit  Price           

Alternate #2
Unit Price

Weighted 

Price Local 

Preference

Unit Price

Weighted 

Price Local 

Preference

Unit Price

Weighted 

Price Local 

Preference

Unit Price
Weighted Price 

Local Preference

17
Badge Patch for the BDU 

Shirt
No Bid $0.49 $0.49 $0.49 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

18

Rank Longevity Insignia 

Sworn and 

Communications Personnel 

Shoulder Patches

No Bid $0.65 $0.65 $0.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

19
Sheriff’s Office Patch for 

all Personnel
No Bid $0.64 $0.64 $0.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

20

PINS: Rank Longevity 

Insignia Sworn and 

Communications Personnel 

Miniature Collar Pin.  

Black and Gold

No Bid $1.80 $1.80 $1.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item Body Armor Unit Price Unit Price
 Unit  Price           

Alternate #1

 Unit  Price           

Alternate #2
Unit Price

Weighted 

Price Local 

Preference

Unit Price

Weighted 

Price Local 

Preference

Unit Price

Weighted 

Price Local 

Preference

Unit Price
Weighted Price 

Local Preference

21 Men’s sizes $595.00 $449.00 $549.00 $606.00 $562.50 $579.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

22 Women’s sizes

$595.00/gender 

neutral 

$650.00/female 

especific

$449.00 $549.00 $606.00 $562.50 $579.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

23 Extra carrier $130.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $68.75 $70.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item Uniforms Unit Price Unit Price
 Unit  Price           

Alternate #1

 Unit  Price           

Alternate #2
Unit Price

Weighted 

Price Local 

Preference

Unit Price

Weighted 

Price Local 

Preference

Unit Price

Weighted 

Price Local 

Preference

Unit Price
Weighted Price 

Local Preference

24
Brown Ladies Long Sleeve 

Shirt
No Bid $15.10 $15.10 $15.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

25
Brown Men’s Long Sleeve 

Shirt
No Bid $15.10 $15.10 $15.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

26 Courthouse Black Pants No Bid $25.10 $17.35 $15.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Premier Uniform & Tactical Gear                                                                                

El Paso, TX.

GT Distributors, Inc.                                                                 

Austin, TX.                            

The Aby MFG Group Inc. 

dba Entenmann-Rovina                                                                                   

Los Angeles, CA.       

Metis Inc.                                   

Oklahoma City, OK.

Lawmen's & Shooters' 

Supply                                                     

Vero Beach, FL.



Bid # 13-051

Uniforms, Body Armor and Badges

 for the  County of El Paso Sheriff's Office

Bid Opening: September 17, 2013

Global Uniform 

Solutions                                                                      

El Paso, TX.     

Item Uniforms Unit Price Unit Price
 Unit  Price           

Alternate #1

 Unit  Price           

Alternate #2
Unit Price

Weighted 

Price Local 

Preference

Unit Price

Weighted 

Price Local 

Preference

Unit Price

Weighted 

Price Local 

Preference

Unit Price
Weighted Price 

Local Preference

27
Courthouse Long Sleeve 

Shirt
No Bid $33.10 $18.95 $33.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

28
Courthouse Long Sleeve 

Shirt
No Bid $33.10 $18.95 $33.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

29
Courthouse Men’s Short 

Sleeve shirt
No Bid $28.50 $17.35 $28.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

30 Deputy Champ Jacket No Bid $92.00 $92.00 $92.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

31 Deputy Class A Pant No Bid $46.30 $38.10 $46.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

32
Deputy Ladies Long Sleeve 

Shirt
No Bid $33.85 $26.85 $33.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

33
Deputy Ladies Short Sleeve 

Shirt
No Bid $31.85 $26.85 $31.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

34
Deputy Men’s Long Sleeve 

Shirt
No Bid $38.10 $26.85 $38.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

35
Deputy Men’s Short Sleeve 

Shirt
No Bid $33.10 $26.85 $33.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

36
Deputy Motorcycle 

Breeches
No Bid $153.00 $150.00 $153.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

37
Detention Officer BDU 

Pants
No Bid $18.75 $22.95 $18.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

38
Detention Officer BDU 

Tactical Shirt
No Bid $23.95 $23.95 $23.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Premier Uniform & Tactical Gear                                                                                

El Paso, TX.

GT Distributors, Inc.                                                                 

Austin, TX.                            

The Aby MFG Group Inc. 

dba Entenmann-Rovina                                                                                   

Los Angeles, CA.       

Metis Inc.                                   

Oklahoma City, OK.

Lawmen's & Shooters' 

Supply                                                     

Vero Beach, FL.



Bid # 13-051

Uniforms, Body Armor and Badges

 for the  County of El Paso Sheriff's Office

Bid Opening: September 17, 2013

Global Uniform 

Solutions                                                                      

El Paso, TX.     

Item Uniforms Unit Price Unit Price
 Unit  Price           

Alternate #1

 Unit  Price           

Alternate #2
Unit Price

Weighted 

Price Local 

Preference

Unit Price

Weighted 

Price Local 

Preference

Unit Price

Weighted 

Price Local 

Preference

Unit Price
Weighted Price 

Local Preference

39
Detention Officer Men's 

Short Sleeve Class A Shirt
No Bid $33.35 $18.10 $15.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

40
Detention Officer Men's 

Class A Trouser
No Bid $31.75 $19.50 $15.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

41
Detention Officer Women's 

Short Sleeve Class A Shirt
No Bid $28.50 $15.95 $15.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

42
Detention Officer Women's 

Class A Trouser
No Bid $31.75 $19.50 $15.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

43 Light Weight Jacket No Bid $85.00 $95.00 $85.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

44
Liner for Light Weight 

Jacket
No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

45
Deputy Uniform Police 

Rain Coat
No Bid $14.05 $14.05 $14.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

46
Special Reaction Team 

BDU Pants
No Bid $18.75 $22.95 $18.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

47
Special Reaction Team 

BDU Tactical Shirt 
No Bid $23.95 $23.95 $23.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

15%

20%

23%

25%

*Note:  The Aby MFG Group Inc. dba Entenmann-Rovin Co. - One time tooling fee of $180.00

Approved by (Signature) Approved by (Print)

Sheriff's Office  

LB 9/23/13

The Aby MFG Group Inc. 

dba Entenmann-Rovina                                                                                   

Los Angeles, CA.       

Premier Uniform & Tactical Gear                                                                                

El Paso, TX.

GT Distributors, Inc.                                                                 

Austin, TX.                            

Metis Inc.                                   

Oklahoma City, OK.

Lawmen's & Shooters' 

Supply                                                     

Vero Beach, FL.

Percentage increase for future years.

Year 2

2%

No Bid

5%

5%

0%

0%

0% 5%

3.5% No Bid

Year 3 plus 3.5%

5%

5%

Recommendation 

Year 4 plus 3.5%

Year 5

2%

0%

Department Date

5%plus 3.5%

**Lawmen's & Shooters'  Supply / Metis Inc. were disqualified.  Did not take ethics training.

5%

5%


