Purchasing Department: Bid # 11-036, Copiers for the County of El Paso

*Qce Imagistics Inc. d/b/a Oce
North America Documents
Printing Systems

Spectrum Imagine Systems

. *Benchmark
(Pelicano Dr.)

*Dell Marketing Toshiba Business Solutions | Spectrum Imaging System Sun City Copy Superior Imaging Experts

Qty

Description

Unit Pricing

Extended Cost

Unit Pricing

Extended Cost

Unit Pricing

Extended Cost

Unit Pricing

Extended Cost

Unit Pricing

Extended Cost

Unit Pricing

Extended Cost

Unit Pricing

Extended Cost

Unit Pricing

Extended Cost

14

45 PPM B&W, Base model, Retractable
Keyboard, 8.5” high resolution touch-
screen color LCD, 80 GB hard drive with
document filing system, PCL6/PCL5e
network printing, network color
scanning, Application communication
module, 100 sheet Duplexing Single
Pass Feeder, Auto Duplexing, Two 500
sheet paper drawers, 100 sheet bypass
tray, First toner full yield, Deluxe Copier
Cabinet with front door for each copier,
Set up and training. Vendors will only
be allowed to turn in one bidding
itemized price, Options will not be
accepted. Must submit equipment
model along with a brochure New
copiers only, Refurbished copiers will
not be accepted, No color copiers. 3 yr
extended included in price.

Dell 5535dn
Laser Printer
$2377.50.
Qty (14) 550
Sheet Drawer
for $228.79
and 80+GB
hard drive for
$430.31 total
for each
$3,036.60

$  42,512.40

Toshiba e-
Studio4555E
MFD
$2,900.00

$ 40,600.00

Vendor did not
provide model
Number or any
information on
copier.
$3,379.00

S 47,306.00

Samsung
SCX-6555NX
55ppm,
Black &
White 80 GB
HDD

S 43,260.00

New Canon
imageRunner
3245i 45ppm,

60 GB hard

drive
$3,546.00 each

S 49,644.00

Savin 92505P
50ppm,
FUJITSU (SATA)

$ 59,948.00

Sharp MX-
M463N,
45ppm, B&W
workgroup
Document
System
$4486.80

$ 62.804.00)

Xerox WC
574SAPT, 75
Sheet DADF

$9,351.00

each

$ 130,914.00

14

Deluxe Copier Cabinet with front door
for each copier

No Bid

included

included

included

included

included

MX-50ABD included

included

Set up and Training

No Bid

included

included

included

included

included

included

14

Total Cost

42,512.40

40,600.00

47,306.00

43,260.00

49,644.00

59,948.00

62,804.00

130,914.00

Qty

Description

Unit Pricing

Extended Cost

Unit Pricing

Extended Cost

Unit Pricing

Extended Cost

Unit Pricing

Extended Cost

Unit Pricing

Extended Cost

Unit Pricing

Extended Cost

Unit Pricing

Extended Cost

Unit Pricing

Extended Cost

Warranty: 3 year extended warranty
included in price

36 PPM Upgradeable Digital
Multifunction Copier/Printer, 500 Sheet
Paper Drawer Scanner Module/Single
Pass Feeder, Scanner Rack Deluxe
Cabinet: 2 x 500 sheet Multi-purpose
paper, Required power Unit (1,000
sheets total paper supply),1,000 Sheet
paper feed desk unit (2x500) Inner
Finisher, PostScript 3TM Expansion Kit,
Data Security Kit (commercial version
for models with HDD), First toner full
yield, Vendors will only be allowed to
turn in one bidding itemized price,
Must submit equipment model along
with a brochure, New copiers only,
Refurbished copiers will not be
accepted, No color copiers

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Samsung
SCX -
8040ND,40P
PM, B&W
160 GB
memory,

$ 6,090.00

New Canon
ImageRunner
3235i, 35ppm,
60GB Hard
drive

$4,299.00

No Bid

No Bid

Xerox
WC42550x
45ppm,

$2,847.00

Set up and Training

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

included

included

No Bid

No Bid

included

Total Cost

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

6,090.00

4,299.00

No Bid

No Bid

2,847.00




*Oce Imagistics Inc. d/b/a Oce Soect | ine Svsh
. . . . . . . . . ectrum Imagine Systems
*Dell Marketing Toshiba Business Solutions | Spectrum Imaging System Sun City Copy North America Documents Superior Imaging Experts P (Pelicango br )y *Benchmark
Printing Systems ’
o Extended o Extended o o o Extended o Extended o Extended o Extended
aty Description Unit Pricing Cost Unit Pricing Cost Unit Pricing Extended Cost Unit Pricing Extended Cost Unit Pricing Cost Unit Pricing Cost Unit Pricing Cost Unit Pricing Cost

ADDENDUM 2: Warranty: 3 year

extended warranty included in price.

36 PPM B&W, Scan in color to e-mail

and to file, Print and scan double sided, Samsung New Canon

3-hole punch, Staples, Print and Scan Vendor did not SCX-8040ND, ImageRunner

legal size, Two 500 sheet paper : ) 8 " Sharp MX- WC5735APT,

o Fiher Toshiba e- provide model 40PPM, 32351, 35ppm, SAVIN 92405P M453N 36ppm 3-hole punch

1  [drawers, Sorting Finisher, Duplexing, No Bid ; $  3,829.00 [Numberorany| $  3,791.00 | B&W, 3hole [ $  5,865.00 3 hole $  4,076.00 "|'$ 5,344.00 PPMI ¢ 5,606.00 olep "I'$  8,903.00

Cabinet First toner full yield, Must Studio455SE . . . 40ppm, 3-Hole punch, innder

; > . information on puncher, puncher, inner . - _
submit equipment model along with a ) . . inner finisher, finisher
A ) copier. stapling finisher,

brochure, new copiers only, refurbished . R

copiers will not be accepted, No color finisher sorting

copiers

Set up and Training No Bid included included included included included included included
1 Total Cost No Bid S 3,829.00 | S 3,791.00 | $ 5,865.00 | $ 4,076.00 | S 5,865.00 | $ 5,606.00 | S 8,903.00
TOTAL COST | S 42,512.40 | $ 44,429.00 | $ 51,098.00 | $ 55,215.00 | $ 58,019.00 | $ 65,292.00 | S 58,019.00 | S 142,668.00
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