El Paso County Purchasing Department

Bid # 11-056, Uniformed Officer's Badges and Patches for the County of El Paso

VENDOR:

MTM Reconginition Co.

Sheriff's Deputy Badges

Detention Offcer Badge Patches

Description Unit Cost Per Item Description Unit Cost Per Item
Gold Badge - Sh?”ff 31.50 Sheriff’s Office County of El Paso Texas (patch for all shirts on both shoulders) No Bid
Gold Badge - Chief Deputy 31.50

Gold Badge - Commander 31.50 Security Threat Group — Intelligence Unit No Bid
Gold Badge - Detective 31.50 Sheriff’s Office — SWAT No Bid
Gold Badge - Lieutenant 31.50 Sheriff’s Office — Special Response Team No Bid
Gold Badge - Sergeant 31.50 Sheriff’s Office — Search and Rescue No Bid
Silver Badge - Deputy 30.50 Sheriff’s Office — K9 No Bid
Sheriff's Office Detention Officer Badge Rank/Longevity Insignia — Sworn Communications Personnel No Bid
Gold Badge - Commander 31.50 Master Sergeant, Honorary - 3 Chevrons, 3 rockers, Star in wreath No Bid
Gold Badge - Lieutenant 31.50 Sergeant > 30 years — 3 Chevrons, 3 rockers, star in field No Bid
Gold Badge - Sergeant 31.50 Sergeant > 25 years — 3 Chevrons, 3 rockers, diamond in field No Bid
Gold Badge - Corporal 31.50 Sergeant > 20 years — 3 Chevrons, 3 rockers No Bid
Silver Badge - Detention Officer 30.50 Sergeant > 15 years — 3 Chevrons, 1 rocker, star in field No Bid
Sergeant > 10 years — 3 Chevrons, 1 rocker, diamond in field No Bid
Courthouse Security, Communications and Animal Control Officer Sergeant > 5 years — 3 Chevrons, 1 rocker No Bid

< —3Ch i
Sliver Badge - Courthouse Security 30.50 Sergeant < 5 year.s 3 Chevrons - — No B!d
Floor Control Office > 25 years — 3 Chevrons, 2 rockers, diamond in field No Bid

Fl | Office > 2 —3Ch 2 rock i
Sliver Badge - Courthouse Security 30.50 oor Control O !ce 0 years — 3 Chevrons, 2 rockers _ No B!d
Floor Control Office > 15 years — 2 Chevrons, 1 rockers, star in field No Bid

Fl | Office > 1 —2Ch 1 rock i in fiel i
Silver Badge - Animal Control Officer 30.50 oor Contro O. ice . 0 years C. ev.rons, rockers, diamond in field _ No B!d
Deputy/Detention Officer/Communications =>15 years 1 chevron, 1 rocker, star in field No Bid

Deputy/Detention Officer/Communications =>10 years <15 years 1 chevron, 1 rocker, .
_ o diamond in field No Bid

Silver Badge - Communications 30.00 Deputy/Detention Officer/Communications =>5 years <10 years 1 chevron, 1 rocker, .
blank field No Bid
) . ) Deputy <5 years No insignia No Bid
Gold Badge - Communications Supervisor 31.50 Detention Officer <5 years No insignia No Bid
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