Bid

#14-021

Tires for the County of El Paso
Opening Date: June 9, 2014

Bill Williams Tire Center,

GCR Tire & Service,

GVMI Inc. dba Napa Center
El Paso, SVN Repair,

Socorro TX El Paso TX El Paso TX
Mounting of Tires
For Listed Cars Trucks/ Buses | Other Cars Trucks/ Buses Other Car Trucks/ Buses | Other
Vans Vans Vans

Mount and 4.25 | $4.25 | $25.00 | $75.00 || $12.50 | $15.00 | $30.00 | $60.00 || $8.50 | $8.50 | $9.50 | No Bid
Dismount Labor $4. $4. $25. $75. $12. $15. $30. $60. $8. $8. $9. o
C°mp;;f;:§: SPIN | ¢425 | $4.25 | $25.00 | N/A [ $12.00 | $15.00 | $30.00 | n/A || $4.50 | $4.50 | $5.50 | No Bid
Tire Disposal $2.00 | $2.00 | $10.00 | N/A | $3.50 | $5.00 | $12.00 | 0.10xB || $2.50 | $2.50 | $3.50 | No Bid
Shop Parts $2.00 | $2.00 | $2.00 | N/A | $1.50 | $1.50 | $2.50 | $5.00 || $0.00 | $0.00 | $0.00 | No Bid
Comp:ﬁg:ffgn‘t’\’hee' NA | NA [$195.00] N/A |f $49.99 | $69.99 |$189.00] N/A || $69.95 | $69.95 [$129.00| No Bid
Cost for Mobile Unit | $35.00 | $35.00 | $35.00 | $65.00 || $82.00 | $82.00 |$120.00| $120.00 || No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
Fix/Repair Flat Tires| $8.50 | $8.50 | $25.00 | $75.00 || $15.00 | $17.50 | $35.00 | $75.00 || $9.50 | $9.50 | $10.50 | No Bid

Approved by Signature

Reccomendation

Approved by (Print)

Date

6/11/14 AH




