
W H D OAK BIRCH
HOLLOW 

METAL
OAK BIRCH

HOLLOW 

METAL

2'-6" 6'8" 1-3/4" $265.00 $260.00 $170.00 $553.00 $551.00 $231.00

2'-8" 6'8" 1-3/4" $265.00 $260.00 $175.00 $553.00 $551.00 $231.00

3' 6'8" 1-3/4" $265.00 $260.00 $180.00 $483.00 $481.00 $235.00

3'-6" 6'8" 1-3/4" $285.00 $280.00 $200.00 $625.00 $607.00 $283.00

4' 6'8" 1-3/4" $295.00 $290.00 $216.00 $652.00 $635.00 $306.00

2'-6" 7' 1-3/4" $265.00 $260.00 $170.00 $569.00 $551.00 $238.00

2'-8" 7' 1-3/4" $265.00 $260.00 $175.00 $569.00 $551.00 $238.00

3' 7' 1-3/4" $265.00 $260.00 $185.00 $499.00 $482.00 $244.00

3'-6" 7' 1-3/4" $285.00 $280.00 $220.00 $579.00 $563.00 $293.00

4' 7' 1-3/4" $295.00 $290.00 $245.00 $606.00 $588.00 $315.00

2'-6" 7' 1-3/4" $265.00 $260.00 $170.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

2'-8" 7' 1-3/4" $265.00 $260.00 $175.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

3' 7' 1-3/4" $265.00 $260.00 $185.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

3'-6" 7' 1-3/4" $285.00 $280.00 $220.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

4' 7' 1-3/4" $295.00 $290.00 $245.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

2'-6" 8' 1-3/4" $310.00 $305.00 $415.00 $635.00 $602.00 $328.00

2'-8" 8' 1-3/4" $310.00 $305.00 $415.00 $635.00 $602.00 $328.00

3' 8' 1-3/4" $325.00 $320.00 $245.00 $565.00 $533.00 $336.00

3'-6" 8' 1-3/4" $345.00 $340.00 $465.00 $762.00 $742.00 $372.00

4' 8' 1-3/4" $365.00 $360.00 $465.00 $693.00 $673.00 $399.00

3' 9' 1-3/4" $485.00 $480.00 $575.00 $656.00 $642.00 $428.00

3'-6" 9' 1-3/4" $505.00 $500.00 $590.00 $838.00 $863.00 $474.00

4' 9' 1-3/4" $545.00 $540.00 $590.00 $769.00 $793.00 $502.00

3' 10' 1-3/4" $565.00 $560.00 $600.00 No Bid No Bid $476.00

3'-6" 10' 1-3/4" $605.00 $600.00 $625.00 No Bid No Bid $522.00

4' 10' 1-3/4" $625.00 $625.00 $635.00 No Bid No Bid $522.00

APCO BUILDING SPECIALTIES

El Paso, TX

SINGLE DOOR

DOOR SA-LUTIONS, INC.

El Paso, TX

90 MINUTE FIRE RATING 90 MINUTE FIRE RATING

BID #14-035

Door, Frames and Hardware

for the County of El Paso

Opening Date: July 30, 2014
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W H D OAK BIRCH
HOLLOW 

METAL
OAK BIRCH

HOLLOW 

METAL

2'-6" 6'8" 1-3/4" $265.00 $260.00 $170.00 $553.00 $551.00 $231.00

2'-8" 6'8" 1-3/4" $265.00 $260.00 $175.00 $553.00 $551.00 $231.00

3' 6'8" 1-3/4" $265.00 $260.00 $180.00 $483.00 $481.00 $235.00

3'-6" 6'8" 1-3/4" $285.00 $280.00 $200.00 $625.00 $607.00 $283.00

4' 6'8" 1-3/4" $295.00 $290.00 $216.00 $652.00 $635.00 $306.00

2'-6" 7' 1-3/4" $265.00 $260.00 $170.00 $569.00 $551.00 $238.00

2'-8" 7' 1-3/4" $265.00 $260.00 $175.00 $569.00 $551.00 $238.00

3' 7' 1-3/4" $265.00 $260.00 $185.00 $499.00 $482.00 $244.00

3'-6" 7' 1-3/4" $285.00 $280.00 $220.00 $579.00 $563.00 $293.00

4' 7' 1-3/4" $295.00 $290.00 $245.00 $606.00 $588.00 $315.00

2'-6" 7' 1-3/4" $265.00 $260.00 $170.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

2'-8" 7' 1-3/4" $265.00 $260.00 $175.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

3' 7' 1-3/4" $265.00 $260.00 $185.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

3'-6" 7' 1-3/4" $285.00 $280.00 $220.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

4' 7' 1-3/4" $295.00 $290.00 $245.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

2'-6" 8' 1-3/4" $310.00 $305.00 $415.00 $635.00 $602.00 $328.00

2'-8" 8' 1-3/4" $310.00 $305.00 $415.00 $635.00 $602.00 $328.00

3' 8' 1-3/4" $325.00 $320.00 $245.00 $565.00 $533.00 $336.00

3'-6" 8' 1-3/4" $345.00 $340.00 $465.00 $762.00 $742.00 $372.00

4' 8' 1-3/4" $365.00 $360.00 $465.00 $693.00 $673.00 $399.00

3' 9' 1-3/4" $485.00 $480.00 $575.00 $656.00 $642.00 $428.00

3'-6" 9' 1-3/4" $505.00 $500.00 $590.00 $838.00 $863.00 $474.00

4' 9' 1-3/4" $545.00 $540.00 $600.00 $769.00 $793.00 $502.00

3' 10' 1-3/4" $565.00 $565.00 $600.00 No Bid No Bid $476.00

3'-6" 10' 1-3/4" $625.00 $605.00 $625.00 No Bid No Bid $522.00

4' 10' 1-3/4" $625.00 $625.00 $635.00 No Bid No Bid $522.00

SINGLE DOOR

APCO BUILDING SPECIALTIES

El Paso, TX

DOOR SA-LUTIONS, INC.

El Paso, TX

60 MINUTE FIRE RATING60 MINUTE FIRE RATING
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W H D 90 MIN 60 MIN
NON-

RATED
90 MIN 60 MIN NON-RATED

2'-6" 6'8" 1-3/4" $90.00 $85.00 $170.00 $118.00 $118.00 $231.00  

2'-8" 6'8" 1-3/4" $90.00 $85.00 $175.00 $120.00 $120.00 $231.00

3' 6'8" 1-3/4" $90.00 $85.00 $180.00 $121.00 $121.00 $235.00

3'-6" 6'8" 1-3/4" $102.00 $97.00 $200.00 $148.00 $148.00 $283.00

4' 6'8" 1-3/4" $115.00 $110.00 $216.00 $157.00 $157.00 $306.00

2'-6" 7' 1-3/4" $90.00 $85.00 $170.00 $118.00 $118.00 $238.00

2'-8" 7' 1-3/4" $90.00 $85.00 $175.00 $120.00 $120.00 $238.00

3' 7' 1-3/4" $90.00 $85.00 $185.00 $121.00 $121.00 $244.00

3'-6" 7' 1-3/4" $105.00 $100.00 $220.00 $148.00 $148.00 $293.00

4' 7' 1-3/4" $120.00 $115.00 $245.00 $157.00 $157.00 $315.00

2'-6" 7' 1-3/4" $90.00 $85.00 $170.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

2'-8" 7' 1-3/4" $90.00 $85.00 $175.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

3' 7' 1-3/4" $90.00 $85.00 $185.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

3'-6" 7' 1-3/4" $105.00 $100.00 $220.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

4' 7' 1-3/4" $120.00 $115.00 $245.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

2'-6" 8' 1-3/4" $165.00 $160.00 $415.00 $354.00 $354.00 $328.00

2'-8" 8' 1-3/4" $165.00 $160.00 $415.00 $354.00 $354.00 $328.00

3' 8' 1-3/4" $175.00 $165.00 $245.00 $204.00 $204.00 $336.00

3'-6" 8' 1-3/4" $185.00 $180.00 $465.00 $241.00 $241.00 $372.00

4' 8' 1-3/4" $200.00 $195.00 $465.00 $276.00 $276.00 $399.00

3' 9' 1-3/4" $305.00 $300.00 $575.00 $306.00 $306.00 $428.00

3'-6" 9' 1-3/4" $330.00 $325.00 $590.00 $363.00 $363.00 $474.00

4' 9' 1-3/4" $355.00 $350.00 $600.00 $415.00 $415.00 $502.00  

3' 10' 1-3/4" $380.00 $375.00 $600.00 $432.00 $432.00 $476.00

3'-6" 10' 1-3/4" $405.00 $400.00 $625.00 $505.00 $505.00 $522.00

4' 10' 1-3/4" $430.00 $425.00 $635.00 $576.00 $576.00 $522.00

NON-FIRE RATED

APCO BUILDING SPECIALTIES

El Paso, TX

DOOR SA-LUTIONS, INC.

El Paso, TX

SINGLE DOOR FRAME NON-FIRE RATED
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W H D 90 MIN 60 MIN
NON-

RATED
90 MIN 60 MIN NON-RATED

 

2'-6" 6'8" 1-3/4" $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $122.00 $122.00 $122.00

2'-8" 6'8" 1-3/4" $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $122.00 $122.00 $122.00

3' 6'8" 1-3/4" $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $122.00 $122.00 $122.00

3'-6" 6'8" 1-3/4" $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $126.00 $126.00 $126.00

4' 6'8" 1-3/4" $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $126.00 $126.00 $126.00

2'-6" 7' 1-3/4" $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $124.00 $124.00 $124.00

2'-8" 7' 1-3/4" $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $124.00 $124.00 $124.00

3' 7' 1-3/4" $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $124.00 $124.00 $124.00

3'-6" 7' 1-3/4" $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $128.00 $128.00 $128.00

4' 7' 1-3/4" $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $128.00 $128.00 $128.00

2'-6" 7' 1-3/4" $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

2'-8" 7' 1-3/4" $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

3' 7' 1-3/4" $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

3'-6" 7' 1-3/4" $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

4' 7' 1-3/4" $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

2'-6" 8' 1-3/4" $123.00 $123.00 $123.00 $137.00 $137.00 $137.00

2'-8" 8' 1-3/4" $123.00 $123.00 $123.00 $137.00 $137.00 $137.00

3' 8' 1-3/4" $123.00 $123.00 $123.00 $137.00 $137.00 $137.00

3'-6" 8' 1-3/4" $123.00 $123.00 $123.00 $141.00 $141.00 $141.00

4' 8' 1-3/4" $123.00 $123.00 $123.00 $141.00 $141.00 $141.00

3' 9' 1-3/4" $130.00 $130.00 $130.00 $142.00 $142.00 $142.00

3'-6" 9' 1-3/4" $130.00 $130.00 $130.00 $146.00 $146.00 $146.00

4' 9' 1-3/4" $130.00 $130.00 $130.00 $146.00 $146.00 $146.00

3' 10' 1-3/4" $145.00 $130.00 $130.00 $148.00 $148.00 $148.00

3'-6" 10' 1-3/4" $145.00 $145.00 $145.00 $152.00 $152.00 $152.00

4' 10' 1-3/4" $145.00 $145.00 $145.00 $152.00 $152.00 $152.00

BLOCK WALL FRAMEBLOCK WALL FRAME

All Block Wall Frames Size 5'-3/4", Welded, Flush Frame

APCO BUILDING SPECIALTIES

El Paso, TX

DOOR SA-LUTIONS, INC.

El Paso, TX

SINGLE DOOR FRAME
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W H D 90 MIN 60 MIN
NON-

RATED
90 MIN 60 MIN NON-RATED

2'-6" 6'8" 1-3/4" $98.00 $98.00 $98.00 $122.00 $122.00 $122.00

2'-8" 6'8" 1-3/4" $98.00 $98.00 $98.00 $122.00 $122.00 $122.00

3' 6'8" 1-3/4" $98.00 $98.00 $98.00 $122.00 $122.00 $122.00

3'-6" 6'8" 1-3/4" $98.00 $98.00 $98.00 $126.00 $126.00 $126.00

4' 6'8" 1-3/4" $98.00 $98.00 $98.00 $126.00 $126.00 $126.00

2'-6" 7' 1-3/4" $98.00 $98.00 $98.00 $124.00 $124.00 $124.00

2'-8" 7' 1-3/4" $98.00 $98.00 $98.00 $124.00 $124.00 $124.00

3' 7' 1-3/4" $98.00 $98.00 $98.00 $124.00 $124.00 $124.00

3'-6" 7' 1-3/4" $98.00 $98.00 $98.00 $128.00 $128.00 $128.00

4' 7' 1-3/4" $98.00 $98.00 $98.00 $128.00 $128.00 $128.00

2'-6" 7' 1-3/4" $98.00 $98.00 $98.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

2'-8" 7' 1-3/4" $98.00 $98.00 $98.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

3' 7' 1-3/4" $98.00 $98.00 $98.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

3'-6" 7' 1-3/4" $98.00 $98.00 $98.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

4' 7' 1-3/4" $98.00 $98.00 $98.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

2'-6" 8' 1-3/4" $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $137.00 $137.00 $137.00

2'-8" 8' 1-3/4" $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $137.00 $137.00 $137.00

3' 8' 1-3/4" $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $137.00 $137.00 $137.00

3'-6" 8' 1-3/4" $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $141.00 $141.00 $141.00

4' 8' 1-3/4" $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $141.00 $141.00 $141.00

3' 9' 1-3/4" $123.00 $123.00 $123.00 $142.00 $142.00 $142.00

3'-6" 9' 1-3/4" $123.00 $123.00 $123.00 $146.00 $146.00 $146.00

4' 9' 1-3/4" $123.00 $123.00 $123.00 $146.00 $146.00 $146.00

3' 10' 1-3/4" $135.00 $135.00 $135.00 $148.00 $148.00 $148.00

3'-6" 10' 1-3/4" $135.00 $135.00 $135.00 $152.00 $152.00 $152.00

4' 10' 1-3/4" $135.00 $135.00 $135.00 $152.00 $152.00 $152.00

DRYWALL FRAME DRYWALL FRAME

APCO BUILDING SPECIALTIES

El Paso, TX

DOOR SA-LUTIONS, INC.

El Paso, TX

SINGLE DOOR FRAME

All Drywall Frames Size 5'-3/4", Welded, Flush Frame, 4 7/8 Wall Thickness
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W H D 90 MIN 60 MIN
NON-

RATED
90 MIN 60 MIN NON-RATED

60" 80" 1-3/4" $130.00 $130.00 $130.00 $164.00 $164.00 $164.00

62" 80" 1-3/4" $130.00 $130.00 $130.00 $164.00 $164.00 $164.00

72" 80" 1-3/4" $130.00 $130.00 $130.00 $168.00 $168.00 $168.00

84" 80" 1-3/4" $130.00 $130.00 $130.00 $168.00 $168.00 $168.00

96" 80" 1-3/4" $130.00 $130.00 $130.00 $172.00 $172.00 $172.00

60" 84" 1-3/4" $130.00 $130.00 $130.00 $164.00 $164.00 $164.00

62" 84" 1-3/4" $130.00 $130.00 $130.00 $164.00 $164.00 $164.00

72" 84" 1-3/4" $130.00 $130.00 $130.00 $168.00 $168.00 $168.00

84" 84" 1-3/4" $135.00 $135.00 $135.00 $168.00 $168.00 $168.00

96" 84" 1-3/4" $135.00 $135.00 $135.00 $172.00 $172.00 $172.00

60" 84" 1-3/4" $135.00 $135.00 $135.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

62" 84" 1-3/4" $135.00 $135.00 $135.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

72" 84" 1-3/4" $135.00 $135.00 $135.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

84" 84" 1-3/4" $135.00 $135.00 $135.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

96" 84" 1-3/4" $142.00 $142.00 $142.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

72" 96" 1-3/4" $154.00 $154.00 $154.00 $196.00 $196.00 $196.00

84" 96" 1-3/4" $154.00 $154.00 $154.00 $196.00 $196.00 $196.00

96" 96" 1-3/4" $154.00 $154.00 $154.00 $198.00 $198.00 $198.00

72" 108" 1-3/4" $165.00 $165.00 $165.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00

84" 108" 1-3/4" $168.00 $168.00 $168.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00

96" 108" 1-3/4" $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 $210.00 $210.00 $210.00

72" 120" 1-3/4" $185.00 $185.00 $185.00 $220.00 $220.00 $220.00

84" 120" 1-3/4" $190.00 $190.00 $190.00 $220.00 $220.00 $220.00

96" 120" 1-3/4" $195.00 $195.00 $195.00 $225.00 $225.00 $225.00

All Block wall Frames Size 5'-3/4", Welded, Flush Frame WITH Center Mullion

APCO BUILDING SPECIALTIES

El Paso, TX

DOOR SA-LUTIONS, INC.

El Paso, TX

DOUBLE DOOR FRAME BLOCK WALL FRAME BLOCK WALL FRAME
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W H D 90 MIN 60 MIN
NON-

RATED
90 MIN 60 MIN NON-RATED

60" 80" 1-3/4" $118.00 $118.00 $118.00 $154.00 $154.00 $154.00

62" 80" 1-3/4" $118.00 $118.00 $118.00 $154.00 $154.00 $154.00

72" 80" 1-3/4" $118.00 $118.00 $118.00 $158.00 $158.00 $158.00

84" 80" 1-3/4" $118.00 $118.00 $118.00 $158.00 $158.00 $158.00

96" 80" 1-3/4" $118.00 $118.00 $118.00 $162.00 $162.00 $162.00

60" 84" 1-3/4" $118.00 $118.00 $118.00 $154.00 $154.00 $154.00

62" 84" 1-3/4" $118.00 $118.00 $118.00 $154.00 $154.00 $154.00

72" 84" 1-3/4" $118.00 $118.00 $118.00 $158.00 $158.00 $158.00

84" 84" 1-3/4" $123.00 $123.00 $123.00 $158.00 $158.00 $158.00

96" 84" 1-3/4" $123.00 $123.00 $123.00 $162.00 $162.00 $162.00

60" 84" 1-3/4" $123.00 $123.00 $123.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

62" 84" 1-3/4" $123.00 $123.00 $123.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

72" 84" 1-3/4" $123.00 $123.00 $123.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

84" 84" 1-3/4" $123.00 $123.00 $123.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

96" 84" 1-3/4" $130.00 $130.00 $130.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

72" 96" 1-3/4" $142.00 $142.00 $142.00 $186.00 $186.00 $186.00

84" 96" 1-3/4" $142.00 $142.00 $142.00 $186.00 $186.00 $186.00

96" 96" 1-3/4" $142.00 $142.00 $142.00 $188.00 $188.00 $188.00

72" 108" 1-3/4" $153.00 $153.00 $153.00 $190.00 $190.00 $190.00

84" 108" 1-3/4" $156.00 $156.00 $156.00 $190.00 $190.00 $190.00

96" 108" 1-3/4" $163.00 $163.00 $163.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00

72" 120" 1-3/4" $173.00 $173.00 $173.00 $210.00 $210.00 $210.00

84" 120" 1-3/4" $178.00 $178.00 $178.00 $210.00 $210.00 $210.00

96" 120" 1-3/4" $183.00 $183.00 $183.00 $215.00 $215.00 $215.00

All Block wall Frames Size 5'-3/4", Welded, Flush Frame WITHOUT Center Mullion

APCO BUILDING SPECIALTIES

El Paso, TX

DOOR SA-LUTIONS, INC.

El Paso, TX

BLOCK WALL FRAME BLOCK WALL FRAMEDOUBLE DOOR FRAME
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W H D 90 MIN 60 MIN
NON-

RATED
90 MIN 60 MIN NON-RATED

60" 80" 1-3/4" $120.00 $120.00 $120.00 $164.00 $164.00 $164.00

62" 80" 1-3/4" $120.00 $120.00 $120.00 $164.00 $164.00 $164.00

72" 80" 1-3/4" $120.00 $120.00 $120.00 $168.00 $168.00 $168.00

84" 80" 1-3/4" $120.00 $120.00 $120.00 $168.00 $168.00 $168.00

96" 80" 1-3/4" $120.00 $120.00 $120.00 $172.00 $172.00 $172.00

60" 84" 1-3/4" $120.00 $120.00 $120.00 $164.00 $164.00 $164.00

62" 84" 1-3/4" $120.00 $120.00 $120.00 $164.00 $164.00 $164.00

72" 84" 1-3/4" $120.00 $120.00 $120.00 $168.00 $168.00 $168.00  

84" 84" 1-3/4" $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $168.00 $168.00 $168.00

96" 84" 1-3/4" $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $172.00 $172.00 $172.00

60" 84" 1-3/4" $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

62" 84" 1-3/4" $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

72" 84" 1-3/4" $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

84" 84" 1-3/4" $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

96" 84" 1-3/4" $132.00 $132.00 $132.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

72" 96" 1-3/4" $144.00 $144.00 $144.00 $196.00 $196.00 $196.00

84" 96" 1-3/4" $144.00 $144.00 $144.00 $196.00 $196.00 $196.00

96" 96" 1-3/4" $144.00 $144.00 $144.00 $198.00 $198.00 $198.00

72" 108" 1-3/4" $155.00 $155.00 $155.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00

84" 108" 1-3/4" $158.00 $158.00 $158.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00

96" 108" 1-3/4" $165.00 $165.00 $165.00 $210.00 $210.00 $210.00

72" 120" 1-3/4" $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 $220.00 $220.00 $220.00

84" 120" 1-3/4" $180.00 $180.00 $180.00 $220.00 $220.00 $220.00

96" 120" 1-3/4" $185.00 $185.00 $185.00 $225.00 $225.00 $225.00

All Drywall Frames Size 5'-3/4", Welded, Flush Frame, 4 7/8 Wall Thickness WITH Center Mullion

APCO BUILDING SPECIALTIES

El Paso, TX

DOOR SA-LUTIONS, INC.

El Paso, TX

DOUBLE DOOR FRAME DRYWALL FRAME DRYWALL FRAME
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W H D 90 MIN 60 MIN
NON-

RATED
90 MIN 60 MIN NON-RATED

60" 80" 1-3/4" $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $154.00 $154.00 $154.00

62" 80" 1-3/4" $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $154.00 $154.00 $154.00

72" 80" 1-3/4" $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $158.00 $158.00 $158.00

84" 80" 1-3/4" $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $158.00 $158.00 $158.00

96" 80" 1-3/4" $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $162.00 $162.00 $162.00

60" 84" 1-3/4" $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $154.00 $154.00 $154.00

62" 84" 1-3/4" $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $154.00 $154.00 $154.00

72" 84" 1-3/4" $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $158.00 $158.00 $158.00

84" 84" 1-3/4" $115.00 $115.00 $115.00 $158.00 $158.00 $158.00

96" 84" 1-3/4" $115.00 $115.00 $115.00 $162.00 $162.00 $162.00

60" 84" 1-3/4" $115.00 $115.00 $115.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

62" 84" 1-3/4" $115.00 $115.00 $115.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

72" 84" 1-3/4" $115.00 $115.00 $115.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

84" 84" 1-3/4" $115.00 $115.00 $115.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

96" 84" 1-3/4" $115.00 $115.00 $115.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

72" 96" 1-3/4" $122.00 $122.00 $122.00 $186.00 $186.00 $186.00

84" 96" 1-3/4" $134.00 $134.00 $134.00 $186.00 $186.00 $186.00

96" 96" 1-3/4" $134.00 $134.00 $134.00 $188.00 $188.00 $188.00

72" 108" 1-3/4" $134.00 $134.00 $134.00 $190.00 $190.00 $190.00

84" 108" 1-3/4" $150.00 $150.00 $150.00 $190.00 $190.00 $190.00

96" 108" 1-3/4" $155.00 $155.00 $155.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00

72" 120" 1-3/4" $165.00 $165.00 $165.00 $210.00 $210.00 $210.00

84" 120" 1-3/4" $170.00 $170.00 $170.00 $210.00 $210.00 $210.00

96" 120" 1-3/4" $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 $215.00 $215.00 $215.00

APCO BUILDING SPECIALTIES

El Paso, TX

DOOR SA-LUTIONS, INC.

El Paso, TX

All Drywall Frames Size 5'-3/4", Welded, Flush Frame, 4 7/8 Wall Thickness WITHOUT Center Mullion

DRYWALL FRAME DRYWALL FRAMEDOUBLE DOOR FRAME
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Date

8/8/14 AH

Approved by (print)

Recommendation

ADD-ON COST PER DOOR

APCO BUILDING 

SPECIALTIES

El Paso, TX

DOOR SA-LUTIONS, INC.

El Paso, TX

Approved by Signature

Hourly Rate To Install Single Door, frame

Hourly Rate to Install Double Door, frame

$1.00 ea

Included in frame price

$15.00

$137.50

$2,875.00

Included in door price

Block wall Frame Pinch & Dimple Anchor

Drywall Frame Stud Anchor

Hinges

Automatic Door Closer

Automatic ADA Operator

161 Lock Prep (Lever)

86 Lock Prep (Mortise)

Panic Bar

$123.00

$267.00

$40.00

$125.00

Full Tempered Glass Light Kit

18"X24" Louver Kit

12"X12" Louver Kit

24"X24" Louver Kit

Full Louver Kit

In/Out Handles

$70.00

$75.00

$105.00 $105.00

$67.00

Included in door price

$450.00

$65.00

$93.00$68.00

$38.00

Threshold

Weather Strip

Floor Stop

Wall Stop

Deadbolt

Lever Set

Factory Stained

4"X25" Tempered Glass Light Kit

12"X12" Tempered Glass Light Kit

24"X24" Tempered Glass Light Kit

Kick Plate

Hold Open Foot

$1.95 ea

$17.00 ea

$258.00

$2,375.00

$21.00

$21.00

$810.00

Per job quote

$78.00 $85.00

$60.00

$65.00 $95.00

$65.00 $95.00

Included in frame price

$7.50

$3.00

$14.00

$7.00

$6.00

$0.88

$24.00

$29.00

$160.00

$25.00

$380.00

$18.00

$13.00$10.00

$202.00

$80.00

$72.00

$160.00 $200.00
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