
B i d  1 5 - 0 0 7  

B u s  a n d  F l e e t  V e h i c l e  M a i n t e n a n c e  a n d  R e p a i r  S e r v i c e s  ( S u p p l e m e n t )  

O p e n i n g  D a t e :   M o n d a y ,  F e b r u a r y  2 3 ,  2 0 1 5

GVMI Inc. dba Napa 
Center El Paso, Sun Auto 

Repair

L-Tune Auto Center
 El Paso Texas

Lube-Tune 
El Paso, Texas

Item Description Cost Cost Cost

1 Oil change, filter replacement with fluid check $29.95 $32.00 $30.00

2 Chassis lube service with fluid check no charge no charge no charge

3 Transmission fluid and filter change service $119.50 $125.00 $150.00

4 Bulb and fuse replacement $1.00-$15.00 most bulbs $2.75-$14.99 no bid

5 Wiper blade replacement $7.50 each $9.95 each no labor $10.00-$15.00

6 Coolant flushes and refills $45.00 $45.00 $45.00

7 Air conditioning systems check up no charge no charge $29.00 service

1 Oil change, filter replacement with fluid check $29.95 $35.00 $30.00

2 Chassis lube service with fluid check no charge no charge no charge

3 Transmission fluid and filter change service $119.50 $125.00 $150.00

4 Bulb replacement $1.00-$15.00 most bulbs $2.75-$14.99 no bid

5 Wiper blade replacement $7.50 each $9.95 each no labor $10.00-$15.00

6 Coolant flushes and refills $45.00 $45.00 $45.00

7 Air conditioning system check up no charge no charge $29.00 service

1 Oil change, filter replacement with fluid check $34.95 $95.00 $30.00

2 Chassis lube service with fluid check no charge no charge no charge

3 Transmission fluid and filter change service $159.00 $135.00 $150.00

4 Bulb replacement $1.00-$15.00 most bulbs $2.75-$14.99

5 Wiper blade replacement $7.50 each $9.95 each no labor $10.00-$15.00

6 Coolant flushes and refills $59.00 $60.00 $45.00

7 Air conditioning systems check up no charge no charge no bid

1 Oil change, filter replacement with fluid check $125 and up for diesel $9.95 diesel $35.00 gas no bid

2 Chassis lube service with fluid check no charge no charge no bid

3 Transmission fluid and filter change service $179.00 and up $135.00-$150.00 no bid

4 Bulb replacement $1.00-$15.00 most bulbs $2.75-$14.99 no bid

5 Wiper blade replacement $7.50 each $9.95 each no labor no bid

6 Coolant flushes and refills $89.00 and up $60.00 no bid

7 Air conditioning systems check up no charge no charge no bid

1 Safety Inspection $7.00 $14.50 $26.75

2 Annual vehicle inspection $18.50 $26.75 no bid

4 Non-Routine Mechanical repairs (Provide hourly rate) $55.00 $60.00 $65.00

5
Provide discount rate on repair parts for non-routine 
repairs. Discounted from vendor printed parts price 20% 20% The price to us, will supply copy of 

their invoice

Recommendation
2/25/2015-EC

Date

Automobiles

NOTE: Lube-Tune has been disqualified due to no Ethics Training.
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