
Bid #15-054

Conducted Electrical Weapons (Tasers), Body Video

 Cameras and Cloud Storage for the Sheriff's Department

Opening Date: Tuesday, December 22, 2015

Digital Ally, Inc

Lenexa, KS

*Meganet 

Corporation 

Las Vegas, NV

Qty Unit Cost
U

n
Unit Cost

Taser (Includes holster and 1 cartridge) 393 No Bid No Bid

Cartridges No Bid No Bid

Body Video Cameras (as specified) 250 $399.00 $99,750.00 $253.00 $63,250.00 $749.99 $187,497.50 Pricing included in storage $299.00

$449,970.00 

Unlimited Storage applies.  

Overstorage Charges $.10 per 

mnth per GB.  Archival storage 

$.05 per month per GB

$2,249,850.00 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$2,249,850.00

Approved By (Signature)

Recommended Vendor

No Bid

No Bid

Approved By (Print) Date

NOTE: *Meganet Corporation has been disqualified because No Code of Ethics Training was provided.

No Bid

ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL $423,997.25 $1,702,995.00

$87,497.25Dock Total $46,395.00

$798,250.00 $848,747.50

No Bid

Docks for the Video Cameras

$529,000.00

Total 5 Year Cost for Cloud Data Storage

Cloud Data Storage $1,799,880.00

$735,000.00 $661,250.00

No Bid

(3 year warranty included) 

Includes unlimited storage for 

videos retained for 60 days or less; 

Includes 20 GB/camera long term 

storage

$147,000.00 $132,250.00

$1,325,280.00$99,500.00 $588,000.00

$336,500.00 $1,556,850.00

Year 4 and 5  $199 x 250 = 

$49,750 x 2 =

Multi Docks 

25x1,499.99=$37,499.75

Deployment Kits

250x199.99=$49,997.50

Dock (Qty 42) $31,395.00

Premium Plus Service $15,000.00 

Optional: Dock Wall Mount 

$1,470.00

Taser International Inc.

Scottsdale, AZ

Point Blank Enterprises

Pompano Beach, FL

Included in cloud subscription

$24.25 No Bid

No Bid

Years 2-4 $331,320.00 x 4 = (Plus archive @ $0.20/GB/Yr)

Millenium Products Inc.

Clarkston, MI

Vievu, LLC

Seattle, WA

No Bid

Unit Cost Unit Cost

Included

Unit Cost

No Bid

Unit Cost

No Bid

No Bid

$237,000.00 $231,570.00

Unlimited Storage 
Cloud Data Storage Annual Cost 1 Year

No Bid


