
Bid #18-042

Printing and Mailing Services for Voter Registration Certificates

 and Address Confirmation Forms for the County of El Paso

Opening: Thursday, Septermber 27, 2018

Price Per

1,000
Total Cost

Price Per

1,000
Total Cost

Price Per

1,000
Total Cost

Price Per

1,000
Total Cost

$52.50 $4,200.00 $94.60 $7,568.00 $69.476 $5,558.08 $240.90 $19,272.00

$27.50 $687.50 $125.00 $3,125.00 $253.4452 $6,336.13 $60.32 $1,508.00

$22,387.50 $25,393.00 $30,031.91 $40,880.00

Approved By (Signature) Approved By (Print)

Recommendation Date BG10/02/2018

No Bid $11,700.00

$14,700.00 $36.27554 $18,137.77 $40.02

$20,000.00 No Bid No Bid $29,780.00

PrintMailPro, LTD

Dallas, TX

Castle Business Solutions

Dallas, TX

Go-Direct Mailing

Services Inc.

El Paso, TX

$20,000.00 No Bid No Bid $18,080.00

No Bid

$17,500.00

QuestMark Information

 Management, Inc.

Houston, TX

Included

ITEM #B

$29.40

Qty. 80,000 Tri-fold cards

with seal tabs

Cost for Printing

Cost for Mailing

TOTAL 

$35.00

QuestMark Information

 Management, Inc.

Houston, TX

PrintMailPro, LTD

Dallas, TX

Castle Business Solutions

Dallas, TX

Go-Direct Mailing

Services Inc.

El Paso, TX

GRAND TOTAL
$42,387.50
(ITEM #A & #B)

$25,393.00
(ITEM #A)

$30,031.91
(ITEM #A)

$70,660.00
(ITEM #A & #B)

Description

Qty. 500,000 Certificates

Pantone 107U (yellow)

Qty, 80,000 Additional Certificates 

Pantone 107U (yellow)

Qty 25,000 Certificates

(office use)

 TOTAL

ITEM #A

$20,100.00


