
Bid 21-002

As-Needed Heating Ventilation and Air Conditioning (HVAC) 

Filters for the County of El Paso

Opening Date:  Thursday, November 5, 2020

Item
HVAC Filters Minimum 

Efficiency Reporting Value 8 
Pleaded w/Wire (each)

Estimated 

Uses

Unit Price 

(Each)

Extended 

Price

Unit Price 

(Each)

Extended 

Price

Unit Price 

(Each)

Extended 

Price

Unit Price 

(Each)

Extended 

Price

1 8 X 10 X 1 48 $4.60 $220.80 $5.35 $256.80 $3.30 $158.40 $6.40 $307.20

2 9.5 x 26.5 x 2 144 $7.38 $1,062.72 $8.58 $1,235.52 $4.35 $626.40 $9.80 $1,411.20

3 10 X 27 X 1 48 $6.75 $324.00 $7.86 $377.28 $4.69 $225.12 $9.32 $447.36

4 12 X 12 X 1 144 $2.40 $345.60 $3.11 $447.84 $2.63 $378.72 $3.17 $456.48

5 12 X 13 X 1 280 $5.11 $1,430.80 $6.35 $1,778.00 $4.00 $1,120.00 $7.57 $2,119.60

6 12 x 12 x 2 16 $2.80 $44.80 $4.88 $78.08 $3.75 $60.00 $4.44 $71.04

7 12 X 14 X 1 24 $5.45 $130.80 $6.35 $152.40 $3.75 $90.00 $7.52 $180.48

8 12 X 16 X 1 436 $4.17 $1,818.12 $6.35 $2,768.60 $3.55 $1,547.80 $10.69 $4,660.84

9 12 X 20 X 1 144 $2.89 $416.16 $3.79 $545.76 $2.72 $391.68 $3.61 $519.84

10 12 X 24 X 2 144 $3.10 $446.40 $3.74 $538.56 $3.00 $432.00 $3.46 $498.24

11 13.5 x 20 x 2 144 $7.38 $1,062.72 $8.60 $1,238.40 $3.10 $446.40 $11.03 $1,588.32

12 14 X 25 X 2 164 $3.64 $596.96 $4.40 $721.60 $3.39 $555.96 $3.86 $633.04

13 15 X 20 X 1 28 $2.92 $81.76 $3.84 $107.52 $3.24 $90.72 $3.73 $104.44

14 15 X 20 X 2 48 $2.88 $138.24 $3.80 $182.40 $3.07 $147.36 $3.50 $168.00

15 16 X 16 X 2 1536 $2.92 $4,485.12 $3.84 $5,898.24 $3.15 $4,838.40 $3.36 $5,160.96

16 16 X 20 X 1 216 $2.84 $613.44 $3.48 $751.68 $2.94 $635.04 $3.21 $693.36

17 16 X 20 X 2 2268 $2.68 $6,078.24 $3.48 $7,892.64 $2.92 $6,622.56 $3.10 $7,030.80

Joe W. Fly Co., Inc.

Austin, TX

** Baker Distributing

El Paso, TX

Ferguson Enterprises 

El Paso, TX

Independent Air Filters 

Lubbock, TX



Bid 21-002

As-Needed Heating Ventilation and Air Conditioning (HVAC) 

Filters for the County of El Paso

Opening Date:  Thursday, November 5, 2020

Item
HVAC Filters Minimum 

Efficiency Reporting Value 8 
Pleaded w/Wire (each)

Estimated 

Uses

Unit Price 

(Each)

Extended 

Price

Unit Price 

(Each)

Extended 

Price

Unit Price 

(Each)

Extended 

Price

Unit Price 

(Each)

Extended 

Price

18 16 X 24 X 2 432 $2.90 $1,252.80 $3.79 $1,637.28 $3.40 $1,468.80 $3.81 $1,645.92

19 16 X 25 X 1 1584 $2.80 $4,435.20 $3.66 $5,797.44 $3.24 $5,132.16 $3.54 $5,607.36

20 16 x 24 x 2 480 $2.90 $1,392.00 $3.81 $1,828.80 $3.40 $1,632.00 $3.81 $1,828.80

21 16 X 25 X 2 2024 $2.61 $5,282.64 $3.42 $6,922.08 $3.28 $6,638.72 $3.46 $7,003.04

22 16 X 30 X 1 40 $5.80 $232.00 $7.54 $301.60 $3.92 $156.80 $5.36 $214.40

23 18 x 20 x 2 24 $3.21 $77.04 $4.19 $100.56 $3.46 $83.04 $3.88 $93.12

24 18 x 24 x 2 2592 $2.90 $7,516.80 $3.80 $9,849.60 $3.59 $9,305.28 $4.15 $10,756.80

25 20 X 20 X 1 516 $2.44 $1,259.04 $3.19 $1,646.04 $3.21 $1,656.36 $3.38 $1,744.08

26 20 X 20 X 2 2632 $2.83 $7,448.56 $3.70 $9,738.40 $3.35 $8,817.20 $3.54 $9,317.28

27 20 X 20 X 4 144 $5.22 $751.68 $6.76 $973.44 $5.32 $766.08 $8.07 $1,162.08

28 20 x 24 x 2 336 $3.21 $1,078.56 $4.19 $1,407.84 $3.74 $1,256.64 $4.33 $1,454.88

29 20 X 25 X 1 304 $2.92 $887.68 $3.84 $1,167.36 $3.53 $1,073.12 $3.94 $1,197.76

30 20 X 25 X 2 1052 $3.34 $3,513.68 $4.38 $4,607.76 $3.72 $3,913.44 $4.04 $4,250.08

31 20 X 25 X 4 1152 $6.03 $6,946.56 $7.77 $8,951.04 $5.96 $6,865.92 $8.92 $10,275.84

32 20 X 30 X 1 8 $2.98 $23.84 $3.90 $31.20 $4.03 $32.24 $5.38 $43.04

33 20 X 30 X 2 96 $4.70 $451.20 $6.16 $591.36 $4.46 $428.16 $5.56 $533.76

34 24 X 24 X 1 40 $3.21 $128.40 $4.18 $167.20 $3.76 $150.40 $5.06 $202.40

Joe W. Fly Co., Inc.

Austin, TX

** Baker Distributing

El Paso, TX

Ferguson Enterprises 

El Paso, TX

Independent Air Filters 

Lubbock, TX



Bid 21-002

As-Needed Heating Ventilation and Air Conditioning (HVAC) 

Filters for the County of El Paso

Opening Date:  Thursday, November 5, 2020

Item
HVAC Filters Minimum 

Efficiency Reporting Value 8 
Pleaded w/Wire (each)

Estimated Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended

35 24 X 24 X 2 1484 $3.53 $5,238.52 $4.61 $6,841.24 $3.91 $5,802.44 $4.56 $6,767.04

36 24 X 24 X 4 216 $6.94 $1,499.04 $9.02 $1,948.32 $6.35 $1,371.60 $9.42 $2,034.72

37 18 X 24 X 2 2592 $2.90 $7,516.80 $3.80 $9,849.60 $3.59 $9,305.28 $4.15 $10,756.80

38 ROLL MEDIA 40 No Bid No Bid $201.12 $8,044.80 $92.00 $3,680.00 $275.00 $11,000.00

Estimated 

Uses

Unit Price 

(Each)

Extended 

Price

Unit Price 

(Each)

Extended 

Price

Unit Price 

(Each)

Extended 

Price

Unit Price 

(Each)

Extended 

Price

39 24 X 24 X 11.5 6 No Bid No Bid $226.78 $1,360.68 $108.00 $648.00 $503.02 $3,018.12

40 24 X 24 X 12 2 No Bid No Bid $226.78 $453.56 $108.00 $216.00 $523.91 $1,047.82

Approved by (Print)

Date BG11/12/2020

Approved By (Signature)

** Disqualified due to not meeting minimun requirements.

HVAC HEPA FILTERS 
Pleaded w/Wire(each)

Independent Air Filters 

Lubbock, TX

Joe W. Fly Co., Inc.

Austin, TX

** Baker Distributing

El Paso, TX

Ferguson Enterprises 

El Paso, TX


