-SINIFWWOO

sdey 1@ SUCIEDOT JO Syualiydeny

Aeptid 11/ 1// papu=ixe

Buiuedo piq ‘11/k2/9 popuLsIXe suonsanb auljpesq ~ 7 WNpUappy 11/22/9
V3 O~ T Wnpusppy 11/22/9
NOSYId 31vQ
SWNANZGavY
11/52/z YANIOV 1IN0 SHINOISSIWINOD NO G30V1d
T1/61/L AINAWLMYAIA WOYS QIAIFDTY 13IHSAYIYCS
T1/11/L INTWLYYdAd OL IN3S 133HSAYIYdS
1102/62/9 11vd ONIN3dO
T10Z/v1/9 JONTYIINOD QIg-Tud
T102/21/9 8 1102/5/9 a3SILMIAQY dig
1102/€/9 AIIVIN STOWVIOVd A9
1102/02/S LINAWLAYAIA WOY4 SNOILYDIHIDAdS A3AIZOFY
1102/L/€ 1HN0D SUINOISSIWWOD A9 TWAQUddY DNINIO Al
31va NOILLdTd053d
B]onzuUs|eA BUBIT  1DVINQD awdoeaad g Buluueld  LNIWLYVdId

GC0-11 49NN AId

SSWOH (6) SUIN JO UONONIISUOIDY J1ULL aId




3.2

Purchasing Department
Bid #11-025, Reconstruction of (9) Homes

Opening Date: Friday, July-1,-2011

Scope of Work Coronado Buildings Co. | ,  Saratoga Homes © . YCS Constructioninc.
Design--Floor plans, foundation ptan, e -
electrical plan, Plumbing plan, HVAC - .
Plan, exteriorfinterior elevations. Plans $2,500.00 $1,176.47 No Bid
may nat be implemented wiout proir
TOHCA approval.
Demolition $2,000.00 $11,764.71 No Bid
Site & Grade $1,500.00 $1,488.24 No Bid
Foundation $5,000.00 $6,160.00 No Bid
Exterior Egrass $1,000.00 $470.59 No Bid
Exterior Walls $11,400.00 $2,327.83 No Bid
Flooring $4,500.00 $2,179.39 No Bid
Partitions Framing $3,500.00 $579.28 No Bid
Ceiling Framing $3,500.00 **$1,429.62 No Bid
* 95.78 fi ]
Roofing Framing & Roofing $3,500.00 $3,895.78 framing $5,771.41 per home
$3,393.45 roofing
Interior Walls $5,500.00 $2,483.34 No Bid
Paint $1,700.00 $2,049.39 No Bid
Interior Doors and Trim $2,500.00 $1,537.09 No Bid
Windows $1,650.00 $814.73 No Bid
Entrances and Exterior $1,150.00 $674.43 No Bid
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Scope of Work Coronado Buildings Co. Saratoga Homes - YCS Constructioninc.
Cabinets and Trim $5,500.00 . $2,855.36 No Bid
Closets $750.00 $2,118.41 No Bid
Heating & Cooling $4,500.00 $4,535.91 No Bid
Plumbing- Bathroom, kitchen,
waterheater, washing machine, $4,500.00 $7,881.95 No Bid
miscelianeous plumbing
Ventilation- Bathroom & Kitchen $750.00 $135.76 No Bid
Electric $4,500.00 $1,734.13 No Bid
Insulation $2,500.00 $1,712.94 No Bid
Hardware $750.00 $184.34 No Bid
Specia Equipment -One Energy '
Star16.6 refrigeratoriwht) One Energy $1,200.00 $2,368.35 No Bid
Star 30" Gas Range {(Wht)
Bath Acessories $250.00 $59.41 No Bid
Fees - Water tap Fees $100.00 $9,473.20 No Bid
Surveys $800.00 $382 35 No Bid
Subtotal $77,000.00 $73,426.44 - G $5,771.41
| Total for (9) Homes $693,000.00 [ $660,837.93 / $51,942.69
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